CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY

MEMORANDUM

TO: Central Florida Expressway Authority Board
FROM:,W Joseph L. Passiatore, General Counsel
DATE: / March 24, 2015

SUBJECT: Settlement Release with National Interstate Insurance Company for
Repairs on S.R. 408 Crash on March 23, 2014

CFX staff has been diligently pursuing a claim against Shelly’s Septic Tank, Inc.
and its insurer National Interstate Insurance Company for repair damages incurred as a
result of a collision on westbound S.R. 408 which destroyed a full span sign truss and
attendant signing and lighting.

The insurer has now agreed to pay 100% of CFX’s claim which totaled
$172,007.82. A check for $164,986.73 (copy attached) has been received and deposited
and an additional check for $7,021.09 is forthcoming (see attached email).

Staff recommends authorization for the Chairman to sign the attached release as
requested by National Interstate.

JLP/ml
Attachments

cc: Ben Dreiling
Michael Carlisle

4974 ORL TOWER RD. ORLANDO, FL 32807 | PHONE: (407) 690-5000 | FAX: (407) 690-5011
WWW.CFX way.com



NATIONAL
%INTERSTATE

March 24, 2015

KNOW ALL BY THESE PRESENT that I, on behalf of Central Florida Expressway Authority for and in
consideration of the sum of one hundred seventy two thousand seven dollars and eighty two cents
(8172,007.82) the receipt whereof is hereby acknowledged, do hereby for my heirs, executors,
administrators, successors, assigns and any and all other persons, firms, employers, corporations,
associations and/or partnerships forever release, acquit and discharge Glanville Angel, Shelley’s Septic
Tanks Inc., AND NATIONAL INTERSTATE INSURANCE COMPANY of actions, demands, rights,
damages, costs expenses, accrued and unaccrued claims for property damages, bodily injury, and loss of
use including lost income on account of or in any way growing out of, any and all known and unknown
damages resulting from the collision loss which occurred on or about March 23, 2014 in Orlando
Florida, referenced by claim number 1164793. [ agree that this release is a compromise of a disputed
claim, wherein all liability is denied.

I have read this release and understand it. I further represent that I am authorized to execute this
release on behalf of Central Florida Expressway Authority.

Welton Cadwell Date
Central Florida Expressway Authority Chairman

ATTEST: Approved as to form and legality
Darleen Mazzillo
Executive Assistant

Joseph L. Passiatore
General Counsel

3250 Interstate Drive « Richfield, Ohio 44286 ¢ Phone (330) 659-8900 « Fax (330) 659-8909
Website: www.nationalinterstate.com



* CHECK NUMBER

NATIONAL INTERSTATE INSURANCE COMPANY 5000306513
o S CHECK DATE 0317115
CENTRAL FL EXPRESSWAY AUTH VENDOR CODE  CENTRAL FL EXPR
4974 ORLANDO TOWER RD CHECK AMOUNT § 164,086.73
ORLANDO, FL 32807
Invoice Date . Invoice No. ' ‘Description Invoice Amt
03/16/15 &PS/01164793/7930676  CLATN ¥ 1164793 ' 164.986.73
| 3/23/2014 - GLANVILL R. ANGEL CRASH/SR 408 WESTBOUND
gb:CInd G, dUH EC

(330) 659-8900

PAY: ONE HUNDRED SIXTY-FOUR THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY-SIX DOLLARS & 73/100

TO THE ORDER OF:
° CENTRAL FL' EXPRESSWAY
4974 ORLANDO TOWER RD
ORLANDO, FL 32807

$***%%¥164,986.73

AUTH ATTN JOE PASSIATORE

Security features included. Eb Details on back. __ Y4

1* 5000306543
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Joe Passiatore
ch

From: Greg P. Steidl <Greg.Steidl@natl.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2015 8:25 AM

To: Joe Passiatore

Subject: RE: Claim#1164793

Attachments: Release.doc

Joe,

We will agree to pay your demand of $7,021.09 which will bring the aggregate total for this claim to $172,007.82. | have
attached the release for your review.

Thanks,

Greg P. Steidl

Claims Adjuster

National Interstate

800-929-1500 x1511

www.natl.com

An insurance experience built around you
> Watch our video
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Company Email Disclaimer: This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual(s) named above. If you are not a named addressee you should not disseminate,
distribute or copy this email. Please notify the sender immediately if you have received this email by mistake and delete this email from your system. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure
or error-free and could be corrupted in transmission and/or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any such errors, corruptions or viruses which occur as a result of this email
transmission. If you need to contact us, our address is: National Interstate, 3250 Interstate Drive, Richfield, OH 44286. Website: www.natl.com

From: Joe Passiatore [mailto:Joe.Passiatore@CFXWay.com]
Sent: Friday, March 20, 2015 10:32 AM

To: Greg P. Steidl

Subject: Claim#1164793

Greg,
The deadline for presenting items to the CFX board for approval at their next meeting is Wednesday March 25,

Can you send me National’s release for this claim by then so | can get it approved at the Board’s April 9" meeting?
Thanks.

Joe Passiatore

---------------------------------------------

Joseph Passiatore
CFX General Counsel

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
4974 ORL Tower Road
Orlando, Florida 32807



(0) 407.690.5000
(d) 407.690-5381
Joe.Passiatore@CFXWay.com

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law (F.S. 119). All e-mails to and from the
Expressway Authority are kept as a public record. Your e-mail communications, including your e-mail
address, may be disclosed to the public and media at any time.



