
  

 
Agenda 

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 
RIGHT-OF-WAY COMMITTEE 

January 25, 2017 
2:00 p.m.  

 
     1.    CALL TO ORDER  
   
     2.  PUBLIC COMMENT  
 Pursuant to Florida Statute 286.0114 (2013) the Right of Way Committee will allow public comment on 

any matter either identified on this meeting agenda as requiring action, or anticipated to come before 
the Committee for action in reasonable proximity to this meeting. Speakers shall be limited to three 
minutes per person and the assignment of one person’s time to another or designation of group 
spokesperson shall be allowed at the discretion of the Committee Chairman. 

 

   
     3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES – December 1, 2016 TAB A 
 Requesting approval of the 12/01/16 minutes.  Action Item.  
   
      4. S.R. 429 (CFX) WESTERN BELTWAY PART C (PROJECT 429-654) PARCELS 

107A AND 107B – A. Kurt Ardaman, City Attorney and Arthur Miller, City Engineer, 
with the City of Winter Garden  

 
TAB B 

 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the request 
from the City of Winter Garden for the acquisition and continuing maintenance of 
property. Action Item. 

 

   
      5. S.R. 429 (DAVIS) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-203) 

PARCELS 197/897 – Jay W. Small, Mateer Harbert    
 

TAB C 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

apportionment settlement. Action Item. 
 

   
      6. S.R. 429 (REID) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-203) PARCEL 

166 – David Shontz, Shutts & Bowen    
 

TAB D 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

Mediated Settlement Agreement. Action Item. 
 

   
      7. S.R. 429 (REID) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-203) PARCEL 

167 – David Shontz, Shutts & Bowen 
 

TAB E 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

Mediated Settlement Agreement.  Action Item. 
 

   
      8. S.R. 429 (RILEY) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-203) PARCEL 

166 – David Shontz, Shutts & Bowen 
 

TAB F 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

Mediated Settlement Agreement.  Action Item. 
 

   
   
 CONTINUED ON PAGE 2  
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      9. S.R. 453 (NEW) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-206) PARCEL 

314 – David Shontz, Shutts & Bowen 
 

TAB G 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

settlement.  Action Item. 
 

   
    10. S.R. 429 (ELLEN S. HARDGROVE AICP PLANNING CONSULTANT, INC.) 

WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-203, 204, 205 AND 206) LAND 
PLANNING SERVICES – David Shontz, Shutts & Bowen 

 
 

TAB H 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

Second Agreement for Land Planning Services.  Action Item. 
 

   
    11. S.R. 429 (SMALLWOOD SIGN COMPANY) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT 

(PROJECT 429-206) PARCEL 330 ODA – Linda Brehmer Lanosa, CFX on behalf 
of Suzanne Driscoll, Shutts & Bowen 

 
 

TAB I 
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

settlement offer.  Action Item. 
 

   
    12. S.R. 429 (ALDERMAN) WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-204) 

PARCEL 241 – Linda Brehmer Lanosa, CFX  
 

TAB J  
 Requesting the Committee’s recommendation for Board approval of the proposed 

settlement offer.  Action Item. 
 

   
    13. OTHER BUSINESS  
   
    14. ADJOURNMENT  

 
 

This meeting is open to the public. 
 

Section 286.0105, Florida Statutes states that if a person decides to appeal any decision made by a board, agency, or commission with respect to any matter 
considered at a meeting or hearing, he or she will need a record of the proceedings, and that, for such purpose, he or she may need to ensure that a verbatim record 
of the proceedings is made, which record includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is to be based. 

 
ln accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA), if any person with a disability as defined by the ADA needs special accommodation to participate in this 
proceeding, then not later than two (2) business days prior to the proceeding, he or she should contact the Central Florida Expressway Authority at 407-690-5000. 

 
Persons who require translation services, which are provided at no cost, should contact CFX at (407) 690-5000 x5317 or by email at lranetta.dennis@CFXway.com 
at least three business days prior to the event. 
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CENTRAL FTORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
MINUTES

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY

Right of Way Committee Meeting
December 1,2016

Location: Pelican Conference Room

Committee Members Present:
Bob Babcock, Orange County Representative Alternate, Committee Chairman
Sandy Minkoff, Lake County Representative
Laurie Botts, City of Orlando Representative
Frank Raymond, Osceola County Representative

Christopher Murvin, Citizen Representative
Neil Newton, Seminole County Representative

Committee Member Not Present:
Brendon Dedekind, Citizen Representative

CFX Staff Present at Dais:

Joseph L. Passiatore, General Counsel
Laura Kelley, Executive Director
Linda S. Brehmer Lanosa, Deputy General Counsel
Mimi Lamaute, Paralegal/Recording Secretary

Item l: CALL T0 ORDER

The meeting was called to order at 10:00 a.m. by Chairman Babcock

Item 2: PUBLIC COMMENT

There was no public comment.

Item 3: APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Action: A motion was made by Mr. Raymond and seconded by Ms. Botts to approve the October
26,2016 Right of Way Committee meeting minutes as presented.

Vote: The motion carried unanimously with six (6) members present and voting AYE by voice vote.
Mr. Dedekind was not present.
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MINUTES

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
RIGHT OF WAY COMMITTEE MEETING
December 1,2016

Item 4: S.R. 414 (CFn MAILAND BOULEVARD EXTENSION PROJECT / PHASE 2 (PROJECT 429-
2(l(}) PARCELaa9A. PART A

Ms, Keeter requested the Committee's recommendation for Board approval for the acceptance of the
Special Warranty Deed from Emerson Point Phase ll, LLC to CFX. Ms. Keeter reminded the Committee of
the specifics of the Marden Road lnterchange Agreement which provided for the construction of a half

diamond interchange to and from the east on S.R. 414 at Marden Road.

The Developer has acquired additional land adjacent to S.R. 414 and would like to donate a portion to CFX.

Action: A motion was made by Mr. Minkoff and seconded by Mr. Murvin to recommend to the
Board approval for acceptance of the Special Warranty Deed from Emerson Point Phase ll, LLC to
CFX.

Vote: The motion carried unanimouslywith six (6) members present and voting AYE by voice vote.
Mr. Dedekind was not present.

Item 5: S.R. 429 ffiORRIS) WEKIVA PARI(WAY PROJECT (PROJECT 429-205ì PARCELS 287 AND
887

Mr. Shontz presented this item on behalf of Mr. Calloway. He is requesting the Committee's
recommendation for Board approval for service of an Offer of Judgment to Kenneth W, Morris and Harvey
Lee Morris (the "Owners") for Parcels 287 and 887 in the amount of $1,442,000.

CFX retained the appraisal services of Christopher D. Starkey and Marti Matonis Hornell of lntegra Realty
Resources. They estimated the total value of the taking at $1,030,000 for Parcel 287 and $3,060 for Parcel
887 for a total of $1,033,060.

The Owners have not, to date, completed or disclosed any expert reports concerning their opinion on the
compensation. The Owners have requested and received court ordered continuances of the previously set
trial dates, This case is currently set on the November 20,2017 trial docket.

The Committee asked questions regarding the location and size of the parcel, and the location of the road

These questions were answered by Mr. Shontz.

Ms. Brehmer Lanosa provided the Committee with the "Status of Recent Offers of Judgment Table,"

attached as Exhibit "4." The Table lists the Parcels Numbers, the Offer of Judgment amounts and replies
received from the property Owners for each Parcel. The Offer of Judgment for ltem 1 , Parcel 168 on the
Table was accepted last night.
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MINUTES

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
RIGHT OF WAY COMMITTEE MEETING
December 1,2016

Discussion ensued regarding the difference in amounts between the appraisal and the Offer of Judgment.

Action: A motion was made by Ms. Botts and seconded by Mr. Murvin to recommend to the Board
approval of the Offer of Judgment in the amount of $1,442,000, plus statutory attorney's fees and
experts' costs in full settlement of all claims for compensation in the acquisition of for Parcels 287
and 887.

Vote: The motion carried unanimously with six (6) members present and voting AYE by voice vote.
Mr. Dedekind was not present.

Item 6: S.R.429 (HMF. LLCI WEKIVA PARKWAY PROJECT PROJECT 429-204) PARCEL 301

Ms. Brehmer Lanosa is requesting the Committee's recommendation for Board approval of a proposed

mediated settlement agreement with HMF, LLC (the "Owners"). CFX's appraisal of the property was
prepared by Chad G. Durrance, MAl, Mr. Durrance in his rebuttal report opined the total value for the land

at $628,700 and severance damages at $100,000 for a total of $728,700.

The Owners retained both Charles W. Haynes, Jr,, GAA, and Richard C. Dreggors, GAA. Mr. Haynes
opined the total value for the land taken and the severance damages at $3,921,500, Mr. Dreggors opined
the total value at of the land and severance damages at $4,819,900. The biggest issue in this case involves
severance damages.

The Committee asked questions, which were answered by Ms. Brehmer Lanosa

Mr. Raymond explained that at Osceola County he is the supervisor of one of the experts hired by the
Owners, He asked whether this created a conflict. Mr. Passiatore responded that the expert does not
qualify as a business associate under the Statute and therefore it is not a conflict.

Action: A motion was made by Mr. Raymond and seconded by Mr. Minkoff to recommend to the
Board approval of the mediated settlement agreement in the amount of $1,845,000 to settle all
pending claims for the taking of Parcel 301, including full compensation for the property, severance
damages, business damages, tort damages, interest, attorney's fees, attorney's costs, expert fees,
expert costs, and any other claim, with the exception of the cost of the deposition transcripts, subject
to apportionment.

Vote: The motion carried unanimously with six (6) members present and voting AYE by voice vote.
Mr. Dedekind was not present.
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MINUTES

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
RIGHT OF WAY COMMITTEE MEETING

December 1, 2016

Item 7: RIGHT 0F WAY LEGAL COUNSEL - RENEWAL OF CONTRACTS

Mr, Passiatore explained that the Winden¡¡eedle Haines, Ward & Woodman, P.A. ("Windenrueedle") and the
Shutts & Bowen, LLP ("Shutts") legal counsel contracts are due to expire on February 27 ,2017 . Staff is

recommending a one year extension to the Shutts contract and a six (6) month extension to the
Winden¡¡eedle contract, both with no additional funding. Shutts has 33 remaining parcels in litigation and

Winden¡¡eedle has L

The Committee asked questions, which were answered by Mr. Passiatore

Action: A motion was made by Ms. Botts and seconded by Mr. Murvin to recommend to the Board
approval of a one year extension to the Shutts & Bowen, LLP Contract No. 000930 until February 28,
2018 and a six month extension to the Winderweedle, Haines, Ward & Woodman, P.A. Contract No.
000427 until August 31,2017 both with no additional funds, to complete the remaining assigned
parcels for the Wekiva Parkway project.

Vote: The motion carried unanimously with six (6) members present and voting AYE by voice vote.
Mr. Dedekind was not present.

Item 8: OTHER BUSINESS

No other business was discussed

Item 9: ADJOURNMENT

Chairman Babcock adjourned the meeting at approximately 10:40 a.m,

Minutes approved on _,2017 .

Pursuantto the Florida Public Records Law and CFX Records Management Policy, audiotapes of all
Board and applicable Commiftee meetings are maintained and available upon requestto the Records
Management Liaison Officer at publicrecords@.CFXWay.con or 4974 ORL Tower Road, Orlando, FL

32807.

Page 4 of 4



STATUS OF RECENT OFFERS OF JUDGMENT

# Parcel Name OJ Amount
Deadline to

Respond
Response

I r68 Simmons $330,000
r2l7l16

(Extended) PendingAccepted

2 179 Watson $302,400
Accepted

a
-t 219 Chapman $1,375,000

t2/14/16
(Served llll4', Pending

4. 24r Alderman 81,239,400 About 12130 Pending

5 242 Everly 597,840 REJECTED

6. 251
American
Finance s205,200 Accepted

7 258 Brown $386,400 Accepted

I 318 Bridges $148,800 Accepted

9 319 Yeomans s207,600 Accepted

10 30r HMF LLC $1,200,000 REJECTED

EXHIBIT A
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RIGHT-OF.\ryAY TRANSFER AND CONTINUING MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT
BETWEEN

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
AND THE CITY OF WINTER GARDEN, FLORIDA

THIS RIGHT-OF-V/AY TRANSFER AND CONTINUING MAINTENANCE
AGREEMENT ("Agreement") is made and entered into on the last date of execution below by and
between the CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY, a body corporate and an
agency of the State of Florida, created by Part III of Chapter 348, Florida Statutes, whose address
is 4974 ORL Tower Road, Orlando, Florida 32807 ("CFX") and the CITY OF WINTER
GARDEN, a charter city and political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address is 300
West Plant Street, V/inter Garden, Florida 34787 ("City"). CFX and City are sometimes
collectively referred to herein as the "Parties."

WITNESSETH:

WHEREAS, pursuant to section 348.753,Florida Statutes, CFX is empowered to construct,
improve, maintain, and operate the Central Florida Expressway System ("Expressway System")
and, in connection therewith, to construct any extensions, additions or improvements to said
system or appurtenant facilities, including all necessary approaches, roads, bridges and avenues of
access; and

V/HEREAS, pursuant to Section 166.021, Florida Statutes, the City is empowered to
provide and maintain arterial and other roads for the benefit of its citizens; and

V/HEREAS, the construction State Road ("S.R.") 429 over County Road ("C.R.") 535 is
completed; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to acquire portions of land ("the Property") from CFX, as

depicted in Exhibit "I' for the widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway (collectively
referred to as "the Project"), which widening will improve the access to or from S.R. 429, subject
to a reservation of rights in favor of CFX; and

WHEREAS, the Property consists of 3 strips of property running along the outer perimeter
of C.R. 535 and 1 strip of property running along the northern side of Stoneybrook West Parkway,
marked as Areas 1,2, 3, and 4 on Exhibit "L" S.R. 429 traverses over Area 2 and Area 3. Areas
1,2,3,and4 consist of 6,248 sq.ft.; 5,292 sq.ft.; 4,958 sq.ft.; and 10, 191 sq. ft., respectively;
and

V/HEREAS, in order to convey the Property to the City, it is necessary to release the limited
access lines described in Exhibits 4B2rD "C2r" and "D2r" and to re-establish the limited access
lines as described in the legal descriptions in Exhibits "BLooo "CLr" and ooDl;oo and

- WHEREAS, the City needs the Property to construct the C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook V/est
Parkway improvements therein and agrees to coordinate with Orange County as needed; and



V/HEREAS, the parties also desire to define the future and continuing maintenance
responsibilities for the right-of-way and related facilities and to set responsibility therefore.

NOV/ THEREFORE, for and in consideration of the mutual agreements herein and other
good and valuable consideration, the receipt, adequacy, and sufficiency of which are hereby
expressly acknowledged, CFX and the City agree as follows:

1. Recital. The above recitals are true and correct and are incorporated herein by
reference

2. Approval of Construction Plans. Prior to any conveyance, the City shall deliver
to CFX a full and complete set of legal descriptions and sketches for the Property for CFX's review
and final approval. Prior to construction, the City shall deliver to CFX a full and complete set of
construction plans for the Project for CFX's review and approval.

3. CFX Conveyance with Restrictions. CFX agrees to transfer and convey to the
City by Quit Claim Deed all of its right, title and interest in and to the real property described in
Exhibits ooÁ.rt' "31r" *Clr)) and ttDltt, subject to the covenants, reservations, conditions, and
restrictions described in the Quit Claim Deeds, which are substantially in the form of Exhibits('Er" .(Fr)) "G," and "Hr'o respectively. In addition, the parties agree that if the City does not
commence construction of the Project by January 2019 or if the City no longer uses the Property
for City right-of-way purposes, then all right, title, and interest to Property shall automatically
revert back to CFX at CFX's option and atno cost to CFX.

4. Citvos Maintenance Responsibilities. The parties agree that it is necessary and
desirable to define with specificity the locations for future and continuing maintenance
responsibility. The City shall be responsible for all property owned by the City, including
improvements thereon that are owned by the City, and the future and continuing maintenance
therefor. CFX shall have the right to place signage within the Property at CFX's cost and at CFX's
option.

5. Time of Convevance. CFX agrees to execute and deliver to the City the Quit Claim
Deeds described in paragraph 3 within 180 days of the Effective Date or CFX's review and final
approval of the legal descriptions and sketches, whichever is later.

6. Recordins. The City agrees to record the Quit Claim Deeds within thirty (30) days
after delivery of the original Quit Claim Deeds to the City at its cost. The City agrees to deliver a
certified copy of the recorded deeds to CFX shortly thereafter.

7. Agreement Not Recorded. This Agreement shall not be recorded in the official
records of any county in the State of Florida. Notwithstanding the foregoing, the parties
acknowledge that this Agreement is and will remain a public record that will be available for
review and inspection by the public.

8. As-Is Convevance. The Property, as described in Exhibits "Ar'o '(Bl)" "Clr" and
"Dl;" is being conveyed "AS IS, WHERE IS, WITH ALL FAULTS," in such condition as the
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same may be on the closing date, without any representations or warranties by the respective owner
as to any condition of the Property, including, without limitation, surface and subsurface
environmental conditions, whether latent or patent. The respective owner makes no guarantee,
warranty or representation, express or implied, as to the quality, character, or condition of the
Property, or any part thereof, or to the fitness ofthe Property, or any part thereof, for any use or
purpose, or any representation as to the nonexistence of any hazardous substances. Neither party
shall have any claim against the other, in law or in equity, based upon the condition of the Property,
or the failure of the Property to meet any standards. In no event shall the respective owner be
liable for any incidental, special, exemplary, or consequential damage. In thè event that any
hazardous substances are discovered on, at or under the Property, neither party shall maintain any
action or assert any claim against the other, its successors and their respective members, employees
and agents arising out of or relating to any such hazardous substances. The provisions of this
Section shall survive the Closing.

The City has read and understands the provisions of this Section and acknowledges and
agrees that except as expressly set forth in this Agreement, it is acquiring the Property ooAS-IS,

WHERE IS AND WITH ALL FAULTS" and that the respective owner has disclaimed herein
any and all warranties, express or implied.

9. Successors and Assisns. This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure to the
benefit ofthe parties hereto and their successors and assigns.

10. Entire Agreement. This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement of the parties
with respect to the subject matter hereof. This Agreement may not be modified or amended except
by an instrument in writing executed by the parties to be bound hereby.

1 1. Effective Date. This Agreement shall be and become effective on the date that it
is signed and executed by the last to sign of CFX and City.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed
in a manner and form sufficient to bind them on the date set forth herein below.

I STGNATURES TO FOLLOV/ ]
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crTY ox'\ryINTER GARDEN, FLORIDA
By: City Commission

BY:
Mayor John Rees

Date:

ATTEST:

City Clerk Kathy Golden, CMC
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6úCFX''

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESS\ryAY
AUTHORITY

ATTEST:

BY
CHAIRMAN BUDDY DYER

Date

Darleen }l4azzillo, Executive Assistant

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND
LEGALITY

General Counsel

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 5 of 2I



EXHIBIT "Bl''

EXHIBIT "B2''

LIST OF EXHIBITS

EXHIBIT "A" LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF AREA 1

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF AREA 2 V/ITH
THE RE-ESTABLISHMENT OF THE LIMITED ACCESS LINE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF THE EXISTING LIMITED ACCESS LINE
ALONG AREA 2 TO BE RELEASED

EXHIBIT "Cl'' LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF AREA 3 V/ITH
THE RE-ESTABLISHMENT OF THE LIMITED ACCESS LINE

EXHIBIT "C2" LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF THE EXISTING LIMITED ACCESS LINE
ALONG AREA 3 TO BE RELEASED

EXHIBIT "Dl" LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF AREA 4 WITH
THE RE-ESTABLISHMENT OF THE LIMITED ACCESS LINE

EXHIBIT "D2'' LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF THE EXISTING LIMITED ACCESS LINE
ALONG AREA 4 TO BE RELEASED

EXHIBIT "E" QUIT CLAIM DEED FOR AREA 1

EXHIBIT "F" QUIT CLAIM DEED FOR AREA 2 WITH
RE-ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITED ACCESS LINE AND
RELEASE OF EXISTING LIMITED ACCESS LINE
PLUS RESERVATION OF EXPRESSWAY BRIDGE EASEMENT

EXHIBIT "G'' QUIT CLAIM DEED FOR AREA 3 WITH
RE-ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITED ACCESS LINE AND
RELEASE OF EXISTING LIMITED ACCESS LINE
PLUS RESERVATION OF EXPRESSWAY BRIDGE EASEMENT

EXHIBIT "H'' QUIT CLAIM DEED FOR AREA 4 V/ITH
RE-ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITED ACCESS LINE AND
RELEASE OF EXISTING LIMITED ACCESS LINE

EXHIBIT "I" SKETCH

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 6 of 2I



FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
ROAD 42 I

URPOSE : RIGHT OF WAY
FEE SIMPLE

A PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

DESCRIPTION :

{ Portion of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Township 23 South, Ronge 27 EosI, Oronge
Counly, Florido, being more porticulorly described os follows:

Cornmence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Township 23
South, Ronge 27 East, Oronge County, Florído; thence South Bg'42'53" West, o distonce of
551.0J feet, olong the South line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the Eost right of
woy |îne of County Rood 5J5 per the Orlondo-Oronge County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy mop Project Number 75320-6460-654; thence North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of
217.39 feet, olong soid Eost right of woy line to the POINT OF BEGINNING; thence continue
North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 484.62 feet, olong soíd Eost right of woy line to o
point on the Southeosterly rtght of woy line of SE Frontoge Rood os shown on soid right of
way mop; thence North 39'44'09" Eost, o dístonce of 16.65 feet, olong soid Southeosterly
right of woy |ine to o point on o line thot is 14.00 feet Eosterly of ond porollel with soid
Eost right of woy line; thence South 17'29'47" Eost, o distonce of 292.69 feet, olong soid
porollel line; thence deporting soid porollel line South l6'10'J0" Eost, o distonce of 172.43
feet; thence South O1'50'43" West, o distonce of 30.26 feet to the POINT OF BEGINNING.

Contoining 6,248 squore feet, more or less

SURVEYOR,S REPORT:

1 Beorings shown hereon ore bosed on
Section 2, Township 23 South, Ronge
89'42'53" West, ossumed.

the South line of the Northwest quorter of
27 East, Oronge County, Florido being South

2. I hereby certify thot the "sketch
true ond correct to the best of
directíon ond thot it meets the
5J-17 requirements.

of Description" of the obove described property is
my knowledge ond belief os recently drown under my

Stondords of Proctice for Lond Surveying Chopter

NOT VALID WIÏHOUT SHIET 2

Description o1 /06/2017 KR

Job Number:
55680 200'

Scole:

l=

Chopter 5,J-17, Florido
Administrotlve Code requires

thot o lcgol description drowing
beor the nototion thot

T}IIS IS NOT A SURVFY. e-mail:

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHTEÏ 1 OF 2
SEE SHEET 2 FOR SKETCH

Ceriificotion Number L82108

SOUTHEASIER}T SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

LAND SURYEYOR Number 4?91

55680004

American Boulevard
32810-4350

PETERSEN

EXHIBIT "A''
Plcs 1 or 2



ENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORIry
TE ROAD 429

RPOSE : R,GHT OF WAY
ESTAÏE : FEE S,MPLE
A PORTON OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

""$?ß"

.1""r
.\\Þ1

{
o(

I4.OO, EASTERLY OF AND PARALLEL
ÏHE EAST RIGHT OF WAY LINE

r{

30.26'

POINÏ OF BEG'NNING

EAST RIGHT OF WAY LINE
POINÏ OF COMMENCEMENT
sE coRNER OF THE NW 1/4
oF sEcTtoN 02-23-27

s89'42'53"W 551.05'
souTH LINE 0F rHE NW 1/4

1" : 2O0'
GRAPHIC

01 2 400' SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6õ00 AII American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-43õ0

(407) 2e2-8580
Certification Number L82108

Drowing No. 55680004
Job No. 55680
Dotet O1/06/2017 THIS IS NOT A SURVEYSHEET 2 OF 2
See Sheet 1 for NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET I THROUGH , e-mail: info@southeasternsurveying.

m
U

AI

EXHJBJT rrA"
P.rcn 2or2



CENÏRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
ROAD 42I

URPOSE : LIM,TED ACCESS RIGHT oF
TE : FEE SIMPLE

PORT'ON OF PROJECT NO
75320-6460-6s4 AND PARCEL NO. 107A

A portion of the Northwest guorter of Section 2, Townshtp 23 South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge
County, Florída, being more portículorly described os follows:

Commence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Townshíp 23
South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florido; thence South 89"42'53" West, o distonce of
708.07 feet, olong the South line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the West right of
woy line of County Rood 5J5 per the Orlondo-Oronge County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy mop Project Number 75320-6460-654; thence olong soid West right of woy line the
following courses ond distonces; thence North 17"29'47" West, o dístonce of 637.51 feet;
thence North 11'46'47" West, o distonce of 130.51 feet to the POINT OF BEGINNING, soid
point being on the Northwesterly Ltmited Access Right of Woy line of SW Frontoge Rood os
shown on soid right of woy mop; thence South 16'48'56" West, o distonce of 18.6J feet,
olong soid Northwesterly Límited Access Right of Woy line to o point on o line thot is 10.50
feet West of ond porollel with West Limited Access Right of Woy line of soid County Rood
NO. 5J5; thence North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 514.53 feet, olong soid porollel line to
o point on the Southeosterly Límrted Access Right of Woy line of NW Frontoge Rood os
shown on soid right of woy mop; thence South 79'24'57" Eost, o distonce of 11.90 feet,
olong soid Southeosterly Limited Access Right of Woy line to o point on soid West Limited
Access Right of Woy |íne; thence South 17'29'47" Eost, o distonce of 493.54 feet, olong
soid West Limited Access Right of Woy líne to the POINT OF BEGINNING.

Reserving oll rights of ingress, egress, light, oir ond view to, from or ocross ony of the
obove described right of woy property which moy otherwise occrue to ony properly odjoiníng
soid right of way.

Contoining 5,292 squore feet, more or less

SURVEYOR,S REPORT:

Beorings shown hereon ore bosed on the South |ine of the Northwest quorter of Section
2, Township 2J South, Ronge 27 East, Oronge County, Florido being South 89"42'53"
West, ossumed.

I hereby certîfy thot the "sketch of Description" of the obove described property is true
ond correct to the best of my knowledge ond belief os recently drown under my
direction ond thot it meets the Stondords of Proctice for Lond Surveying Chopter 5J-17
requirements

1

2

2

Description 01 /06/2O17 KR
lJote:

Job Number:
55680 1" : 200'

Scole:

Chopter 5J-17, Florido
Adminlstrotive Code requlres

thot o legol descriptlon drowing
beor the nototion thot

THIS IS NOT A SURVFI.

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHEET 1 OF 2
SEE SHEET 2 FOR SKETCH

Certificotion Number L82108

6500 AII American Boulevard

Number 4791

55680007

SOUTHEASTERN
AND MAPPING

3?810-43ã0

PETERSEN
LAND SURYEYOR

.L . ii,';I-''::1 .,.,.

EXHIBIT "81"
P¡,cn I on 2



CENÏRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
STAÏE ROAD 429
PURPOSE : LIMITED ACCESS RIGHT OF
ESÏATE : FEE SIMPLE
A PORÏION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-6s4 AND PARCEL NO. 107A

BEGINNING

A
R

POINT OF COMMENCEMENT
sE coRNER 0F THE NW 1/4
oF sEcIloN 02-23-27

s89'42'53"W 7 7'
SOUÏH LINE OF THE NW 1 4

1" = 2OO'
GRAPHI

SOUTHEÄSTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 All American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-4350

(40?) 2e2-S5S0
Certification Number L82108

01 0 400'
Drowing No. 55680007
Job
Dote:

No.
o1

55680
/06/20i7 THIS IS NOT A SURVEYSHEET 2 OF 2

See Sheet 1 for Descri NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET 1 THROUGH , e-mail: info@southeasternsurveying.com

LINE ÏABLT

L|NE # BEARING LENGTH

LI N11"46'47"W 130.51'

L2 s 1 6'48'56"W 1 8.63'
taL¿ s7g',24'57"E 11.90'

EXHIBIT '(BI''
P.rcp 2o¡2



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORIry
STAÏE ROAD 429

URPOSE : LIMITED ACCESS R,GHT OF WA
ïE : RELEASE OF LIMITED ACCESS

A PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO.

DESCRIPTION :

1074

Releose of oll rights of ingress, egress, light,
either side of the following described ltne lying
Section 2, Townshîp 23 South, Ronge 27 Eost,
portículorly described os follows:

oir ond view between the properties lying on
in o portion of the Northwest quorter of
Oronge Counly, Florido, being more

Commence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Township 23
South, Ronge 27 East, Oronge County, Florido; thence South 8g"42'53" West, o distonce of
708.07 feet, olong tle Soy![ line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the West right of
way ltne of County Rood 535 per the Orlondo-Oronge County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy mop Project Number 75320-6460-654: thence olong soid West right of woy line the
following courses ond distonces : North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 637.51 feet; thence
North 11'46'47" West, o distonce of 1J0.51 feet to o point on the Northwesterly Limited
Access Right of Woy line of SW Frontoge Rood os shown on soid right of way 

-mop; 
thence

South 16'48'56" West, o distonce of iB.6J feet, olong soid Northwesterly LimiteO Access
Right of Woy line to the POINT OF BEGINNING; thence North 16'48'56" Eost, o distonce of
18.6J feet, olong soid Northwesterly Limited Access Right of Woy lîne to o point on the West
Limited Access Right of Woy líne of soid County Rood No. 5J5; thence North 17'2g'47" West,o distonce of 493.54 feet, olong soid West Limited Access Right of Woy tine to o point on
the Southeosterly Limited Access Right of Woy line of NW Frontoge Rood os shown on soid
right of way mop; thence North 79"24'57" West, o distonce of 11.90 feet, olong soid
Southeosterly Límíted Access Right of Woy |ine to the POINT OF TIRMINUS.

Releose of limíted occess rights olong o line without oreo.

SURVEYOR,S REPORT:

Beorings shown hereon
2, Township 2J South,
West, ossumed.

ore bosed on the south line of ihe Northwest quorter of Section
Ronge 27 last, Oronge County, Florido being South Bg'42'53"

2. I hereby certîfy ihot the "sketch
and correct to the best of my
direction ond thot it meets the
requirements.

of Description" of the obove described property is true
knowledge ond belíef os recently drown under my
Stondords of Proctice for Lond Surveyîng Chopter SJ-17

LID WITHOUT SH

Description DÕte:

o1/06/2017 KR

Job Number:
55680

Scole:

1" : 20O'

Chopter 5J-17, Florido
Admínistrotíve Code requires

thot o legol description drowíng
beor the nototion thot

THIS IS NOT A SURVEY.

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHEET 1 OF 2
SEE SHEET 2 FOR SKETCH

Certificotion Number L82108

SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 All American Boulevard

LAND SURYEYOR Numbe¡ 4791

55680008

PETERSEN

32810-4350
292-

EXHIBIT "82"
P¡,cn lop2



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
STATE ROAD 429

URPOSE : LIM,TED ACCESS R,GHT OF WA
RELEASE oF LIM IÏED ACCESS

PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
5320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 107A

BEG'NNING

R

POINT OF COMMENCEMENT
sE coRNrR oF THE NW 1/4
oF sEcTloN 02-23-27

s89'42'53"W
SOUTH LINE OF TH N 4

1" = 2OO'
GRAPH

SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6600 AII American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-4350

(407) 292-8580

01 0 2 U 400'
Drowing No. 55680008
Job No. 55680
Dolet O1 /06/2017
SHEET 2 OF 2
See Sheet 1 for Desc

THIS lS NOT A SURVEY. Certification Number LBZ1oB

NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET 1 THROUGH 
' 

e-mail: info@southeasternsurveving.

LINE TABLE

L|NE # BEARING LENGTH

L1 N11'46'47"W 130.51'

L2 N16'48'56"E 18.63'

L5 N79'24'57"W 11 .90'

on

EXHIBIT "82"
P¡,cn 2op2



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
STATE ROAD 429

URPOSE : L,MITED ACCESS R,GHT OF WA
FEE SI MPLE

PORÏON OF PROJECT NO.
5320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

DESCRIPTON :

A portion of ihe Northwest quorter of Section 2, Township 23 South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge
County, Florido, being more portîculorly described os follows:

Commence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Townshrp 23
South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florido; thence South Bg'42'53" West, o distonce of
551.0J feet, olong the South line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the Eost right of
woy line of County Rood 535 per the Orlondo-Orange County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy map Project Number 75320-6460-654; thence olong soid Eost right of woy line the
followîng courses ond distonces : North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 702.01 feet; thence
North 22'07'25" West, o distonce of 161.35 feet to the POINT OF BEGINNING, soid point
being on the Eost Limited Access Right of Way line of soid County Rood No. 5J5; thence
continue olong soid Eost Limited Access Right of Woy line North 17'29'47" West, o distonce
of 464.38 feet to o point on the Southeosterly Lîmiled Access Right of Woy líne of NE
Frontoge Rood os shown on soid rîghl of woy map; thence North 10'J5'05" fost, o distonce
of 22.02 feet, olong soid Southeosterly Limited Access Right of Woy |ine to o point on o
line thot is 10.37 feet Eosterly of ond porollel with soid Eost Limited Access Right of Woy
line; thence South 17"29'47" Eost, o distonce of 492.15 feet, olong soid porollel line io o
point on the Northwesterly Limited Access Right of Way líne of SE Frontoge Rood os shown
on soid right of woy mop; thence North 68"40'28" West, o distonce of 13.31 feet, olong
soid Northwesterly Limited Access Right of Woy líne of SE Frontoge Rood to the POINT OF
BEGINNING.

Reserving oll ríghts of ingress, egress,
obove described right of woy property
soid right of woy.

2. I hereby certîfy thot the "Sketch
true ond correct to the best of
direction ond thot it meets the
5J-17 requírements.

oir ond view to, trom
may otherwise occrue

or ocross ony of the
to ony property odjoining

lid:,
h

ht,
ich

Contoining 4,958 squore feet, more or less

SURVEYOR,S REPORT:

Beorings shown hereon ore bosed on the South line of the Northwest quorter of
Section 2, Township 23 South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florído being South
89"42'53" West, ossumed.

of Description" of the obove described property is
my knowledge ond belief os recently drown under my

Stondords of Proctice for Lond Surveyíng Chopter
NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET 2

Description Dote
01/11/2017 KR

b

55680
Scole:

1" = 2O0'

Chopter 5J-17, Florido
Administrotlve Code requlres

thot o legol descrlption drowing
beor the nototion thot

THIS IS NOT A SURVFT.

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHEET 1 OF 2
SEE SHEET 2 FOR SKETCH

Certificotion Number LB2'1 08

SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 Atl American Boulevard

55680005

LAND SURVEYOR Number

32810-4350
-8580

EXHIBIT '(CI"
P¡,cn 1or2



CENÏRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
STATE ROAD 429
PURPOSE : L,M,TED ACCESS RIGHT OF
ESÏATE : FEE S,MPLE
A PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

^(

L2

u
c0.

F,)
L3

POINT O
BEGINNING

'fl
9-e

z-Å"^
z.ü?.'
q3+^

o(

LEGEND

L1 LINE NUMBER

1 Fd
J
N)o 1" = 2OO'

GRAPHI

01 400
-o

?90

PO'NÏ OF COMMENCEMENT
sE coRNER OF THE NW 1/4
oF sEcTtoN 02-23-27

s89'42'53"W 551.03'
sourH LINE oF THE NW 1/4

Drowing No. 5568O005
Job No. 55680
Dole: O1/11/2017
SHEET 2 OF 2
See Sheet I for Description

SOUTHEASTERN SURVENNG
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 All American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-4350

(407) 2e2-8580
THIS lS NOT A SURVEY. Certification Number LB210B

NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET 1 THROUGH , e-mail: info@southeasternsurveying.com

LINE TABLE

L|NE # BEARING LENGÏH

L1 N22'07'25"W 161 .J5'

L2 N 10'J5'05"E 22.02'
tz N68'40'28"W 13.31'

EXHIBIT (CI"
Prcr 2or2



ENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHOR'TY
ROAD 429

URPOSE : LlMlïED ACCESS RIGHT OF WAY
: RELEASE OF LIMITED ACCESS

HTS
PORT'ON OF PROJECÏ NO.

0-6460-6s4 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

DESCRIPTION :

Releose of oll rights of ingress, egress, light, oir ond view between the properties lying on
either side of the following described line lyíng în o portion of the Northwest quorter of
Section 2, Township 23 South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florido, being more
porticulorly described os follows:

Commence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Townshíp 23
South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florido; thence South Bg'42'53" West, o distonce of
551.0J feet, olong the South line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the Eost right of
woy |îne of County Rood 535 per the Orlondo-Orange County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy mop Project Number 75320-6460-654; thence olong soid fost right of woy line the
following courses ond distonces : North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 702.01 feet; thence
North 22"07'25" West, o distonce of 161.35 feet to o point on the Northwesterly Limited
Access Right of Woy |ine of SE Frontoge Rood os shown on soid right of way map; thence
South 68'40'28" Eost, o distonce of 13.48 feet, olong soid Northwesterly Limited Access
Right of Woy line of SE Frontoge Rood to the POINT OF BEGINNING; thence North 6840'28"
West, o distonce of 13.31 feet, olong soid Northwesterly Limited occess Right of woy line to
o point on the Eost Limited Access Right of Woy line of soid County Rood No. 555; thence
North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 464.38 feet, olong soid Eost limited Access Right of
Woy line to o point on the Southeosterly Limited Access Right of Woy line of NE Frontoge
Rood os shown on soid right of woy mop; thence N 10'35'05" Eost, o distonce of 22.02
feet, olong soid Southeosterly Lîmited Access Right of Woy line to the POINT OF TERMINUS.

Releose of limited occess rights olong o line without oreo

SURVEYOR,S REPORT:

1 . Beorings shown hereon ere bosed on the South line of the Northwest quorter of
Section 2, Townshíp 23 South, Ronge 27 East, Oronge County, Florido being South
89'42'53" West, ossumed.

2. I hereby certtfy thot the "sketch of Description" of the obove described property is
true ond correct to the best of my knowledge ond belíef os recently drown under my
direction ond thot it meets the Siondords of Proctice for Lond Surveying Chopter
5J-17 requirements. Nor vALtD wtïHour 

'HEIT 
2

Description 01/11/2017 KR
Dote:

Job Number:
55680

Scole

1" = 2O0'

Chopter 5J-17, Florido
Administrotive Code requires

thot o legol description drowing
bcor tho nototion thot

THIS IS NOT A SUFII/EY.

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHEET 1 OF 2
SIE SHEEÏ 2 FOR SKETCH

Certificotion Number LB21 08

SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 Atl American Boulevard

55680006

LAND SURVEYOR Number

32810-4350

EXHIBIT "C2"
Plcn I or 2



CENÏRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
STATE ROAD 429

RPOSE : LIMITED ACCESS RIGHT OF WA
: RELEASE OF LIMITED ACCESS

IGHÏS
A PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078
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tz
POt NT OF

NUSTERMI

z
--\

Þ,
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PO'NT OF
BEGI NN

L i LINE NUMBER R
2 1" = 2O0'

GRAPHI

0 1 2 400'

Drowing No. 55680006

SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 All American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-43õ0

(40?) 2e2-8õ80
THIS lS NOT A SURVEY. Certification Number LBZ108

NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET 1 THROUGH , e-mait: info@southeasternsurveying.com

Job No.
Dote:01
SHETT 2

55680
/1 1 /2017
oF2

LINE TABLE

LINE # BEARING LENGTH

L1 N2z07'25"W 161.35'

L2 N68'40'28"W 13.31'

LJ N r 0'J5'05"E 22.02'

See Sheet 1 for Description

EXHIBIT 3(C2"

Prcn 2op2



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY
STATE ROAD 429
PURPOSE : LIMITED ACCESS RIGHT OF
ESTAÏE : FEE S,MPLE
A PORÏ'ON OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

DESCRIPÏION :

A poriion of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Townshíp 2J South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge
County, Florido, betng more porticulorly described os follows:

Commence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Township 23
South, Ronge 27 Lost, Oronge County, Florido; thence South 89"42'53" West, o distonce of
551.03 feet, olong the South line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the Eost right of
woy líne of County Rood 535 per the Orlondo-Oronge County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy mop Project Number 75320-6460-654; thence olong soid Eost right of woy line the
following courses ond distonces : North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 702.01 feet; thence
North 2207'25" West, o distonce of 161.35 feet to o point on the Northwesterly Limited
Access Right of Way line of SE Frontoge Rood os shown on soid right of woy mop; thence
South 68'40'28" East, o distonce of 46.51 feet olong soid Northwesterly Limited Access Right
of Woy line to the POINT OF BEGINNING; soid point olso being on o non tongent curve
concove Northwesterly hovíng o rodius of 3263.00 feet, o centrol ongle of 11'00'09" ond o
chord beoring of North 53'01'52" Eost; thence from o tongeni beoring of North sB'J1'56"
fost, Northeosterly, o distonce of 626.59 feet olong the orc of soid curve; thence South
43'03'20" Eost, o distonce of 15.00 feet to o poÍnt on soid Limited Access Right of Woy
line, soid point olso being on o non-tongent curve concove Northwesterly, hoving o rodius
of 2254.87 feet, o centrol ongle of 02'26'21" ond o chord beoring of South 44'58'36" West;
thence from o tongent beoring South 43'45'25" West, Southwesterly, o distonce of 96.00
feet olong the orc of soid curve ond olong soid Limited Access Right of Woy lîne io o point
on o non-tongent curve concove Northwesterly, hoving o rodius of 2266.8J feet, o centrol
ongle of 04'57'10" ond o chord beoring of South 51'50'55" West; thence from o tongent

Continued on Sheet 2

I Beorings shown hereon ore bosed on
Section 2, Township 23 South, Ronge
89"42'53" West, ossumed.

the South line of the Northwest
27 East, Oronge County, Florido

quorter of
being South

2 I hereby certrfy thot the "sketch of Description" of the obove described property is
true ond correct to the best of my knowledge ond belíef os recently drown under my
direction ond thot it meets the Stondords of Proctice for Lond Surveying Chopter
5J-17 requirements' Nor vALrD wrrHour SHEETS 2 & s

Description o1/06/2017 KR

Job Number:
55680

Scole

1" : 2OO'

.Chopter 5J-17, Florido
Administrotive Code requires

thot o legol description drowing
bcor the nototion thot

THIS IS NOT A SUFVEY.

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHEET 1 OF 3
SEE SHEEÏ J FOR SKETCH

Certificotion Number t-82108

6500 Atl A¡nericân Boulevard

],AND SURVEYOR

55680009

47gt

AND MAPPING

38810-4350
29?-8õ80

EXHIBIT úTDl''

Plcr I or 3



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORIry
STATE ROAD 429
PURPOSE : LIMITED ACCESS RIGHT OF
ESTATE : FEE SIMPLE
A PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

DESCRIPÏION CONÏINUED FROM SHEET 1 :

beorìng South 49'22'20" West, Southwesterly, o distonce of 195.95 feet olong the orc of
soid curve ond olong soid Limited Access Right of Way line to o point on o non-tongent
curve concove Norihwesterly, hoving o rodius of 4558.66 feet, o centrol ongle of 0408'04"
ond o chord beoring of South 56'24'55" West; thence from o tongent beoring South
54'20'53" West, Southwesterly, a distonce of 328.94 feet olong the orc of soid curve ond
olong soid Limited Access Right of Woy line; thence North 68"40'28" West, o distonce of
15.28 feet, olong soid Limited Access Right of Woy line, to the POINT OF BEGINNING.

Reserving oll rights of íngress, egress, light, oir ond view to, from or ocross ony of the
obove described ríghl of woy property which moy otherwise occrue to ony property odjoining
soid right of way.

Contoining 10,191 squore feet, more or less

1" = 200'
GRAPHIC SCALE

SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 All American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-4350

(407) 2e2-8ös0
Certification Number L82108

e-mail: info@southeasternsurveying.com

Drowing No. 55680009 o 100' 400'
Job No. 55680
Ðole: 01/06/2017
SHEET 2 OF 3 THIS IS NOT A SURVEY.

NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEETS 1 AND 3See Sheet 1 for Description

EXHIBIT $DI"
P¿.cn 2 or3



STATE RAAD 429
PURPOSE : LIM,TED ACCESS RIGHT OF
ESÏAÏE : FEE SIMPLE
A PORÏON OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

//

BEG' NN ING

R
NE NUMBER

þ URVE NUMBER
NT : NON TANGENT

-t PO'NT OF COMMENCEMENT
sE coRNER OF THE NW 1/4
oF sEcTloN 02-23-27

v,

souÏH LINE OF rHE NW 1/4
s89'42'53"W 551.03'

1" : 2O0' SOUTHE.ASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6500 Atl American Boulevard
O¡lando, Florida 32810-4350

(40?) 2e2-8580
Drowing No. 55680009 01 200 400'
Job No. 55680
Dole O1/06/2017 THIS lS NOT A SURVEY. Certification Number LBZ1oB

NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEETS 1 AND , e-mait info@southeasternsurveying.SHEET J OF 3

CURVE TABLE

cuRvE # RADIUS DELÏA LENGTH
CHORD

BEARING
CHORD

DISTANCE

c1 3263.00' 1 1'00'09" 626.59' N53'01'52"E 625.63'

c2 2254.87' 0226'21" 96.00' s44'58'36"W oÃ oo'

CJ 2266.83' 04'57'10" 195.95' s5'l'50'55"W 195.89'

C4 4558.66' 04"08'04" 328.94' s56'24'5s"W 328.87'

LINE TABLE

LINE # BEARiNG LENGTH

L1 N2z07'25"W 1 61 .J5'

L2 s68'40'28"E 46.51'

L3 s43'03'20"E 15.00'

L4 N68'40'28"W 15.28'

See Sheet 1 for Description

EXHIBIT TTDI''

P¡.cn 3 or 3



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORIry
STATE ROAD 429
PURPOSE : LIM,TED ACCESS RIGHT OF WAY
ESïATE : RELEASE oF LIMITED ACCESS
RIGHÏS
A PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
75320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078
DESCRIPTION :

Releose of oll rights of ingress, egress, light,
either side of the following described ltne lying
Section 2, Township 2J South, Ronge 27 Eost,
particulorly described os follows:

oir ond view between the properties lying on
in o portion of the Northwest quorter of
Oronge County, Florido, being more

Commence of the Southeost corner of the Northwest quorter of Section 2, Township 23
South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florido; thence Souih 89"42'53" West, o distonce of
551.0J feet, olong the South line of soid Northwest quorter to o point on the Eost right of
woy line of Counly Rood 5J5 per the Orlondo-Oronge County Expresswoy Authority right of
woy map Project Number 75320-6460-654; thence olong soid Eost right of woy line the
following courses ond distonces ; North 17'29'47" West, o distonce of 702.01 feet; thence
North 22'07'25" West, o distonce of 161.35 feet to o point on the Northwesterly Limited
Access Right of Woy lîne of SE Frontoge Rood os shown on soid nght of woy mop; thence
South 68"40'28" Eost, o distonce of 61.79 feet olong soid Northwesterly Limited Access Right
of Way line to the POINT OF BEGINNING; soid point olso being on o non tongent curve
concove Northwesterly hoving o rodius of 4558.66 feet, o centrol ongle of 04'08'04" ond o
chord beoring of North 56'24'55" Eost; thence olong soid Limited Access Right of Way lîne,
from o tongent beoring of North 58'28'57" Eost, Northeosterly, o distonce of 328.94 feet,
olong the orc of soid curve to o point on o non tongent curve concove Northwesterly havíng
o rodius of 2266.8J feet, o centrol ongle of 04"57'10" and o chord beoring of North
51'50'55" Eost; thence olong soid Limited Access Right of Woy line, from o tongent becring
of North 54'19'J0" Eost, Northeosterly, o distonce of 195.95 feet, olong the orc of soid
curve to o point on o non tongent curve concove Northwesterly hovíng o rodius of 2254.87
feet, o centrol ongle of 02'26'21" ond o chord beoring of North 44'58'36" Eost: thence
olong soid Limited Access Right of Way line, from o iongent beoring of North 46"11'47"
Eost, Northeosterly, o dístonce of 96.00 feet, olong the orc of soid curve to the POINT OF
TERMINUS.
Releose of limited occess rights olong o line without oreo.
SURVEYOR,S REPORT:

1. Beorings shown hereon ore bosed on the South line of the Northwest quorter of Section
2, Townshíp 23 South, Ronge 27 Eost, Oronge County, Florido beíng South 89'42'53"
West, ossumed.

2. I hereby certify thot the "sketch of Description" of the obove described property is true
ond correct to the best of my knowledge ond belief os recently drown under my
direction ond thot it meets the Stondords of Proctice for Lond Surveying Chopter 5J-17
requirements. NOT VALID WITHOUT SHEET 2

Description 01 /06/2017 KR

55680
Job Scole;

1" : 20O'

Chopter 5J-17, Florido
Administrotlve Code requlres

thot o legol descrlption drowing
beor the nototion thot

THIS IS NOT A SURI/EY. e-maill

FOR

Central Florida
Expressway Authority

SHEET 1 OF 2
SEE SHEET 2 FOR SKETCH

Certifìcotion Number LB21OB

SOUTHE.ASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

LAND SURVEYOR Number 4?91

5568001 1

American Boulevard
3281

PETERSEN

EXHIBIT (D2)'

P.rcn I or 2



CENÏRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHOR'TY
STAÏE ROAD 429
PURPOSE : LIMITED ACCESS RIGHT OF WA

ESÏAÏE : RELEASE OF LIMITED ACCESS
,GHTS

PORTION OF PROJECT NO.
5320-6460-654 AND PARCEL NO. 1078

FC

1" : 2oo' SOUTHEASTERN SURVEYING
AND MAPPING CORPORATION

6600 Alt American Boulevard
Orlando, Florida 32810-4350

(40?) 2e2-8580
Certification Number L82108

GRAPHIC

Drowing No. 5568001 1 01 2 400
Job No. 5568O
Dote: O1/06/2017
SHEET 2 OF 2

THIS IS NOT A SURVEY.
NOT VALID WIÏHOUT SHEET 1 THROUGH 2

LINE TABLE

LrNE # BEARING LENGTH

L1 N2Z07'25"W 161 .35'

L2 s68',40'28"E 61.79'

CURVT TABLE

cuRvE # RADIUS DELÏA LENGTH
CHORD

BEARING
CHORD

DISTANCE

C1 4558.66' 04"08'04" 328.94' N56'24'55"E 328.87'

C2 2266.83' 04'57'1 0" 195.95' N51'50'55"E 195.89'

C3 2254.87' 02'26'21" 96.00' N44'58'J6"E 95.99'

See Sheet I for Description
e-mail:

EXHIBIT 4D2"

P¡.cn 2op2



EXHIBIT NOE''

Prepared By:
Linda S. Brehmer Lanosa, Deputy General Counsel
Central Florida Expressway Authority
4974 ORL Tower Road
Orlando, FL 32807

Reserved for

Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

This deed is exempt from Florida documentary stamp tax under Department of Revenue Rules
l2B-4.002(4)(a),128-4.014(10), F.A.C., and Section 201.02(6), Florida Statutes.

QUIT CLAIM DEED

THIS QUIT CLAIM DEED, made and executed on the _day of _, 2017, by
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSV/AY AUTHORITY, a body corporate and an agency of the
State of Florida, created by Part III of Chapter 348, Florida Statutes, whose address is 4974 ORL
Tower Road, orlando, Florida 32807 ("GRANTOR") and CITY oF WINTER GARDEN, a
charter city and political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address is 300 'West 

Plant
Street, Winter Garden, Florida 34787 ("GRANTEE").

V/ITNESSETH: That the GRANTOR, for and in consideration of the sum of $10.00 and
other valuable considerations, the receipt of whereof is hereby acknowledged, does hereby remise,
release, and forever quit-claim unto the said GRANTEE, all the right, title, interest, claim, and
demand which the GRANTOR has in and to the following described lots, pieces, or parcels of
land, situate, lying and being in the county of Orange, state of Florida, hereinafter o'the Property,"
to-wit:

SE,E, ATTACHET) COMPOSITE EXHIBIT "A''

Property Appraiser's Parcel ldentifïcation Number:
Not Assigned

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same together with all and singular the appurtenances
thereunto belonging or in anywise appertaining and all the estate, right, title, interest, lien, equity,

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 7 of 2I



Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

and claim whatsoever of the GRANTOR, either in law or equity, for the proper use, benefit, and
behoove of the GRANTEE forever.

SUBJECT TO the covenants, conditions and restrictions which are set forth below:

a) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all rights of ingress, egress,
light, air, and view to, from, or across any State Ptoad 429 right-of-way property which
may otherwise accrue to any property adjoining said right of way.

b) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, for the use and benefit of
the public, a right and easement for signs and related structures and facilities, which
right and easement includes the right to construct, operate, improve, expand, maintain,
repair and replace from time to time.

c) GRANTEE expressly agrees for itself and its successors and assigns, to refrain from
any use of the hereinafter described real property which would interfere with the
Expressway System, or otherwise constitute ahazard for the Expressway System.

d) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE does not commence construction for the widening of
C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook V/est Parkway by January 2019, then all right, title, and
interest to the Property shall immediately revert to and vest in the GRANTOR
herein, its successors or assigns, and the conveyance hereunder shall be null and
void, and GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate
possession of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or
omission upon the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be
a waiver of the operation or enforcement of such condition.

e) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE no longer uses the Property, or any part thereof, for right-
of-way pu{poses, then all right, title, and interest to the Property, shall immediatety
revert to and vest in the GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, and
GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate possession
of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or omission upon
the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be a waiver of the
operation or enforcement of such condition. GRANTOR retains the right to
refuse to accept the Property, or any part thereof by providing notice, in writing,
to the GRANTEE.

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 8 of 21



Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the said GRANTOR has caused these presents to be signed in
its name by its duly authorized representative.

Signed, sealed, and delivered
in the presence of:

(,cFx"
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY
AUTHORITY

First Witness:
BY

CHAIRMAN BUDDY DYER
V/itness

Date

Print Name

Second Witness:

V/itness

PrintName

(Signature of TV/O witnesses required by
Florida law)

ATTEST:
Darleen i|l4azzillo,
Executive Assistant

STATE OF FLORIDA
COLINTY OF

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this _ day of

)
)

2017,
by BUDDY DYER, as Chairman of the Central Florida Expressway Authority

NOTARY PUBLIC

Signature
Signature of Notary Public - State of Florida

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary Public

Personally Known [ ] OR Produced Identification [ ], Type:_

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 9 of 2l



EXHIBIT "F"

Prepared By:
Linda S. Brehmer Lanosa, Deputy General Counsel
Central Florida Expressway Authority
4974 ORI- Tower Road
Orlando, FL 32807

Reserved for

Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

This deed is exempt from Florida documentary stamp tax under Department of Revenue Rules
l2B-4.002(4)(a),128-4.014(10), F.A.C., and Section 201.02(6), Florida Statutes.

QUIT CLAIM DEED

THIS QUIT CLAIM DEED, made and executed on the day of _, 2017, by
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSV/AY AUTHORITY, a body corporate and an agency of the
State of Florida, created by Part III of Chapter 348, Florida Statutes, whose address is 4974 ORL
Tower Road, orlando, Florida 32807 ("GRANTOR") and CITY oF V/INTER GARDEN, a
charter city and political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address is 300 West Plant
Street, Winter Garden, Florida 34787 ("GRANTEE").

WITNESSETH: That the GRANTOR, for and in consideration of the sum of $10.00 and
other valuable considerations, the receipt of whereof is hereby acknowledged, does hereby remise,
release, and forever quit-claim unto the said GRANTEE, all the right, title, interest, claim, and
demand which the GRANTOR has in and to the following described lots, pieces, or parcels of
land, situate, lying and being in the county of Orange, state of Florida, hereinafter "the Property,"
to-wit:

SEE ATTACHED COMPOSITE EXHIBIT "BI"

Property Appraiser's Parcel ldentification Number:
Not Assigned

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same together with all and singular the appurtenances
thereunto belonging or in anywise appertaining and all the estate, right, title, interest, lien, equity,

Right of Way.Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page l0 of 2l



Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

and claim whatsoever of the GRANTOR, either in law or equity, for the proper use, benefit, and
behoove of the GRANTEE forever.

SUBJECT TO the covenants, conditions and restrictions which are set forth below:

a) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all rights of ingress, egress,
light, air, and view to, from, or across any State Ftoad 429 right-of-way property which
may otherwise accrue to any property adjoining said right of way.

b) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, the re-established limited-
access rights of ingress, egress, light, air, and view to, from, or across the Property as
described in Exhibit "Bl' and the limited access line described in Exhibit "82" shall
be and is released.

c) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all rights and privileges and
easement associated with the operation, maintenance, expansion, or removal of S.R.
429 facillties over C.R. 535 (hereinafter ooExpressway Bridges"), including the right to
access, install, construct, use, operate, maintain, alter, improve, repair, replace, renew,
expand, and remove the Expressway Bridges under, through, across, and over the
Property described in Exhibit $B1."

d) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, for the use and benefit of
the public, a right and easement for signs and related structures and facilities, which
right and easement includes the right to construct, operate, improve, expand, maintain,
repair and replace from time to time.

e) GRANTEE expressly agrees for itself and its successors and assigns, to refrain from
any use of the hereinafter described real property which would interfere with the
Expressway System, or otherwise constitute ahazard for the Expressway System.

Ð GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE does not commence construction for the widening of
C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook'West Parkway by January 2019, then all right, title, and
interest to the Property shall immediately revert to and vest in the GRANTOR
herein, its successors or assigns, and the conveyance hereunder shall be null and
void, and GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate
possession of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or
omission upon the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be
a waiver of the operation or enforcement of such condition.

g) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE no longêr uses the Property, or any part thereof, for right-
of-way pu{poses, then all right, title, and interest to the Property, shall immediatety

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page ll of 2l



Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

revert to and vest in the GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, and
GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate possession
of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or omission upon
the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be a waiver of the
operation or enforcement of such condition. GRANTOR retains the right to
refuse to accept the Property, or any part thereof, by providing notice, in writing,
to the GRANTEE.

IN V/ITNESS WHEREOF, the said GRANTOR has caused these presents to be signed in
its name by its duly authorized representative.

Signed, sealed, and delivered
in the presence of:

"cFxrt
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY
AUTHORITY

First Witness:
BY

CHAIRMAN BUDDY DYER
V/itness

Date:

PrintName

Second \ilitness:

Witness

PrintName

(Signature of TV/O witnesses required by
Florida law)

ATTEST:
Darleen i|l4azzillo,
Executive Assistant

STATE OF FLORIDA
COLINTY OF

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this _ day of
by BUDDY DYER, as Chairman of the Central Florida Expressway Authority.

)
)

Right of V/ay Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 12 of 2l
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NOTARY PUBLIC

Signature
Signature of Notary Public - State of Florida

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary Public

Personally Known [ ] OR Produced Identification [ ], Type:_

Right of V/ay Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 13 of 2l



EXHIBIT'6GÐ

Prepared By:
Linda S. Brehmer Lanosa, Deputy General Counsel
Central Florida Expressway Authority
4974 OP.L Tower Road
Orlando, FL 32807

Reserved for

Project: V/idening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook V/est Parkway

This deed is exempt from Florida documentary stamp tax under Department of Revenue Rules
l2B-4.002(4)(a),128-4.014(10), F.A.C., and Section 201.02(6), Florida Statutes.

QUIT CLAIM DEED

THIS QUIT CLAIM DEED, made and executed on the _day of _,2017, by
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSV/AY AUTHORITY, a body corporate and an agency of the
State of Florida, created by Part III of Chapter 348, Florida Statutes, whose address is 4974 ORL
Tower Road, orlando, Florida 32807 ("GRANTOR") and CITY oF WINTER GARDEN, a
charter city and political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address is 300 West Plant
Street, Winter Garden, Florida 34787 ("GRANTEE").

V/ITNESSETH: That the GRANTOR, for and in consideration of the sum of $10.00 and
other valuable considerations, the receipt of whereof is hereby acknowledged, does hereby remise,
release, and forever quit-claim unto the said GRANTEE, all the right, title, interest, claim, and
demand which the GRANTOR has in and to the following described lots, pieces, or parcels of
land, situate, lying and being in the county of Orange, state of Florida, hereinafter oothe Property,"
to-wit:

SF],E ATTACHED Co B,XHIRIT '(CI')

Property Appraiser's Parcel ldentification Number:
Not Assigned

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same together with all and singular the appurtenances
thereunto belonging or in anywise appertaining and all the estate, right, title, interest, lien, equity,

Right of V/ay Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 14 of 2I



Project: V/idening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook V/est Parkway

and claim whatsoever of the GRANTOR, either in law or equity, for the proper use, benefit, and
behoove of the GRANTEE forever.

SUBJECT TO the covenants, conditions and restrictions which are set forth below:

h) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all rights of ingress, egress,
light, air, and view to, from, or across any State Road 429 right-of-way property which
may otherwise accrue to any property adjoining said right of way.

Ð GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all re-established limited-
access rights of ingress, egress, light, air, and view to, from, or across the Property as
described in Exhibit ,.Clr" and the limited access line described in Exhibit'0C2" shall
be and is released.

j) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all rights and privileges and
easement associated with the operation, maintenance, expansion, or removal of S.R.
429 facilities over C.R. 535 (hereinafter "Expressway Bridges"), including the right to
access, install, construct, use, operate, maintain, alter, improve, repair, replace, renew,
expand, and remove the Expressway Bridges under, through, across, and over the
Property described in Exhibit $C1."

k) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, for the use and benefit of
the public, a right and easement for signs and related structures and facilities, which
right and easement includes the right to construct, operate, improve, expand, maintain,
repair and replace from time to time.

D GRANTEE expressly agrees for itself and its successors and assigns, to refrain from
any use of the hereinafter described real property which would interfere with the
Expressway System, or otherwise constitute ahazard for the Expressway System.

m) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE does not commence construction for the widening of
C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway by January 2019, then all right, title, and
interest to the Property shall immediately revert to and vest in the GRANTOR
herein, its successors or assigns, and the conveyance hereunder shall be null and
void, and GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate
possession of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or
omission upon the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be
a waiver of the operation or enforcement of such condition.

n) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE no longer uses the Property, or any part thereof, for right-
oÊway pulposes, then all right, title, and interest to the Property, shall immediately

Right of Way Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 15 of 2l



Project: V/idening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

revert to and vest in the GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, and
GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate possession
of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or omission upon
the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be a waiver of the
operation or enforcement of such condition. GRANTOR retains the right to
refuse to accept the Property, or any part thereof, by providing notice, in writing,
to the GRANTEE.

IN WITNESS V/HEREOF, the said GRANTOR has caused these presents to be signed in
its name by its duly authorized representative.

Signed, sealed, and delivered
in the presence of:

16cFxrt

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESS\ilAY
AUTHORITY

X'irst Witness:
BY

CHAIRMAN BUDDY DYER
V/itness

Date:

Print Name

Second'Witness:

Witness

Print Name

(Signature of TWO witnesses required by
Florida law)

ATTEST:
Darleen lli4azzillo,
Executive Assistant

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this _ day of
by BUDDY DYER, as Chairman of the Central Florida Expressway Authority.

)
)

20t7,
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NOTARY PUBLIC

Signature:
Signature of Notary Public - State of Florida

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary Public

Personally Known [ ] OR Produced Identification [ ], Type:_

Right of V/ay Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 17 of 2l



EXHIBIT "HOO

Prepared By:
Linda S. Brehmer Lanosa, Deputy General Counsel
Central Florida Expressway Authority
4974 OP.L Tower Road
Orlando, FL 32807

Reserved for

Project: Widening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook V/est Parkway

This deed is exempt from Florida documentary stamp tax under Department of Revenue Rules
l2B-4.002(4)(a), l28-4.014(10), F.A.C., and Section 201.02(6), Florida Statutes.

QUIT CLAIM DEED

THIS QUIT CLAIM DEED, made and executed on the day of _,2017,by
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSV/AY AUTHORITY, a body corporate and an agency of the
State of Florida, created by Part III of Chapter 348, Florida Statutes, whose address is 4974 ORL
Tower Road, Orlando, Florida 32807 ("GRANTOR") and CITY OF V/INTER GARDEN, a
charter city and political subdivision of the State of Florida, whose address is 300 V/est Plant
Street, V/inter Garden, Florida 34787 ("GRANTEE").

WITNESSETH: That the GRANTOR, for and in consideration of the sum of $10.00 and
other valuable considerations, the receipt of whereof is hereby acknowledged, does hereby remise,
release, and forever quit-claim unto the said GRANTEE, all the right, title, interest, claim, and
demand which the GRANTOR has in and to the following described lots, pieces, or parcels of
land, situate, lying and being in the county of Orange, state of Florida, hereinafter "the Property,"
to-wit:

SEE ATTACHED COMPOSITE EXHIBIT TDI''

Property Appraiser's Parcel Identifïcation Number:
Not Assigned

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the same together with all and singular the appurtenances
thereunto belonging or in anywise appertaining and all the estate, right, title, interest, lien, equity,

Right of V/ay Transfer and Continuing Maintenance Agreement, Page 18 of 21



Project: V/idening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

and claim whatsoever of the GRANTOR, either in law or equity, for the proper use, benefit, and
behoove of the GRANTEE forever.

SUBJECT TO the covenants, conditions and restrictions which are set forth below:

Ð GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all rights of ingress, egress,
light, air, and view to, ftom, or across any State Road 429 right-oÊway property which
may otherwise accrue to any property adjoining said right of way.

g) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, all re-established limited-
access rights of ingress, egress, light, air, and view to, from, or across the Property as
described in Exhibit (Dlr)' and limited access line described in Exhibit"D2" shall be
and is released.

h) GRANTOR reserves unto itself, its successors and assigns, for the use and benefit of
the public, a right and easement for signs and related structures and facilities, which
right and easement includes the right to construct, operate, improve, expand, maintain,
repair and replace from time to time.

i) GRANTEE expressly agrees for itself and its successors and assigns, to refrain from
any use of the hereinafter described real property which would interfere with the
Expressway System, or otherwise constitute ahazard for the Expressway System.

j) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE does not commence construction for the widening of
C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway by January 2019, then all right, title, and
interest to the Property shall immediately revert to and vest in the GRANTOR
herein, its successors or assigns, and the conveyance hereunder shall be null and
void, and GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate
possession of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or
omission upon the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be
a waiver of the operation or enforcement of such condition.

k) GRANTOR and GRANTEE expressly agree for themselves, their successors and
assigns that if the GRANTEE no longer uses the Property, or any part thereof, for right-
of-way purposes, then all right, title, and interest to the Property, shall immediately
revert to and vest in the GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, and
GRANTOR, its successors or assigns shall be entitled to immediate possession
of such premises and the improvements thereon; and no act or omission upon
the part of GRANTOR herein, its successors or assigns, shall be a waiver of the
operation or enforcement of such condition. GRANTOR retains the right to
refuse to accept the Property, or any part thereof, by providing notice, in writing,
to the GRANTEE.
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Project: V/idening of C.R. 535 and Stoneybrook West Parkway

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the said GRANTOR has caused these presents to be signed in
its name by its duly authorized representative.

Signed, sealed, and delivered
in the presence of:

"cFxrt
CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESS\ilAY
AUTHORITY

2017,

First Witness:
BY:

CHAIRMAN BUDDY DYER
Witness

Date

Print Name

Second Witness:

Witness

Print Name

(Signature of TWO witnesses required by
Florida law)

ATTEST:
Darleen llif.azzillo,
Executive Assistant

STATE OF FLORIDA
COI.INTY OF

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me this _ day of
by BUDDY DYER, as Chairman of the Central Florida Expressway Authority.

NOTARY PUBLIC

Signature
Signature of Notary Public - State of Florida

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary Public

Personally Known [ ] OR Produced ldentification [ ], Type

)
)
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EXHIBIT TI''

SKETCH OF PROPERTY TO BE CONVEYED
\ilITH RE.ESTABLISHED LIMITED ACCESS LINES
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MATEER HARBERT, P.A.
225 East Robinson Street, Ste. 600

Orlando, Florida 32801
Telephone (407) 425-9044
Facsimile (407) 423-2016

MEMORANDUM

To: Central Florida Expressway Authority o Wa ommittee

FRotvt: Jay W. Small, Right of Way Coun el ~r
Mateer Harbert, P.A.

DAf['E: January 9, 2017

RE: Project #: 429-203; Project Orlando, LLC; Parcels 197/897; Ms. Vickie Davis d/b/a
Bay Hills Equestrian Center; apportionment claim

INTRODUCTION

This matter involves a proposed settlement of an apportionment claim by Respondent,
Vicki Davis d/b/a Bay Hills Equestrian Center ("Davis"). Davis was the tenant on the parent tract
of property owned by Project Orlando, LLC ("Project Orlando").

After settlement discussions and meetings, subject to approval by the Right of Way
Committee and the Board, CFX and Davis have negotiated an all-inclusive settlement of Davis'
apportionment claim for $60,000.00, including interest, and attorneys' fees and costs. This
settlement will resolve all remaining claims of Davis. Davis has also agreed to assign her
apportionment claim to CFX which will allow CFX to stand in her shoes to assert, prosecute, and
claim any apportionment claim Davis had against the owner of Parcels 197/897.

PROCEDURAL HISTORY

The valuation trial regarding Parcels 197/897 is scheduled on the March 2017 trial docket
in front of Judge Janet C. Thorpe. Davis will not present evidence of the value of the parcels taken
and severance damages at the trial.

Davis made a claim for business damages, and the Right of Way Committee and the Board
approved a settlement of her business damage claim for $85,000.00. A final judgment was entered
by the Court ratifying that settlement on September 16, 2015. That settlement did not resolve her
apportionment claim. Her sole remaining claim is for apportionment ofthe award ofcompensation
payable to Project Orlando. Davis claims that her existing lease was below market value and that
she is entitled to be paid a share of the condemnation award based on the difference between the
rent she paid (referred to as the contract rental rate) and a fair market rental rate. Davis' lease of
the subject property contained an automatic renewal provision although it was terminable at will
by either the tenant or landlord upon thirty (30) days' notice.



Davis and Project Orlando, after the entry of a final judgment awarding compensation for
the taking of parcels 197/897, would have to try the apportionment claim before the trial Court
judge in a separate, post jury trial evidentiary hearing. Davis presumably would argue that her
lease represented a bonus value, i.e., the contract rental rate was below the market rental rate, and
Project Orlando presumably would present evidence disputing her entitlement to make a claim or
the amount thereof. An apportionment hearing would require both Davis and Project Orlando to
present appraisal testimony and valuation evidence on the issue of whether Davis had a bonus
value to the lease. This sort of evidence would require the appraisers for Davis and Project Orlando
to undertake an analysis of Davis' existing equestrian lease, the rent rates for comparable rental
properties, and the value, if any, of the lease's automatic renewal option. An order of
apportionment would then be entered by the Court allocating the award of compensation between
the tenant's interest in the property (the leasehold interest) and the landlord's interest in the
property (the leased fee).

Under Florida's condemnation law, the Central Florida Expressway Authority ("CFX") is
responsible for the reasonable costs incurred by owners in determining the amount of
compensation to be paid for the taking and supplemental proceedings, including apportionment
proceedings. Florida's case law and condemnation law regard a tenant and a landlord to be owners
entitled to reimbursement of reasonable attorneys' fees and costs. Consequently, CFX is obligated
to pay the tenant's and landlord's reasonable attorneys' fees and costs, including reasonable court
costs and appraisal fees, for litigating the apportionment claim.

DESCRIPTION OF PROPERTY AND TAHING

The abbreviated parent tract to parcels 197/897 is 102.064 acres. On September 9, 2014,
CFX condemned parcels 197/897 for Section 1B of the Wekiva Parkway project. Parcel 197 is
further identified as parcels 197 and 197 (A through D). CFX condemned parcel 897 as a
permanent easement to construct a bridge linking parcels 197(A) and 197(D). This easement
allows for a connection between Project Orlando's eastern and western remainders. It is wide
enough to permit Project Orlando to construct an internal connector road linking the eastern and
western remainders when the property was ripe for ultimate development.

CFX'S AND PROJECT ORLANDO'S APPRAISAL REPORTS

Walter N. Carpenter, MAI, State-Certified General Real Estate Appraiser, appraised the
property for CFX. Applying the sales comparison approach, he estimated the value of parcels 197
and 897 to be $9,530,000.00 and $38,600.00, respectively. His estimated severance damages are
$2,161,400.00, and his total estimate of value of the taking is $11,730,000.00. Heywood M.
Cantrell, MAI, State-Certified General Real Estate Appraiser, appraised the property for Project
Orlando. He estimated the values of parcels 197 and 987 to be $15,059,027.00, respectively. His
estimated severance damages are $15,756,254.00, and his total estimate of value of the taking is
$30,815,281.00. Neither appraiser estimated the value of Davis' leasehold interest or based their
opinions of value on the income approach. Nor did they estimate the value of the tenant's and
landlord's leasehold and leased fee interests.



DAMS' APPRAISAL REPORT

Since no final judgment for the taking has been entered yet, the procedural posture of the
case makes it premature for Davis to prepare a detailed apportionment analysis by a real estate
appraiser. Without disclosing the specific details of Davis potential apportionment claim, the
amount that she claims for apportionment is substantial.

While CFX would not be involved in litigating the apportionment claim between Davis
and Project Orlando, it is reasonable to assume that CFX would incur some attorneys' fees and
costs in reviewing various pleadings and motions filed in that apportionment proceeding, and it
would have to pay Davis' and Project Orlando's reasonable attorneys' fees and costs.

VICKIE DAMS' ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPERT COSTS

Attached to this memorandum are edited and redacted copies of the invoices from Davis'
counsel indicating her attorneys' and expert witnesses' fees. These are summarized below:

Attorneys' Fees Hourly Amount
Rates Invoiced

Fishback Dominick (A. Kurt Ardaman) $500.00 $183,297.50
$475.00
$400.00
$275.00
$225.00

Experts' Fees Hourly Amount
Rates Invoiced

Cawthra Consulting &Appraisals, Inc. $150.00 $2,400.00
(Charles E. Cawthra III, ASA)
Allen H. Angus, LLC (Allen Angus, $150.00 $862.50
General Contractor)
Calhoun, Dreggors &Associates, Inc. $175.00 $9,662.00
(Richard C. Dreggors, GAA) $275.00
Total $196,222.00

Irrespective of the merits of Davis' apportionment claim, conservatively it could cost the
tenant and landlord $25,000.00 each in attorneys' fees and costs to litigate this issue —the
reasonable costs for which CFX is ultimately liable. For settlement purposes, the amounts of
experts' fees appear reasonably supported in light of the complexity of the issues, the tasks
assigned the experts, and the amount in controversy although counsel does not necessarily agree
that all fees and costs are properly taxable against CFX.

Given the forgoing review of Davis' claim, attorneys' fees and costs and considering
CFX's exposure for additional attorneys' fees and costs in connection with the apportionment
claim, we believe the amount of the settlement and Davis' assignment of her apportionment claim
to CFX to be reasonable. A table summarizing Ms. Davis' claim against the proposed settlement
is below.
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Davis' Initial Proposed
Demand Settlement

Tenant's Requested Apportionment Substantial --
Attorneys' Fees

$183,297.50 --
(Fishback Dominick)
Experts' Fees

$ 12,924.50 --
(Cawthra, Angus, and Dreggors)
Total $ 196,222.00 $60,000.00

REQUESTED ACTION

We respectfully request that the Right of Way Committee recommend to the CFX Board
approval of an all-inclusive settlement agreement in the amount of $60,000.00, to settle any and
all remaining claims of Davis, including her pending apportionment claim, attorney's fees, expert
fees, and costs, provided that Ms. Davis, at counsel for CFX's election, include in the Stipulated
Final Judgment an assignment to CFX of Respondent's apportionment claim against the owners
of Parcels 197/897 and their successors and assigns.

Attachments:
Diagram of the Wekiva Parkway
Aerial
Sketch of the Property
Settlement Agreement
Invoices from the Owner's Counsel and Experts

4845-4160-3136,v. 2 LLl
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PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 27
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE

AERIAL PHOTO (ACQUISITION)
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PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 28
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE

PARCEL SKETCH OF THE ACQUISITION
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PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 29
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE
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PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 30
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE

SEARING 57RI~~T~dR~ S,ASEp QIV THE NORTH ~Il+i~
dF TFiE SOUT~IEAST 114 Q~F 5~~. 13.2(}-23, B~E1NG
~J~9° 1~'{7~i"E. F1.~7RII~11 S7d,7£ ~'~A~lE t`{~C~fil7INATE
5'f5TEM1, EAST Z{~M11G, 19a3/20f}7 AI~lU5Tt41~NT.

c~~nr~u~r~
PRf~M SHEET 7 ~s~•~~~as~w

~ PART A 1339.52'rC)
5~E SHEETS 6-7 N8`~"15'06"~

L3 — 57~.4~'fC1 •.

-~ PJG~t~'~1 LtPlE.

~~
+Y
a ~

SE t,~~, SEC. I3
n SEE DETAIL

~ v 3.-, ua I 589° 15"fib"W "~ ~ m

n~~

`j ~~ ',"o ~b I Sf10°21'25"E ,c, ~u~w~U

w ~
~P.fl.6.
~

r: 9 4~~a ~
Lt ~,~~T b I ~`

ACRES
!

~5]~9
w ~ 

~5 #C3~
1

r~' ~....~_ ____
ACRESx,~ ~C '4:

'~^ ~, I~.M 1 riJ
EAST I.~hi~, NW if4. 1

_~
~'
v'? W

SE 1/4. SAC, I3
(V ~ ~V

h- ~
x"

~ L1= Ni~O°38'22°WJ 13A2,75'IC}
~ 

1
4"~°u -~ l2= N46°21'25"W 78,5~'tC1 1 W

~3
~"

L3= X84°38'33"1M 324.~DQ'4~D U'
~
~ ~

~4= NDO°~i'75"4hl' 855.3d'~~J w ~" ,~
b, L5= S44"°2D'S8"E 2571.~1'i~} ~, ~;( ,,~

~z
~.

L~~, Ile~~~~y~hP ~/~~̂ µt{~1~~
GV ~~y~ ~Vy ~̂~~■.l~Vg ,14g.J if~I

{'~' ~

/~

!k~ ll~ld[.~6i~~4~

~
~

~ CHI?fil.Ifi`{GT
CBS 502'17"03"E

~a~ta'~I~ ~tN~, Nv~t I,ra.
SE 1/~t, 5~~, 13
A~ k1(3NUMIEPiTED

¢-J'~ 34~i~: A p a 4VV~

249.6'"~G~
"W

337.4~'(C~
S88 57"S(1

,yG ~y,i ~+

~88"'i7°50"'N `
~ D~0588°57'5

SECT[t7N 1'~ Tt~VtiIIVSI"IIP ,2CI '3CIl.I~TH RANGE Z7 EAST PROJECT No. d39-203
urn».~a~i U~,.~~.~ „~,.rrorr, ~r

~

~

~,
yxu iouT~ M~vr+uauw wwern~e
onwl~ao. 1'161iIPA }9hb7

ely°e~.°_:'.''r9..~.,u

SiCETCM OF DESCRiPTlt?FI.
71~T'S B'5 6iQ7 A BOU~i~ARY SURYE"1'.

PA#t~EL
t ~f7~fp~1~f

i37~IQ7/

Mltldl G/••.m.• 

~
M.~A41tK3

anecteuar a.wru
Rf1-'~Fa~~T raa.._ .. uer.n

,w+rc a•iri~vrai.

5.p. 429 t'NEkUVA PAA1CWpY1
iORLAM£Ro-DR#hIGE COUt~IY
EXPt1ES$WAY AU't}1CIRPTY
Qi~ANG~ CS3U[!RIY, FLbPl70p

SCALE; 1`=~4CF'
y a.rtent aina~r>i. —.

SIf~~7 8 OF 11_. _._

12-172 UPDATE REPORT
COPYRIGHT 2014, PINEL &CARPENTER, INC.



PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 31
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE
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ZC7P1E, 1983/2Q07 ADJUSTMENT.
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PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 32
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE
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NS$°?p'47"E. FLpRIDA STATE PLANE COURDINATE
SYSTEM, EAST ZONE, 748317007 AD1l1STMENT.
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PARCEL NO.: 197 AND 897 33
OWNER: PROJECT ORLANDO, LLC
PROJECT: STATE ROAD 429 WEKIVA PARKWAY EXTENSION PROJECT NO. 429-203
CITY/COUNTY: APOPKA/ORANGE
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II~ T~-IE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE NINTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
zN .A.NA ~'4R. ORA.NGE COUN`z'Y, S'~,OS..XX7.A.

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY, CASE NO; 20I4-CA-005589-0
body 13olitic quid coiporata, and an agency of the stale
i►~ider the laws of the State of Florida, Subelivisio~~, 37

Petitioner,

'vs.

~'~~oject Oxlando, LLC, a ~'iorida limited liability
company, VICI~TE DAVIS d/b/a BAY IIILLS
EQU~ST~2TAN C~NT'ER; et. a1.,

R~spoliclellts.

Parcels 197/89

S~TTL~NI~NT AGR~+ EM~NT

Respondent, VICI~I~ DAVIS d/6/a BAY HILLS EQIJ~STRIAN CENTER, acid
representativEs of the CefrtLal ~Ioridl L~xpressvva~ Authority+ reached the follo~r+ing Settlement
A~r•eeznez~t:

l., k'etztio21er will pay to Respo~de~it, VICKIE D~VIS d/b/a BAY HILLS
EQUESTRIAN CENTER {referred to as "Respondent") the suns of Sixty Thousand Dollars
exactly ($60,000.OQ), its fitll settlement of all retraining claims for compensation from Petitioner
whatsoever for the taking of Parcels I97/89`7, including a~~y and alt elaii~~s related to
ap~ortionineiat agaijLst any patty in his case having a pro~~erty interest in o7• ~ lien on the subject
property tend including lttor~iey's fees, expert fees, and costs relating to the apportiomnent claim.
Within thirty days (30) days fi•o~n the date of receipt by Petitioner's counsel of a confon~ed copy
of tl~e Stipulated Final 7txdgment, Petitioner w111 pay to counsel for Respondent the stu~1 of Sixty
Thousaiad Dollars exactly ($60,000.00), representing the focal sum payable to Respondent,
iueluding attorney's fees, expez~t fees, and costs relating to tli~ apportio~unei3t claim.

2, Respoz~dez~t hereby a~•ees, at cowlsel for CT'~'s election, to include in tl~e
Sti~uiated rival Judgment an assigz~z~xent to CFX of Res~oz~dezat's ap~oz•tioti~~ent c~aitn a~aix~st
the owners of parcels l 97/$97 and their successors and assigns, anti Resj~ondenC expressly agrees
that CrX can stand ~~i Respondent's sl~o~s to ass~it, ~~rosecute, and collect any claim against ttia
awnei•s of Parcel 197/897 and their successors and ~tssigi7s. '1'liis assi~runent will be given
witlioilt any zeco~~rse #o Resppnde~rt, aa~d Respandei~t does not guarantee payment o1' the claim
assigned. Res~~ondenfi agrees, however•, that in tl~e event ~1~.y payment udder the claiYn is made t~
Respondent otliei• tlaan ti~ze payment by CFX to Respondent pz~ovided in this Settlement
Agreetne~~t, Respondent will pz'om~~tly transmit such payment to CFX.



3. 7'l~is Settlement Agreement will be ptaeeci axi the nge~idr~ fir the .RighC cif Way

("ROW") Committee and Cei~kral Florida Exp~~essway Authority {"CFX") Board and is
conditio~ied upon final approval by the TtOW Co~mnittee and then the CFX Board,

4. The parties agree to waive any coz~ftderatiality provisions ,set forth in C;I~apter 44

of Florida Statutes, t1~.e Florida Rules of Civil ~'rocedure, end the Florida Rules a#` Evidence, iF

applicable, ~-or the limited puz•~oss cif c4nsidez'ation of this proposed Settlement Agr~e~t~~nt by

the ~t.OW Gon~rnittee and the COX Boyd.

5. counsel for Petitioner and Responde~~t will submit t~ tha Court a Stipulated Final

Judgment containing the ternxs and conditions o~ this Settlement A.greeane~t wit3~iii ~f~es~7 (l S)

days fx•Uta~ tie date of approval of this Sstttetaae~t Agreeme~lt by the CFX Board.

b. This A~reernent resolves ~l~ z~eant~inuz~; alarms ~ll~atsoev~z~, including chinas at

c;ontpensaCior~ tuxsircg fx~orn tk~e takzng of P~u~cc is 197!!397, appoa~tionmei~t Chinas, interest,

attc~ruey's fees, attprrx~ey's casts, expert fees, expert casts, mid auy other china.

7. Tlus Settlement A~reetnenfi, executed by tl» parties and their cotuisel oiY this

,___~T~ day of ;`~~ c~{~, 2017, contains all the agreeiz~ents of the paxties. This

Settlent~~t A,~t'~ement nYt~y be e~Cecuted a~z c~unfer~~~cs, the ag,~te~at~ n~ which sha11 car►stitute a
singly dacume~~t, and electronic ancUor facsimile Si~n~tut~es shall b~ dee►ned ari~iiutl si~nahu~es.

Print Name: '
Owner ~.Gr.~+~✓ ~~tir.,,~.,

Attorney foz~ Owner ~ ~

v:~tix,~~c~,u!vrs~nnws. v~cws~oocsn uaai-zns~~nrrcnrrco~.:~crn;scrr~rnmxr.wnrtsMrnr ct,snh i-~•i~.00r.



LAW OFFICES

Frshbacl~, Dominick, Bennett, Andaman,

A.hlers, Langley &Geller LLP

1947 LEE ROAD
WINTER PARK, FLORIDA 32789-1834

June Oh, 2016

Billed through 06/Ob/2016

Bill Number 95898

Vickie Davis
3727 Ocoee Apopka Road
Apopka, ~'L 32703

adv. Orlando-Orange County Expressr~vay Authority

D451 2375

Balance Foxward $0.00

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES Tu~NDERED

07/09/2014 AKA. Confezence with Ms. Vickie Davis; Instructions 2.50 hrs $1,250.00

to Ms. Z.,indsay; Review multiple documents;

Review pleadings; Review statutory provisions.

07/09/2014 ML, Prepare for and attend meeting with Mr. 2,50 hrs $375.00

Andaman and Ms. Vickie Davis re:
multiple documen s;Mem~ Review

e re: retainers; Review Property

Ap~~~aisex Xnformation and maps; Review

pleadings. ~~'~: ~'

07/10/2014 AKA :---x:09-~i~ $1,500.00

Legal research Re: rzaonth to

month tenancies, 7 month tenancy, reasonable .

probability of continuation, apportionment

zmatters, Conference

with Mr. Langley; Conference with Mr. Conley;

Instructions to Ms, Lindsay. 1 L ~

07/10/201A ML Review file; Review Division oaf Cozporations ~-3:flfl~rs $450.00

website re: Fictitious Nar~ae ding for Bay Dills

Equestrian. Center; Draft Fee Agreement;

Memo to 1VIx•. Andaman; Revise Fee Agreement;

Perform conflict check foz ail parties

~l~ s; Instructions to Ms. Fostex•;

Conference with same; Telephone Conferences

Ms. Vickie Davxs; Email to same,



%, 
.~~.

07/10/2014 UL (Vickie Davis D451-23754) Confer wifh Mr. •--x:00 ~i~,~- $850.00

Andaman regarding-
~i~i~ease terms; Review and revise

retainer agreement; Review lease agreement. /, ~

07/10/2014 CRC Review pxeviaus lease agreements; Research ---~:16`Tiis $577.54

regarding apportionment claims, III
and leasehold interest damages,

holdover tenancies and tenancies created upon

expiration o~v~rritten lease.

07/11/2014 ML Review initial pleadings; Mema to file re: 2.00 lu~s $300.00

deadlines; Draft Pleading Index; Instructions to

Ms. Gonzalez; Review lease documents; Draft

~
Lease Chronology.

07/14/2014 AKA Conference with Mr. Langley re: fiill O.SO lus $25.00

compensation. , y

07/14/2014 DL .,l~9~i""s $297.50

Confer with Mr. Andaman regarding tenant's

entitlement to attozneys' fees for vial work

concerning full compensation for land taken.

07/16/2014 Ml, Revie~s~v file and Petition; Telephone call and 0.40 l~rs $60.00

message to Ms. Vzckie Davis; Email to same.

07/18/2014 A.I~ Addrtional e-mails and coirununications with 0.801~us $400.00

Vickie Davis Re:i ~~~

~~ 
R esearch Re: same.

07/18/2014 ML Review e~nnails between Mr. Axdaxnan and Ms. 1.501u•s $22S.n0

Vickie Davis; Ernails to/from Mx•. Andaman;

Review Petition; Dxaft Answer, Request for

kiearing and Email Designation Notice; Mezx~o

to file ze: Service List.

07/18/2014 DL Correspondence froz~~ client and Mr. Andaman Q.10 hrs X42.50

regarding filing an Answer,

O'7/18/20~~} CRC Review correspondence from V. Davis 0.24 hrs $.SS,00

07/21/2014 A7~1
~~~~~
Conference with Mr. Langley Re: strategy with 1.50 hrs $750.00

respect to,answer or responding, extension from

Jim Spoonhour; Need for Boarder Agreements

and xelated matters; E-mail to Vickie Davis Re:

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay; Review

portions of propose answer and Initial

docuzn.ents. .

07/21/2014 AKA Inst~uction.s to Ms, Lindsay Re: zesponsive 0.60 hrs $30~.a0

pleadings; Telephone conference with attoi~ey

for OOCEA Jim. Spoonhour; E-mail to Mx.

S~IOOTlj].OUT

x7/21/2014 DL Review OOCEA Petition in Eminent Domarn; 1.70 hrs $722.Sa

Review draft Ansvvez• and Affirmative

Defenses; Confer. with Mz. A~~daman regarding

strategy £or making and p~•osecutin~ claim and

dealing ~evith potential termination of lease by

landlord.



07/22/2414 AKA E-mails fronn Vickie Davis; Instructions to Ms, 2.00 lzz~s $1,000.00

Lindsay Re: Boarder Agreement; Conference

with Mr. Langley and Mr. Ahlers Re: valuation

of claim. and strategy and rne~hodology;

Mennorandum to Mr. King R.e: leasehold

inte~•est; Memo to Mr. Conley Re: pleadings

wi~i respe$t to apportionment claim; Review

ezxainent domain practice az~d pxacedures

manual with respect to various issues.

07/22/2014 MT.~ Review eznails, Boarder Agreennents and 1.00 hrs $150.Q0

executed fee agreement; Conference with Mr.

Andaman; Email to Ms. Davis.

0'7/22/2014 DL Confer with Mr. Andaman regarding U.SQ lus $212.50

appoxtzonrnent claim and whether to raise it in

the Answer and Affirmative Defenses.

07/23/2014 AIWA >,Instructions ~o Ms. Lindsay Re: review portions 1.20 hz~s ~F>00.00

of appraisal and other items to deal with;

Review portions of ap~xaisal. ,

07/24/2014 ML Review OOCEA Appraisal and Addenda; 1.40 kus $210.00

Review email from. Mr. Andaman; Emails

to/fiam Mr. King re: lease documents; Review

file.

0'7/2 /2014 LDK Receive instruction. from Mr, Andaman. 1.20 hrs $270.00

Review lease dacum.ents. Begin drafting

memorandum regarding the law of

condemnation of a leasehold.

07/25/2014 ML Review multiple ~c7vebsites re; property 1.50 lus $225.00

information including ownership, OOCEA

project, taxes and agricultural classifcation,

and related matters; Memo to M~. Andaman.

07/2.5/2014 LDK Review lease documenfis. Research methods 5.30 hrs $1,192.50

for valuing leaseholds in condemnation action.

Research types of evidene~ that ca:~ be ,

presented in such cases. R~seareh whetk~er

options to renew are corapensable.

0'1/28/2 14 AIWA Conference with Mr. Langley re: appor~ionnaent 0.30 hres $150.00

pleading.

07/28/2Q14 DL Confer with Mr. Andaman regarding answer 0.30 hY•s $127.50

and affirmative defenses to preserve

apportionment claim.

07'/28/2014 CRC Research regarding apportionment claims, l .40 hrs $385.00

affirmative defenses, and crosselaims;

Preparation of short memorandum regarding

p~•oposed answer; Reseaac~ regarding

supplemental proceedings; Review and

revisions to answer, affirmative defenses, and

damage claims; Instructions to M. Lindsey

regarding answer to petition..

07/28/2014 LDK Research valuation of leasehold interest in 1.30 k►zs $292.50

condemnation proceeding. Prepare legal

memorandum.



07/29/2014 AIWA. Legal research Re: multiple issues surrounding 2,10 hrs $1,050.00

Leasehold valuation and position of lessee;

Research ~i.e: order of proof and pleadings,

07/29/2014 ML Review OOCEA Request fox Admissions; 1,5Q 1us $225.x0

Email and memo to Mr. Ardaanan and Mr.

Conley; Conference with Mr. Conley re:

Answer; Review Amended Notice of Lis

Pendens and Service List; Draft Service List;

Mez~n.o ze: same. ~ ~f

07/29/2014 CRC Review condemnation petition and request for ,.-0;&O~ius $220.00

admissions; Review and revisions to answer

and affiz~naative defenses; ~,~~

07/29/2014 LDK Revier~v and update memorandum regaxding 0.20 hrs $4.5.00

condemnation of leaseholds, and transnr~it to

Mx..Ardaman.

07/30/201.4 AKA Review appx•aisal; Review draft proposed 1.50 hcs $750.00

answer and defenses and damage claim.;

Telephone conference witl~ Mrs. Vickie Davis;

Itzstxuctions to Ms. Lindsay; Review aerial;

Instructiozas to Ms, Gonzalez.

07/30/2014 ML Review emails re: lease terms and issues; 2.00 hrs $300.40

Review Lease documents; ~xr~ail re: same;

Conference with Mr. Andaman; Review file re:

multiple various documents; Review C~OCEA

Appraisal; View City of Apopka website re:

Kelly Park Crossing DRT Development Order;

Email to Clerk's office; Telephone Conference

with Ms. Vickie Davis; Review and prepare

Google Earth inraages; Review Property

Appzaiser website; Review aerial photographs.

07/31/2014 AKA Review maps; View subject property; 4.00 hrs $2,000.00

Conference r~ith Mts. Vickie Davis;

Photographs of property; Dxzve surrounding

areas; Instructions to Mr. Ding Re: research;

Instructions to Mr. Conley Re: patentiax Motion

far Dismissal and zelated issues; Legal research `~
Re: sanne.

~ i.~!'"

07/31!2014 AKA Telephone conference with Vickie Davis Re: 4.--~ $1,150.00

Review and

revise answer for defenses and i~her claims;

Legal research Rem fixtures,

mobile home ~~elated matters; Instructiaz~s to

Ms. Gonzalez; Instructions to Mr. Conley.

07/31 /2014 ML Review email fiom Apaplca City Clerlc re: 0.701us $105.00

Development Qrder for Kelly Park C~•ossing

ARI; Email to Mx..A.~•daman; Emails to/from

N1r, King re: title wo~lc; Emails to/from Mr.

Conley re: Response to Request for

Admissions; Review revised Answer. /<.~~~-

07/31/2014 CRC Research regarding p~•e-condemnation notice ,.,~-:-~t~"lus $522,50



and good faith negotiations~~
despite

existence of condemnation clause within lease;

Research condemnation statutes regarding

notice and negotiation pre-suit requirements;

Review and revisions to answer and affirmative

defenses to condemnation petition; Review first

set a~ admissions; Research regazding responses

to admissions; ~.

07/31/2014 LDK Confezence call with Mr. Andaman and Mr,

Conley. Research whether a leasehold interest

could be subordinated to a nr~ox~tage for ~Iie

purposes of apportionrn~nt in a condemnation

case. Review lease documents for

condemnation clause. Research ~ovhether a

lessee in a condemnation case xnay put on

evidence of the value of the overall property,

08/01/2014 AKA Review chronology of events fog leasing,

purchase and sate and related matters;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: same; Review

leases; Review and revise Answer, Defenses

and Claims; _ - _ _.. _,_ . ...

I~U~ Review eminent domain practice

and procedural manual; Instructions to Ms.

Lindsay Re: Notice of Appearance, Email

Designation and related matters; Discovery

responses; Instructions to Mr. Conley Re: same.

08/01/201 ML Review memo from Mr. Conley re: deeded

information and action itezx~s; Emails to/frotx~

Mx. King re: title work; Review Property

Appraiser information; Upload and request tide

search report with Stewart Title; Emails to/from

same.

08/01/2014 ML Review OOCEA's Notice of Dropping Parties

and associated Disclaimers of Interest; Review

OOCEA's Motion for Default for several

Respondents; Review Tax Collector's Amended

Answer and Ame~.ded Motion fox Payment of

Taxes; Revise Service List; Review OOCEA's

Request for Admissions; Memo to Mr.

Andaman; Revise Answer and Affirmative

Defenses.

08/01/2014 ML Further aevisions to Answer and Affirmative

Defenses; Draft Notice of Appearance; Revise

Email Designatzox~ Notice; Upload and

electronically notices; Revier~v multiple filed

court documents filed by other parties; Revise

Service List; Upload and electronically ale

Answer and Affirmative Defenses and Request

fog Hearing; Revise Pleading ~nde~.

2.10 hra

,,,~-OU 1

1.00 hrs

1,0o nos

2.80 hrs

$472.50

$2,000.04

$150.00

~Isa.00

$420.00



08/OU2,OlA ML ~teviewRequest £oz Adrnis~ions; I7zaft 0.80 ]us ~12Q.00

Response; Draft letter to Jim Spooxtk~ouz~.

08/OZ/201 D~, Cox►fer witl~ NZ~. Andaman rsgardixlg valuation Q,3Q lus $127.50

. for appox~tio~z~nent ~uzpases and ansvvex. / ~

08/OX/20l Q- CRC Revi~vv and revisions to answer, af~irmafiv~ •--~:1-(3~u.~s—'' $577.54

defenses/claims to condemnation. peti~ian;

Researohregatdiz~g severance dar~aages,~

,noise damages, rants, and

special damages; Inst~uc~ions to ~, L~r~dsey

regarding zes~ansc to adnnissians; Review

x~atioe of appea~•a~.ce a~~d ~.ntice o~ d.esig~.at~on

of email addresses.

08/Q1l2014 LDZ~. Research whether• a moi~tgage~'s clai~x~. zn ~ 1 A01~rs ~2?5,00

. eminent domain case can. take pa:.iority aver a

lessee's claim,

0$02/2014 .l1KA E~xx~.ail to Vickie Davzs ~2.e: 1.00 lus $500,00

• z~stxucl:~o~as

• to 1wTr. S~i~ag fie: reui~w a xno~~tgage priorities

claim; Review pleadings £nom other ~ax~.es;

Inst~uc~,ians to Ms. Lzndsay,

08/D4/2Q1 ~ AIWA Canfer~nee wxt~Z fir, Langley+ re: appox~CioY~rrient 0.20 kv~s ;~ 100.00

olaaxn.

08fQ~l/201 ,f1.T~A. Email fionn Ms. Da~+is; Tnstarructio~s to Ms, 1,~N0 his $700.00

Li~acCsay ate: title wank, mortgage issues anal:

xelate~ maters; Review and revise letter to

OOCF.~ COt1riSC~; ~.eV.teW Gild 18'~'ISe leS~3Palse

Request for Admissions; Confe~enee wish Mx.

Conley ate: same.

08/O~k/2014 AZ~A. Review legal research Re; lease/moi~tg~tge x.80 lus $9Q0.00

px~oxzty; Insi~uetions to Mr. Ting Re: saz~ae;

Review e-an.ails from Vickie Dav7is; Conference

with pofi~~atial ex~e~~ts. / CJ

08/Q<~/2014 1~I~A Instx~ua~ians to Ms. Lindsay Re; ohart for ~-~ $GOU.00

6oardexs, residential #e~ants and other intexasfs

in pro~ez~[y; ~~st~-uetions to Ms. Gonzalez Re:

various parties in tie oas~; Revievu and revise

x~espnnse to nequ~st fay Admissions,

08/Q~/2~~4 AY~:~. Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re; boarders Q.GO ht's $30 .00

subtex~ant~ and related ~nczatters.

08/0~1~/201~ 1~{A CanferezaccwiihMr. Langley re: apportio~nent 0.2a lus ~lU0.Q0

claizx~..

08/04/2014 ML. Review And revise lZespaasse to Request for 2.50 hers $375.0

Admissions; Revise lctfier to rix~a S~oonhout;

Review ~svveis filed by rno~.~tgagee, l'SP/N~t.0

Debt Pnrtfolia and .Abed ICa~er; Revicvv file

anal pleadings; ~inazls tolfroin Mx. Ardaznan;

Review Mox~tga~o and Assignxzaezzt; Memo to

Mx. Axdama~a; Revise pleading Ixadex;

Con~fer~nce with Mt~. Ardarnan; n.~view Lease

documents; lZetriew ~~,otes; Email to Ms. Davis



re: ~~ Review Division of

Cozparations website aad perfo~nn. Gaogle

search re: PSP/MRC Debt Portfolio; Review

Property Appraiser information.

08/04/2014 ML Revier~v f ~e ~•e: tenants and boarders; Dxaft list 1..00 hrs $150.04

and who disclaimer and default status;

Conference with Mr. Ardaxxxan; Email to Ms.

Vickie Davis.

08/04/2014 DL Discussion ~vvith Mx. Andaman regarding 0,201us $55.00

apportionment claim.

OK/04/2014 DL Correspondence from Attorney, Zachary O.I 0 lus $42.50

Broome regarding saxvice of pleading issue.

08/09/2014 CRC Review pxoposed correspondence regaaeding 0.80 hzs X220.00

admissions; Review proposed responses to

~~equest for admissions; Instructions to M.

Lindsay regarding same; Review answer and

affirmative defenses of PSP/MRC Debt

Poi~tfalio.

08/04/2014 LDK Research and review relevant statutes and case G,44 hi•s $1,40.00

law as to whether and when a mortgagee has

prioxity aver a lessee in a condemnation

proceeding. Review and research case law

regarding lease renewals and modif cations and

,their impact on priority as to mortgagees.

Review and research case law regarding how

notice of a lessee's interest by a mortgagee may

be achieved without recordation. Add to legal

memorandurxx and communicate research to Mr.

Andaman.

08/OS/2014 AKA Confere~ace with Mr. Langley xe: appoi~ionrnent 0.6U lvs $300.00

issues and mortgage. ~, ~-~

08/QS/2014 ML Telephone Conference with Ms. Vickie Davis ,.~1:~$O~us X270.00

re: •Revise List; Memo to

1VIr. azx~axx;

Review bank's Response to Request fdr

Adn;~issions; Revise Pleading Index;

08/05/2014 ML Review Fictitious name £cling and status of 0.30 hrs $45.00

d/b/a Bay Hills Equestrian Center; Memo to

Mr. Coney.

08/05/2014 DL Confer with Mr. Ardamar~ regarding 0.60 lus $255.00

appoz~tionment issues con.cexning mortgage

holder aid strategy regarding same.

08/05/2014 CRC Review memorandum regarding priority and 1,10 hrs $302.50

Lease issues; Review PSP/MRC Debt Portfolio's

responses to ~~•st request for admissions;

Review notice o~ inclusion on eService list;

Review correspondence from Z, Broome

regarding service of answer and aff~rinative

defenses; Research rega~.~ding fictitious mine

registration; Review fictitious name records. .



68/45/2014 LDI~. Research lease vs. mortgage priority in 3.10 hz•s $697.5

condemnation proceeding. Assess discovery

needs. Prepare request to produce from PSP.

X8/06/2014 r~,KA Telephone conference with attorney for 3.00 hz•s $1,SOU.00

04CEA, Mr. Jim Spoonhour Re: discovery

request, Order of Taking and related zxaatters;

• Review multiple articles and pleadings;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: mortgage

foreclosure action and mortgagee interest;

Memo to file Re: telephone conference with

. 7irn Spoonhour; Instructions to Mr, Conley Re:

discovery; ~:nshuctions to Mr. King Re; priority

related matters.

08/06/2014 JIB Conference with Attorneys' Ahlers and King re: 0.50 hrs $200.Oa

wisdom of intervention in foreclosure of

subordirnate mortgage.

08/06/2014 MT.~1. Con.fexence with Attorney King and Attorney 0.50 hzs $187.50

Benrxett regarding intervening is foreclosure

case.

08/06/2014 ML Conference with Mr, Ardaman; Telephone 2,50 lus $375.00

Con~e~ence with Jxm Spoonhour re: documents

requested in connection with Request for

Admissions; Review pleadings; Review CFX

Replies to lenders' affirmative defenses; Review

lease documents; View Official Records

vvebsite and multiple xnartgage documents;

Review Clerk of Court website re; mortgage

foreclosure and. docket; Review multiple

azticles and other• documents.

08/06/2014 DL Review E~~zessway Authority's Reply to O.l0lars $42.50

Affirmative Defenses.

08/d6/2014 DL Confer with Mr. Ardazxxan regarding mortgage 0.20 hrs $85.00

lien prioz•ity status in relationship to client's

lease.

O8/Q6/2014 CRC Review reply to affirmative defenses of 1,10 lus $302.50

PSP/MRC Debt Poi~olio anal reply to

affizmative defenses of The Patriot Crroup;

Prepaa,•ation of cor~•espondence to B. synch

regarding confirmation of documents received;

Review correspondence from B. Lynch

regarding document production to answer

admissions and review attached documenfis.

08/07/2014 AKA Review priority with respect to lease related O.SO lus $2SO.Q0

matters and mortgage foreclosure action;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay and Mr. King, ~ G`t

08/07/2014 ML
,~.-~0"Tts $225,00

eviaw

Lease, Mortgage arnd ownership documents;

Revise Cluonology; Emails to/from Mr. King;

Telephone call and message to Ms. Vickie

Davis; Revzew Mlle work and related



documents; Review RFT Trust's Answer and

Response to Request for Admissions; Revise

Pleading Index.

08/07/2014 DL Confer with 1VI~. Ardaman regarding mortgagee O.SO hrs $212.50

claims and potential superiority of leasehold

claims to xxzortgage and appointment issues.

08/07/2014 CRC Review response to request for admissions, 0.90 k~•s X247.50

answer, and affirmative defenses of RFT Trust,

LLC; Review xevised chronology; Review

affirmative defenses of Kagers.

08/p7/2014 LDIC Advise Mr. Andaman as to advisabz~ity of 0,80 hrs $180.00

intervening in ~oreclosul~ suit to ~totect client's

leasehold interest. Review mortgage

documents and title waxic.

08/08/2014 AIWA. Review memo from Ms. Lindsay; Inst~~uctions 0.30 hrs $150.00

to same.

08/08/2014 CRC Preparatitin of discovery relating to mortgage 1.10 hrs $302.50

entities; Review lease and mortgage

chronology.

08/11./2014 DL Review property owner's answer and 0.301~s X1.27.50

aff rnnative defenses to petition and respo~ase to

discovery requests.

0$/11/2Q14 CRC RevxewAnswerandAffirmativeDefenses, O.6~lv~s ;~IG5.00

Response to Request to Produce, and Respo~ase

to Request for Admissions of Project Orlando,

LLC.

08/12/2014 AIWA Review e-mail from attoxxaey far fee simple 0.80 kxrs $A~00.00

ovwner; Review filing by fee simple owner

attorney; Instxuc~ions to Ms. L~~dsay Re:

Expressvc~ay Auth.oriiy default fo:r additional

paxty; Research Re: leasehold interest and teen.

0$/12/2014 AT~A. Telephone conference with appraiser Re; 1,30 l~rs X650.00

valuation standards, lease r~navvals and

successive renewals; Legal research Re: same;

Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez Re: same.

08/12/2014 AKA Review portions of title insurance 1.10 lus $SS0,00

eo~nmitirnent; Instructions to Mr. King Re:

review of same and preparation of chart;

Review multiple pleadings frorr~ other parties.

08/12/2014 CRC Review motion for default and proposed order 0.70 hz~s $192.50

regarding same as to Demi Daggibi; Review

correspondezace from B. Lynch regarding wine;

Review co~•respondence from 7. Spejenkowski

regarding dropping of parEy; Preparation of

requests for production.

08/13/2014 CRC Prepaaation of requests for production to 2.20 hrs $GO5.00

co-respondents; Review file materials regarding

mortgages and Tease issues; Research regarding

various interests of co-Respondents; Review

recorded interests, assignments, mortgages, and

agreements; Research regarding priority.



08/13/2014 LDK Review title work, mortgage, and other 3.201us $720.00

documents evidencing iz~texesfis in the subject

property. Assess which interests aze

compensable in condemnation proceedings and

determine prioxiry of interests. Compose

memorandum and chart on the subject.

08/15/2014 AKA Review pleadings filed by various parties; 0.30 hrs $150.00

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay and Ms. Clanzalez

Re: proposed deposit money and Amended

Declaration o~Taking,

0$/15/2014 AKA E-.mails from and to Expressway Authority 1.201u•s $600.00

counsel Re: Stipulated Order of Taki~.g;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re; same; E-mail to

client Re: same and extended possession; Legal

resea.xck~ Re: impacts of extended possession,

08/1 S/2014 DL Review Amended Declaration of Taking and 0.40 hrs $1.70.00

~z~o~osed Stipulated Ordex of Taking; Review

default entexed against one of the respondents. , ~f

08/15/2014 CRC Review amended declaration of taking and •-(~~~ X 192.50

estimate of value; Review stipulafied order of

taking; Review correspandenc~ from B. Lynck~

regarding same•, Review Joint Motion and

Default as to D, Daggibi; Review

coxrespandence to B. Lynch zegarding extended

possession and modifications to stipulated order

of taking;

08/I8/20~4 AKA Revier~v photos; instructions to Ms. GonzaXez 0.80 h~~s $400.00

and Ms. Lindsa • E-mails from Mrs. Davis Re:
• Inst~~uctians to Ms.

Lindsay.

08/18/2014 ML Review Project Orlando, LLC's Answer and 1.20 lvs $180.00

Affizxn.ative Defenses and responses to

discovery requests; Review Default entezed

against Demi Daggibi; Revise Service List;

Review ernails re: Ordex of Taking and

exfiended possession; Emails to/from Mr.

Andaman; Email to Ms, Vickie Davis.

08/18/2014 DL Co~•respondence from Expressway's counsel O.l O lvs `42,.50

rega~•ding potential extended possession,

08/18/2014 CRC
„~.~~rs $330.00

Research

regarding special damages in eminent domain

proceedings; Review coz7espandence from I3.

Lynch regarding stipulation and extended

possession.

08/19/2014 ML Review photograph~.s o~ subject property; 0.60 hz•s $90.00

Review Amended Declaration of Taking;

Revzew emails; Revise S~ipuiated Order of



Taking; Emazl to Ms. Davis re;,

0$/19/2014 LDK
~~~
Work on memorandum/chart of current 0.70 hrs X157.50

interests encunnbexing subject property and them

zelevance to cond~rnnation pzoceeding, Reviev►r
case law as to the effect of a nnortgage

modification on its priority over other intezests

in a piece of p~ operty.

08/2S/2014 AKA Review ;t~aultiple pleadings and e-mails R.e: 0.70 h~•s $350.00

various flings of Affirmative Defenses and

Claims and Responses tk~ereto; Inshuctions to

Ms. Gonzalez Re: eomrxaunica~ions from

Expressway Authority counsel.

Q$/25/2014 AKA. Review certain title documents pxovided by 0.90 hrs $450.00

Expressway Authority; Instructions to Ms.

Lindsay.

Q8/25/2014 AKA. Review research Re: priority; Further 0.80 l~rs X400.00

instzuctions to Mr. King Re: lease date,

execution dafie and mortgage recording date a~ad

related matters.

08/2.5/241.4 ML Review all Answers filed by parties with 1.00 h~~s $150.00

security interests; Ez~aails and memo to/from

Mx. Andaman; Review Kelly Paxic Crossing

DRI Development Order and m.a~s xe:

preservation areas; Email and memo to Mx.

Andaman.

0$/2S/2014 LDK Confer with Mr. Andaman concerning priority 0.20 hrs $A~5.00

issues ixz candemnat~on proceedings and the

priority of client's lease vs. the mortgage on the

property.

08/26/2014 .I,DK Review case law as to whether there is a 0.901us $202.50

presumption that a lease is 'executed on the start

date of the lease.

08/27/2014 ML Review Judicial Disclosure of Judge Doherty 0.~0 lu~s $60.00

re: de miz~izaaus interest; Revise Pleadzng Index;

Conference with Mr. Conley.

08/27/2014 CRC Review Judicial Disclosure of Judge Doherty; 0.20 hrs $55.00

Ynstructions to M. Lindsey regarding same.

08/28/2014 AKA Instructions to Mr. King 17e; legal research 1.00 kars $500.00

regarding apportionment proceedings fog

estimated value and thez~eafter and rights of

parties to apportioxument; Review proposed

Arr~endment to Answer Affir~natzve Defenses

and Damage Claims,

08/28/2014 AID, Irnst~~uctions to Mr. King Re: additional research 0.801u•s $400.OQ

concerning apportionrnen~/withdrawals;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: Arne~adznent to

Answer A~'firma~ive Defenses and Damage

Claims,

()8/28/2014 ML Emails to/from appraiser regarding zeview of 0,60 hx•s $90.00

file; Review file; Conference with Mr.



Andaman. xe; sits visif, Order of Tal~i~ag, anal

extended possession; Enaails to/~~n~m Ms.

Vicicie Davis; Re~vievv~ Civil procedure Rules

x~egatdi~ig amending A.nsw~x and Affum~tive

Defenses,

0$/2$/2014 LUK ~vievv siatate and case law as to whether 1,30 ~s $292.50

ap~ortionxnent as allowabXe in a condemnatiion

action befnx~e setClernex~.t o~~ final Judgnaeiit.

Communicate x•esuits to Nlr, Andaman.

08/29/201 MT., Review Amexaded ,Answer; Upload and 1,SQ hrs X225.00

elect~oxxically ~Zle same; Ttevise Pleading ~z~de~;

Emails to/from appraiser; Co~fe~ence v~ith

ap~razsex xe: review of i"ile; Merno to file.

09/0212014 AKA Znstz~wtions to Ms. I,iz~dsay Re; 0.5{) hxs $250,00

coxx►x~unicat~ons b~tv~reen Vickie Davis and
Expressway Authoitity Acgtai.sztioz~ ,A.gent;

Review fle.

09/02/2014 AT~A Telephozae con~ere~.c~ wzih, attox~aey for 1,20 hrs $604,00

Expressway ~A.utl~ority; Insfr~uctions to Ms,

Lindsay R~: lease and relgcation; Telc~hox~e

call to Ms. Vickie Aavxs Re, same; Review

lease; Instx~uc~:ions to Mc, Z~iz~g I.te: legal

TBSea1C~ CO~.ae].7]ing IeaSe ~el'1'~.

09/02/2Q14 ML ~2.evi~w emails rega~cdi~g ~atential pro~ei-~y #oz J..00 ~.xs $1.50,00

xelaca~ion and communications with CFX

representative; Bmails fo/fio~.~ ~•. Andaman.;

Erzzails to/exam Ms. Davis; Caza~ezence with Mr.

.Ardamait; Review Lease dacunleufs; Telephone

Cvz~fezenc~ ~vitk~ mss. Davis; Review Notices

froxz-~ ~r~xessway Aut~xaxAty.

09/02/201.4 LDI~. Cox~fez with ZVIr. Andaman aiad Ms. Lindsay ~ .80 k~xs $105.00

~egar~ing Iease xez~ewals and cuiient status o~

lease, Review case lave azxd statute regarding

Lase renewals az~d ca~~.fxact x~tezpretation to

dete~niue ~whctk~ez autornatia xenewa~ pzovision

is still iu ~ffeci. Communicate results to N1r,

Ardaz~.ax~. Add to Legal Memorandum in

opposition fio the cam's di.sbuzsal o~tha

conde~nr~ation deposit.

p9/02/201~ LDZC Prepare rnemo~anduxn i~ opposition to court 0,5017rs $112.50

disbursing initial deposifiof estimated

ea~adexnna~io~ award foz t~se if property o~wtae~•

moves to withcl~~.r~v the deposit,

09/03/2Q14 A~~,A. Review Ex~x~essway .A.uthori~ly letter to se~sax~ate 1.Od 1u:5 $500.0(1

ten.a~rt; Instructions ~o Ms. Lindsay; Review and

ievis~ e-mail to Expressr~ay .~uthoY7ty fiam

Ms, Lix~dsay; 7nsi~uctions i:o ~vSx~. ~.ing R~:

multiple research.

09/03/2414 AT~A. Conference withlvls. Z,indsay R.e: docutn~nts to 1,00 lets ~5()O.gO

appraiser coz~cex~~ing Vicl~ie Davis interest in

the scat estate; T~2.~view F..xpress~va~ Authoiity



related matters and appraisal. ,

09/03/2014 ML Review mails and 90-Day Letters of 2.00 hrs $300.00

Assurance; Email and zxxezaa.o to Mr. Ardarnan;
Review mortgage foreclosure court docket xe:
status; Emails to/from Mr. King; Review
Chronology of Events; Review file and
documents fox appraiser; Draft letter to same;

Emails to/from Ms. Davis; Email to attorneys
for Expressway Authority re: 90-Day Letter of

Assurance.

09/03/2014 DL Review proposed Stipulated Order of Taring, 0,20 l~rs $55.00

09/Q3/2014 LDK Prepare Memoranduxxa of Law arguing against 1.30 h~•s $292.50

disbursal of good faith deposit and for client's

pzioxity over mortgagee and lienholders.

09/04/2014 E1r~tA Review and revise Memorandum of Law with 0.80 hrs $400.00

respect to priority and appoi~tionrnent.

09/04/2014 AKA Further revisions to Memozandum. of Law with 0.30 lax•s $150.00

respect to priority, disbursennent and
apportionment.

09/Q4/2014 AIWA Legal research Re: apportionment vs. 0.80 hzs $4QO.OQ

disbursement; Fiu~ther instructions to M~. King

Re: sa.nrze.

09/04/2014 AIWA Telephone conference with Vickie Davis Re: 1.90 hrs $950,00

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay; Review Stipulafied

Order of Taking anal pxopased Stipulation;

Telephone conference with rim Spoanhour Re:

his request for Stipulation to the Order of

Taking, extended position, apportionment, lien

and xelated matters; Instructi.ans to Ms.

Lindsay; E-mails to and fiom Mr, Spoonhour.

09/04/2014 AKA. E-mails with Jim Spoonhour as counsel for the 2.20 hrs $1,100.00

Expressway Authority Re: multiple matters;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsa Re: Sti ulated
Qrder of Taking and

• ~,egal

reseaarc~a Re: ap~ortianment priority and

disbursement and relafied issues.

09/04/2014 ML Review revised pzoposed Stipulated Order of 1.50 hrs $225,00

Taking and coznpa~•e with prior version;

Telephone Conference with Ms. Vickie Davis

re;
Review erx~ails from Jim

poonhoux•; Review ~1e; Review proposed

Stipulated Order of Taking and compare with

other versions; Email and memo to Mx.
Atdaman,

09/04/2014 ML Review revised Stipulated Oxder of Taking; 0.30 hzs $45.00

Email to Ms. Vickie Davis; Review Joint



Motion; Dxaft ezxxail to Ji~ni Spoonhour.

09/04/2014 LDI~ Review statutes and case law regarding when 2.3 0 hrs 9~517.5Q

appoxtionm~nt may occur. Coaafex~ with Mr,

Axdaxnaaa rregax dax~g timing of appoi~tionme~at

and contents of Legal Nlamorandum for coux C.

Update agresxn.ent accozding~y,

09/05/~OI.A~ ,A.~~t1 E-hails from and to counsel for Expressway 1.20 hrs $6Q0,00

Authority; Instx uctions to Ms. Lands~.~ R~:

proceedings affecting Vickie Davis' xzg~ts;

Tnsf~•uctions to SvSr, Ki~~g Re: further x~esearah

with respect to fhe uu~xt :rule aid NYs. Dais'

right to px~s~t certai~a evidence in certain

circu~stanaes.

Q9/05/2014 AIWA. E-mails from Expressway A.utl~oxity cou~sal 0.701~s :~3.5"a,00

and its surveyors; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay

Iie: aomn~unicataons with Vickie Davis

09/OS/2014 AKA. Adcli~.ona1 e~maiis to and from attoi~ey for 1.20 k~x~s $600.00

Expressway Authoxity; ~nstx~actions to NIr. King

Re: additional xeseas~eh R~: Ordez of Tatting

Hearing an Monday; Zns~ructior~s fio Ms.

L~dsay R.e; ViclGie Aavis communieat~on v~ith

the expressway .A.u~.ox ity; E-mail to at~ox ney

£ox• ]3xp~essway Aufihoriiy wi~l•~ y'espect to

survey3akg a~xd Stipulated Ox~dex of Ta~Cx~.g.

09/05/201A~ .A.~~A E-mails from Expressway Authority aid its 0.50 I~~s $?.50.00

surveyors R~; fla~gz~g; ~nsh~actioa~s to Ms.

Lindsay Re: same.

09/OS/2014 AT~A~ ~teview m~.o from ~~. Lindsay re; 0.20 Iiis $100,00

comYnunicationswith 1V1s, Tllavis,

09/05/2014 MI., Revitew multiple emails from Mr. Ardannan. and 1.50 l~x•s $225.00

between Mr. Andaman and Express~nva~

A.uthozzty xe; flagging area of tal~ir~g and related

inattexs; Ernails to experts axed Ms. S~avis; Da:aft

email to rizn S~oanhour; R~vi~~vv Joilat Mntion

and Stipulated Ozder o~Takiiig; Memo to fide;

Review Appraisal anal xaaaps re; aria offal~ing;

R~~vze~v exx~~i~s xegfuding filagging west

boundary o~tal~.ng; Ema~1s to/from i1~s. Davis;

Finails to/fiorn Jinn Spoox~hour and Brendan

Lynch,

09/USI~O1~ ML Re~vi~~vv emails x~e: potential replacexbe~t 0.20 k~rs X30.00

pxo~~z~ty; Telephone Cox~f~ienee ~rrith Ms.

Vxcicie Davis.

09/05/2014 CRC Review carrespox~d~z~ce from J, Spoo~laour and O.6U I~a~s $165,00

G. Preasimone xega~ding s~.uvey and statcxn~ of

property; Review joint zx~ofiion arzd sii~ulafied

order o~taking;

09/05/201 X,AZC. Research the "U~~.ity Rule" and coi~~.~ose 2,30 l~s $517.50

rneinoianc7.urx~ discussxzxg how this rule bears o~~



valuation of leasehold interests and the role of

the jury in doing so.

09/OG/2014 DL Review joint motion for stipulated order of 0.20 hrs $85.0

taking.

09/07/2014 AKA E-mails from and to attorney far Expressway 1.30 hrs 9~650.0~

Authority; Legal ;research Re: appai~tionnnent

and disbursement and review various lease

matters.

09/08/2014 AKA. Inst~uctians to Ms. Lindsay Re; lease and 0.40 l~•s $200.00

naatters'pertaining to ~z•dez of Taking hearing.

09/08/2014 AI~.A Conference with attozneys for CFX; Attend 1.OQ hrs $500.00

hearing on Order of Taking; Instructions to Ms.

Lindsay.

09/08/2014 AKA Revzew e-mails, notes and drawings in ] .701u~s $850:00

preparation for Order of Taping; Multiple

e-mails to atto~ey for CFX; Telephone

conference witk~ Mrs. Vickie Da i

~; Review matters in. preparation of Order•

of Taking.

09/08/20:14 ~I~1. Review documents from Mrs. Vickie Davis; 1.501~•s $750.00

Multiple e-mails and telephone calls to

attorneys for Expressway Authority.

09/0$/2014 1~KA Conference with Mr. Langley re; extended x.20 hrs $100.00

possession,

09/08/2014 ML Prepare for and asszst Mr. Ardainan fox Oarder 2.00 hrs $300.00

of Taking hearing; Review file and multiple

documents; Reviev►+ Joint Motions attached to
proposed Stipulated Order of Taking; Review

CFX Motion ~o~ Final Judgment After Default;

Telephone Conference with Ms. Vickie Davis,

09/08/2014 ML Review Stipulated Order of Taking and Final O.SO lu•s $75.00

Judgment After Default entered by Judge

Dohexry; Review email xe: lease documents.

09/08/2014 llL Confer witk~ Mr. Andaman regaa~ding extended 0:201us $85.00

possession issues.

09/OS/20l 4 CRC Review motion for final judgment; Review 0.40 hrs $110.00

narice of condemnation letters; Review ~na1

j udgn~ent post-default.

09/09/2014 ML Telephone Conferences with Ms. Vickie Davis O.GO lu•s $90.00

re •Email

to same; Memo to Mr. Andaman.

09/09/2014 DL Review notice of deposit. 0.10 hrs X42.50

09/09/2014 CRC Review notice of deposit; Review 0.601us $165.00

corxespondenc~ from B. Lynch regarding same;

Review correspondence from D. Sclvoth, S.

Harris, M. Sinnring regarding proposed order to

withdraw funds; Review proposed ordez• to

withdraw funds; Review coi~espondence from

K. Baucrlc regarding ~x~oposed Order to



Withdraw Funds.

09/10/2014 AIWA Craft proposed discoverry; Conference wifh Mx. 1.101~rs $SS0.00

Conley Re: same; ~-~azls from and to attorneys

fox Expzessway Authority; Instructions to Ms. ~ r

Lzndsay. Y

. --~ 20.40

09/~ 0/2Q 14 CR.0 Review zx~.otion to withdrar~v Funds, emotion far Q.~O hrs $110.00

final judgrz~ent after default; Review oxdei•

directing payment of taxes; Review
carrespond~nce from B. Lynch regarding

extension of time to vacate premises.

09/11/201A~ AKA Review e-mails from counsel foz mortgage O.SO lus $250.00

hoiden; Tns~ructions to Mr. Ding and Mr,

Conley Re: Motion for Withdrawal and

Response and Affirmnative Defenses.

09/~ X/2014 AI{A Legal reseaxch in preparation for respox►se to 0..50 hzs $250.00

Motion to Withdrawal.

09/11/2014 AKA E-mails Re: deposit; Telephone co~afexence with O.8Q hrs $400.00

Vickie Davis Re; ~

Instructions to M . in say e; ocumerits

related to deposit.

09/l.1./2014 AKA E-mails fiozn and to Expressway Aufihority 1.00 hrs $500.00

attorneys; E-mail and tale hone conference

with Vickie Davis Re:~~~

09/11/2014 ML Review multiple em~ails re: extended possession 1.20 l~x•s $180.00

and notice to rracate served upon hoarse

boarders; Telephone Conference with Ms.

Vicicie Davis; Review additional emails; Memo

to file re: relocation assistance requirements.

09/11/2014 DL Review correspondence fzoxn Mr. Andaman to 0.10 lus $42.50

Expressway's lawyer regarding extended

possessioxz issue.

09/11/2014 CRC Review coixespondence regardi~ag extended 0.30 hrs $82.50

possession of premises; Review correspondence

from B. Lynch rega~•ding same,

09/12/2014 CItC Review proposed response in opposition to 0.60 hrs $165A0

motion to withdraw funds; Review notice of

ktearzng on second ordez of taking hearing.

09/12/2014 LDK ~ Prepare rely to PSP/MRC's ~aaotion to 1.201u•s $270.00

witl~dxaw the initial deposit.

09/15/2014 AKA Review and revise mu~tzp~e Requests for 1.90 hrs $950.00

Production; Review mortgages.

09/16I201A~ ML Review draft discovery requests; Review Order 0.50 lus $75.00

Directing Payment of Taxes; Instructions to Ms.

Gonzalez.

Q9/16/2014 CRC Research regarding non-party subpoenas a~.d 2.60 hrs $715.00

non-party praductzoz~; Preparation of



interrogatories; Review answexs and off rrnative

defenses raised by co-respondents; Reseaxck~

regarding lien priorities in condex~.natian

praoeedings; Telephone conference v►~ith D.
Armeni regarding disbuzsement motiat~ anal

objections thereto; Instructions to M. Lindsay

regarding discovery issues.

09/17/2014 AKA ~ E-mails fiozn and to attorneys Re: Motion fox 0.80 lus $400.00

Withdraw; Insi~ructions to Mx. Conley and Mx .

King Re: response to Motion to Withdraw and

discovery.

09/17!2014 ML. Review multiple emails regarding PSP/MRC 0.601ars $90.OQ

Debt Portfolio's Motion to Withdraw anal

response in opposition or stipulation to same;

Review PSP's Motion; Receive zx~.emo from Mr.

Conley re: discovery to CFX.

09/17/2014 CRC Research regarding availability of interlocutory I.20 lu~s $33x.00

appeal on issue of withdrawal of deposit;

Preparatxor~ of short memozandum on same;

Review correspondence frozx~ D. Armeni

regarding hearing on motion to withdraw;

Review correspondence from M. Faasch

regarding hearing dates and non-aLtendan~ce;

Review carxespondence from B. Lynch and C.

Keller regarding CFX's heating attendance;

09/18/2014 AIWA Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez Re: Motion.fox 1.50 hrs $750.00

Withdrawl; E-mails to and fiam other parties;

Instructions to Mr. Conley Re: Stipulation fog•

Withdrawl; tele~hane oa11 to attoxney for

Mortgagee; Instructions td Ms. Lindsay Re;

staking of property; E-mail £rom CFA surveyor;

. Review interlocutory appellate issues;

Inshuctions to Mx .Icing.

09/18/2014 CRC Revisions to and preparation of interrogatories 0.70 hrs $192.50

to eo-respondents; Review answers and

affirmative defenses filed by co-respondents.

09/19/2Q14 MI., Review em~ails re: staking area of taking axed 0.20 hrs $30,00

si#e visit; Mema to file.

09122/201~F AIWA Review various pleadings and Motions; E-~tnail 0.80 lus X400.00

to Mr. Rob Kelly; Telephone conference with

Rob Kelly on 9/19/14; Instructions to Mr.

Conley Re: response and facts.

09/22/2014 AKA Review and revise multipXe Requests fox 2.00 hrs $1,000.00

Production; Review and revise multiple sets of

Interrogatories; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re:

same; Review portions of legal descziptions and

pleadings; Review neaps and portions o~

appraisal.

09/22/20 4 ML Review e:mails and maps re: area of tal~zz~g; 0.60 lus $90.04

Review legal descriptions and sketches attached

to Petition; Conference with NTr, Andaman.



09/22/2014 CRC Review answers and affirmative defenses of 3.10 l~s $852.50

respoxzdents; Preparation of extensive discovery

requests including intei~ogatories and requests

for production to various co-respondents;

Preparation of non-party discovery subpoena

and notice of non~parly subpoena; Research

regarding discovery issues; Review prioxity

summary and condemnation petition.

09/23/2014 ~A Review and revise subpoena; Review and revise 1.80 hrs $900.00

discovery; Instructions to Ms, Lindsay.

09/23/2014 ML Review and revise Notice of Production fiot~ra 3.00 hrs $450.00

Non~Party; Review and revise multiple

discovery requests to all ot~.e;r Respondents for

197 Parcels; Memo to Mr. Andaman; Review

Petition and Final Judgment After Default re:

initial parties and defaulted parties; Draft

Notice of Service of First Set of Interrogatories

for all other Respondents.

09/23/201 ML Conference with Mr. Ardannan and Mr. Conley 1.00 hrs $150.00

re: discovery to other Respondents; Upload and

electronically file and Notices of Service of

Interrogatories and production requests; Email

and serve Interrogatories; Revise Pleading

Index.

09/23/201 A CRC Review correspondence to R. Kelley regarding 0.901us $247.50

motion to withdraw and proposed joint motion

oz stipulation on same; Revisions to notice of

production ofnan-party; Revisions to

interrogato~•ies and requests for production. ..~w_... ~ •—

._
s . ~ ~6fi70~

-- ins 0--.~_.

09/24/2014 ML Revise Subpoena for Docurrxen.ts fiom O.Sa lus $75.00

Non.-Party directed to New Rochelle Holdings,

LLC; Conference with Mr. Conley; Upload aid

electronically file Notice of Production from

Non-I?arty; Review email notifications; Revise

Pleading Index,

09/24/201 CRC Research ~•egarding leasehold anfierests and 1.OQ i~rs $275.00

pxioxity issues; Revisions to notice o~

production to non-party and subpoena regazding

same.

09/26/2014 AKA Review emails fiom counsel for mortgagee re; O.SO hrs $250.00

priority az~d leasehold.

49/26/2014 ML Review emails between Mr. Andaman and 1.00 hrs $150.00

atfiorney far mortgagee re: lease documents;

Review file; Emails to/from Mx•. Ardanaan;

Review Memoranda re: priority and leasehold



interest.

09/26/2014 CRC Review correspondence from R. Kelley 0.90 lu~s $247..50

regarding withdrawal of deposit and doctux~ent

production request; Research regarding

leasehold interest in conder►nnatian actions.

Q9/29/2014 AKA. Coxnmunicatians with Vickie Davis Re: 0.50 hrs $250.00

Instructions to Mr. King and Ms. Lindsay Re;

lease payments.

09/29/2014 AK~1 Conference with Ms. Lindsay Re: lease interest 0.80 hrs $400.00

and matters to be submitted to other defendants;

E-mails from and to Vickie Davis; Emails to

attorneys for CFX and Project Orlando

09/29/2014 ML Review emails from M~. Andaman and Ms. O.SQ lus $75.00

Vickie Davis re;
• Review

Lease docurnen~ts; Email and menno to Mr.

Azdam.an.

09/3(}/2014 AKA Telephone conference with a . r~.exa _ 0.50 hrs ;6250.00

Vickie Davis Re•

• Review lease.

09/30/2014 CRC Review corresponde~ace to r. Spoonllour aid S. 0.40 hrs $1 ~ 0.00

Har~zs regarding retention of premises and

pro-ratio~a of lease paymenfis; Research

regarding leasehold interests and lease terms.

10/O1/2Q 14 ~1i~A Instructions to Mr. King re; lease documents. 0.40 l~rs X200.00

10/~1/201A I,DK Review lease documents for provisions dealing • 0.40 hrs $90.00

with reduced rent or pro-rations. Confer with

Attainey Andaman re. status of matter.

10/02/2014 LD.IC Review Florida Jurisprudence as to leasehold 0,40 lus $90.00

issues in condemnation cases.

10/03/2014 A_r~_A Conference with and inst~~uctions to Ms. 0.50 kus $250.00

Lindsay and Mr. K~uig re: Xease documents and

priority.

10/03/2014 ML Review emails re: lease docurrxents to 0.50 hzs $75.00

mortgagee, przority over mortgage and related

issues; Revier~v file and lease documents

including lease given to attoi~ey for

Expressway Authority; Email to NIr, Ardama.n

and Mr. Kung.

10/03/2014 LDK Confer with attorney Axdaman regarding r~vhich 0.30 kirs $67.50

lease documents to provide in response to

informal request by opposing party.

10/l.3/2014 AKA Telephone conference with attoi~ey for Project 0.70 h~•s $3.50.40

Orlando and Rochelle Holding; Instructions to

Ms. Lindsay Re: service of subpoena;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: lease related

documents,

1.0/1.3/201 MI_, Review crnails between Mr. Andaman and fee 7,501~•s $225.00



owner re: lease inforax~atian and related matters;

Review and revise thud party Subpoena to New

Rochelle Holdings; iteview Rules of Civil

Procedure; Draft Waiver of Service of Process;

Conference r~vith Mr. Conley re: waiver and

service; Memo to M~. Ardaman.

10/13/2014 CRC Review correspondence fiom K. Batt~rle 0.90 hrs $24'7,50

regarding telephone conference for discussion

of case issues; Research regarding leasehold

interests anal continuation of leases; Research

regarding waiver of service afprocess issues;

Review Florida Rules of Civil Procedure

regarding subpoena duces tecums; Instructions

to M. Lindsey regarding same.

10/14/2014 AID. Instructions to Ms. Lindsay re: lease 0.30 lus X154.00

docuzne~.ts.

10/14/2{)14 NCI, Review FSP/MRC Debt Portfolio's Request for 4.40 hrs $GQ.00

Copies in xesponse to proposed Subpoena to be

served upon Non-Party, New Rochelle

Holdings; Emails to/frozxx Mr. Conley; Memo to

file xe: coxnpliance~ with request fox• copies;

Revise Pleading Index.

10/14/2Q14 ML Review multiple emails ~e: lease documents; 0.50 l~rs $7S.Qq

Review same; Conference with Mr. Andaman;

Prepare lease documents for delivery to CFX

and Owner's attorney,

10/14/2014 CRC Review correspondence to K. Bauerle with 0,201~rs $SS.00

no~apaxry subpoena and waiver o~ service of

process; Review waiver of service of p~:acess.

1 U/14/2Q14 CRC Review request for copies; Instt~uctions to M. 0.201us $55.04

Lindsey regarding same.

14/15/2014 AKA Instructions to Ms. Lindsay re: lease 0.20 hrs $100.00

documents,

10/15/201 ML Review multiple emails ~e; lease documents; 0.~0 I~•s $60.00

Review same; Exiaails to/from Mr. Andaman;

Review Request for Copies served by CFX;

Merno to file

~ 0/15/2014 CRC Review request for copies; Instructions to M. 0.101us $27.50

Lindsey regarding same.

1 Q/15/2019~ LDK Assemble lease docuz~aents to be sent to 0.30 hrs $67.50

opposing counsel and tzansmit to Mr. Andaman.

10/16/2014 ML Review RF'T T~~ust's Request for Copies; Merno 0.20 hrs X30.00

to file.

10/l.6/2014 CRC Review request for copies; Instructions to M. 0.24 hrs $SS.00

Lindsey regarding same; Review

cozzespondence from K. I3auexle regarding

acceptance of service of subpoena duces tecum

and signzng of waiver.

10/17/2014 ML Review executed Waiver of Service of Process 1.00 his $150.00

of Non-Party Subpoena from counsel fox New



Rochelle Holdings, LLC; Emails to/from Mr.

Conley; Draft Notice o~Filing Waiver of

Service of Process; Electronically f Ie and sexve

same; Revise Pleading Index.

10/1'1/2014 MI, Review Request for Copies from RFT Txust; 0.30 hrs $5.00

Memo to fle; Revise Pleading Index.

10/17/2014 C1tC Review executed waiver of sezvice; Research 0.60 hrs $1 G5.00

regarding waivers of service of process; Review

and execute notice of filing waiver of seiwice.

10/18/2014 CRC Review pleadings; Review znemorandurn 0.80 hrs $220.00

regarding priority issues. ~ ~~ ___...
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10/22/201 A~ AKA Review draft of Motion in Opposition to -9:~-iit~' $300.00

Witl~dz•aw k'u~.ds for Deposit;

- — - -- ~~

10/22/2014 ML Review multiple einai s re: heating an xs $90.00

PSP/MRC Debt Portfolio's Motion fio

Withdzaw; lZeview file; Email to Mr. Andaman;

Review Patriot Group's Request for Copies;

Revise Pleading Index; Merno to file;

Telephone Confe~•ence with Mr. Andaman and

Ms. Vickie Davis;

10/22/2014 CRC Review correspondence from R. Kelley 0.40 hrs $110.00

xe~az'dixig disbursement of fwlds; Review

correspondence to R. Kelley regarding

proposed joint motion/stipulation on order

disbursing funds; Review request for copies

~i•on~. the Patriot Group; Review finalized

relocation expenses suznmaty.

10/23/2014 MI., Review multiple emails re: non party subpoena 0.6Q hrs $90.00

a~~.d lease docunnents to owner and mortgagee;

Review file; Email to Kuz~t Balierle; Email to

Rob Kelley; Memo to f le. ~---c~ '^~

10/24/2014 CRC Review motion for extension of time; Review 0.70 hrs $X 92.50

ilrterrogatary and request for pzoduction

1~esponses; Research regarding motions to

compel.



10/27/201 AKA Review emails re: request far discovery 0.20 lus

extension,

10/27/2014 ML Review discovery respornses from The Patriot 0.80 hrs

Gxoup; Review RFT Tzust's Motion for

Extension a~Tirne; Telephone Confezence with

attorney's office for PSP/MRC Debt Portfolio

re: extension of time to respond to discovery

requests; Review ema~~ xe: same; Email and

memo to Mz. Andaman and Mr. Cozaley;

Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez,

10/27/2Q14 CRC Review second amended answer of Project 0.40 hrs

Orlando, LLC; Second amended motion for

payment of taxes and second amended

crass-notice of hearing; Review correspondence

from D. Armeni regarding discovezy eXtension

request.

"10/28/20 l4 AIWA. Review Response to rnartgagee's request for 0.60 hrs

withdraw.

10/28/2014 CRC Review car~espondence from D. Armeni 0.401~s

regaxdzng discovery extension; Review

discovery responses.

10/29/2014 AKA, Telephone conference w~tk~ attorney far Project 4,50 hcs

Orlando; Review discovery; ~nst~uctions to Ms.

Lindsay.

10/29/2014 ML, ~ extended telephone confezence with Mr, ~.501us

Aadariaan and counsel for ~'~oject Orlando re:

Interrogatories; Review same; Memo to file;

ReviO~ry pleadings and file re: outstandizag

discovery requests..and extensions of same.

~ 00.00

$120.00

$11.0.00

$300.00

l 10.00

$2Sp.0~

$75.00

10/30/201.4 AT~A Review discovery responses firozn CFX. 0.40 hz•s $200.00

~V/.71/LV 1~~

ti.~""__.

10/31/2014 MI, Review ex~aails and discovery responses from 0.601us $90.00

attorney fog• Project Orlando and New Rochelle;

Review ~ le and pleadings; Email to Kurt

Bauerle re: enclosures; Telephone Conference

with saxa~.e; Memo to file.

11/03/2014 ML Review documents from Pzoject Orlando and 0.80 l~rs $124.00

New Rochelle in response to discovery requests

and non-party subpoena; Conference wzt~ Mr.

Conley; Review Lease with Project Oxiando;

Eraai1 and memo to Mr. King re: priority;

Review multiple Requests for Copies from

other parties in lawsuit regarding non-party

subpoena docurxzents.

11/03/2014 LDK ~t.eview additional lease documents received 0,401us X90.00

and assess significance as to ~x•iority against

mortgage.

11/04/20I4 AKA Iz~st~uctians to Ms. Lindsay Ra: discovery items Q.301us $1.54.Q0

received by Project Orlando.

11/04/201~~ .l~.l<r1 Review disco~vezy fi~n1 prior parties; 1.20 ha•s $600.00



Instructions to Ms. Lindsa~R~: Ms. Davis'

contention
• Instructions

to Mr. King,

11/04/2014 AKA Legal research Re: lease xenewal vs. novation 1.30 hrs X650.00

and other matters; Instructions to Mr, King and

Mr. Conley.

11 /04/2014 AKA Review alleged lease in 2007; Telephone 0.40 hz;s $200.00

conference with Vickie Davis; Instructions to

Ms. Lindsay; Legal research Re: lease renewal,

authentication, and forgery.

11/0~/201~4 :ML Review emails re: priority as result of change in 2,5Q lu•s '375.00

lease teirns; Review Lease with Project

Orlando; Emails to/from Ms. Vickie Davis;

Review documents in response to Nc~n Party

Subpoena to New Rochelle; Draft Notices of

Compliance of Request for Copies froza~.

multiple parties; Memo re: same; Upload and

elechonically file and serve all Notices of

Compliance; Exaaail documents in response to

Requests for Copies; Review multiple emails

re: lease priority and lease renewals; Review

2006 and 20071eases; Revise Pleading Yndex.

~ 1 /04/2014 ML Tele hone onference with Ms. Vickie Davis Q.30 hrs $A 5.00

re:~~ Review same; Memo to file.

11./04/201 A~ CRC Review correspondence from B. Lynch 1.901u~s $522.50

regarding extension of time; Review additional

lease arrangement; Review correspondence

regarding priority issue; Research regarding

renewal issues and priority; Review

correspondence fiom V. Davis regarding

~ Review and execute vaxious

certificates a compliance as to xequests for

copies.

11/0/201.4 LDK Review law regarding lease renewals and the 1,30 h~•s $292.50

relevance .of such to priority and confer wifh

Mr. Andaman regarding such.

11/05/2014 AKA Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: handwritten 0.60 ~~~•s $300.00

expe~ t :forgery and relaied nnatters,

11/05/2014 ML Emails to/from Ms. Vickie Davis; Mcma to Mr. 1.30 hr•s $105.00

Andaman; Conference with. Mr. Andaman and

Mr. Conley re: outstanding issues including

new lease, tex~nnination of existing lease, and

relocation assistance; Ernails to/from Ms.

Davis; Review Eminent Aomain Manual re:

Lease texmiz~ation and related matters regarding

leasehold interests; Draft termination Xetfiez to

landlord; Email to Mr. Conley,

11/05/20 ~4 ML Review raaultiple websites and documents 0.80 ivrs $120.00

regarding forensic expert, Thomas Vast~•ick;

Memo to M~. Andaman.



11/OS/20~4 CI~.0 Research regarding rental payments, 1.101-us

compensability of leasehold interest and

unexezcised renewal, and terminatio~a of

leasehold inte~•est due to condemnation;

Inshuctions to M. Lindsey regarding rent and

vacation of property letter.

11/U6/'L014 AKA Review memo fraraa Ms. Lindsay re: lease 0.20 hrs

tei~nination letter.

11/06/2014 ML Review ~rnai Ms. Vickie Davis re: 0,50 hrs

Revise lease termination

lettex•;1V1emo to Mr. Ardaman.

~ X /Q6/2014 CRC ~' Research regarding lease texminatioil; Review Q.401us

an:d xevisions to lease tet~mination

correspondence; Review eurriculuxxa vitae and

fee schedule fox handwriting expert.

11/07/2014 ML Telephone Conference with Rob Ke11ey's office 0.50 kus

re: additional extension to respond to discaveiy

requests; Emails to/fiam same; Conference with

Mr, Andaman; Review email and letter of intent

frozxz Ms. Vickie Davis re:~
;Email to Mr. A~daznan and Mr.

Conley.

11/p7/2014 CRC Review correspondence from C. Boyd 0.50 k~xs

regarding extension of time to answer•

discovery; Review coaxes ondence from V.

Davis regardin~ Review letter of

i~atent. ...~--- ~~ 
....

.~-k:66-~rr~....

0.60 hx•s

$302.50

~~ oo.ao

$75.40

$110,0O

~~s.ao

$137.50

$150.()

$300.00

11/11/2014 ML Revise lease termination letier; Conference with 0.601us $90.00

Mr. A~•daznan and Mr. Conley; Ernails. to/from

Ms. Vickie Davis.

11/11/2014 CRC Review and revisions to lease termination letter. 0.20 hrs $55.00

-~ 1 ~1~241 ~ .AQL._.__.._.._
- e -~~:5-_-~ _w____..._._~225; f)8--

11/1 /2014 AI~1 Telephone coz~farence with appraisez Re: 0.801~x•s $400.00

improvements and new cost of constrruction;

Instructions to Ms. Lzndsay Re: same;

instructions to Mr. Cozaley and Ms. Lindsay Re:
-

review of documents from Mortgagees and

leaders; Review pleadings.

11/14/2014 M~, Conference with Mr. A~dano.an re: Vickie Davis' l .50 ht•s $225.00

communications and meeting with Debra

Reddicic, forgery expert, and related xxiatters;

~ X/1 ]./2014 AKA Conference with Mr. Conley and Ms. Lindsay

re: lease tez7mination letter.



Review forgery expez~t qualifications; Review
Respondents' responses to our discovery

requests; Email and memo to Mr. Conley;

Conference with 1VIr. Conley; Telephone

Conference with forensic/forgery expexC xe:
lease; Memo to file.

11/14/2014 ML 'Telephone Con£e~•ences with Ms. Vickie Davzs 1.001~rs $1SQ,00

re:
onference wifi x•. Andaman;

'Memo to file; Review discovery x~ec~uests to and

responses from multiple respondents; Review

multiple emails re: same; Telephone

Confexence with appraiser re: ~•eplacement cost

expert.

11/14/2014 CRC Review response of PSP/MRC to first set of 0.80 hrs $220.00

interrogatories and first request foz production;

Preparation of correspondence to oppasi~.g

counsel regarding document production and

inspection; Review correspondence fiom C.

Kellex regarding response to xequest for

production; Review correspondence fionr~ R.

Kelley regarding diseove~y document

inspection.

11/17/2014 ML, Review Notice of Appearance and Email 1.50 hrs $225.Q0

Designation Notice frozxx Matt Simring; Email

and inst~uctzons to Ms. Gonzalez, Revisa

Service List; Review email from attornaey far

Project Orlando; Revzew emails from Mr.

Ardarnan and cost estimate contractor, Al

Angus; Telephone Conference with Ms. Vielci~;

Email to Al Angus; Review emails firozn. ~VTi•.

Conley and I~ux~t Bauerle re: responsive

discovery documents; Review documents;

Memo to Mr. Conley.

11/17/20I4 ML Telephone Conference with forgery expex•t; 0.30 Ius $45.00

Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez.

11/17/2014 CRC Review correspondence from K. Bauexle 0.~0 hx•s $110.O0

regarding document production; Review notice

of appearance of special counsel and notice of

designation of email addresses; Review _~--.~

Expressway Authority rules regasdzng ~`
lcompensation for relocation. ¢ ~

11./18/2014 AKA Review multiple discovery responses; -k~"s $450. 0

Conference with Mr. Conley Re: needed

discovery wozk; Review c-mails and

information and estimates from Vickie Davis;

~..~~`

11/].8/201.4 ML R.zview emails mid estimates from contractors ~ 's $I 50.00



for fencing and related impxovernents; Emails

tolfrom Mx. Andaman;

Create

chaxt o~ al1 expenses.

11/18/2014 CRC Telephone confere;~ce with D. Armeni

rega~•ding arrangements for document

production.

11/1 x/201 ~ AKA Conference with handwriting expert;

Confezence with Mr. Conley Re: strategy;

instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: discovery and

additional signatures of Vickie Davis.

11/19/2014 IvtL Review multiple documents with Ms. Davis'

signature and pxepare for meeting with forensic

document/forgery expert; Attend lneetxng with

samie; Conference with Mr. Andaman; Mexno to

file.

12/03/2014 MT, Review discovery requests served upon Project

Orlando by CFX for Parcels 2S7 and 267;

Email and memo to NIr. ~rdama~. and Mr.

Conley.

].2/04/2014 ML Review disc of documents fxorn. The Patriot

Crroup, LLC; Mema re: same.

12/04/2014 ML Review emails and sketches from cast expert,

Al Angus.

].2/04/2014 CRC Review notice of service of interrogatories,

interrogatories to Project Orlando, and second

request fox production to Project Orlando.

12/05/20] 4 AIWA E-nnail from eontractoz Re: building sketches;

Inst~uctians to Ms. Lindsay Re: cross field

location nnatters and status of numerous

matters.

12/OS/201~ ML ~ ----- ==~~,•~ ..a..ri..,r ,.A. ,~ „4_,.~,:.

eview file; Email to

Ms. Vickie Davis; Telephone Conference with

same; Conference with Mr. Axdarnan; Memo to

file.

12/OS/2Q 14 CRC Review interrogatories and request for

production to Central Florida Expressway

Authority. ,

12/08/204 ML Einails to/from Ms. Vzckie re:
Revie~ex~ recezpts;

Review ennail and replacement cost new

estunates fiom Al Angus.

12/08/2014 CRC Review correspondence from A, Angus and

attachments regarding leased property sketches,

buildings and site preparations.

12/09/2014 ML Emails to/from Ms. Vicl~ie Davis; Review

memo from Mr. Ardatn.an re; original version of

20071ease firozn landlord; Review file.

0.10 hrs

1.20 hrs

2,00 l~rs

0.30 hrs

1.50 hrs

Q.20 hrs

0.301us

0.601us

r~
~..-0~irs

030 Y~rs

o.~o ~s

0.44 hrs

0.30 }us

$27.50

$b00.00

$300.00

$45.00

:225.00

$30.00

$82.50

$30.00

$l S0.Q0

$82.50

~~as,ao

$l 10.00

`45.00



12/10/2414 ML Review Rules of Civil Procedure xe: inspection 1.00 hrs $150.00

and copying of documents; Review 2007 Lease

•Agreement with Projecfi Oxlando, LLC; Dxaft

Second Request for Production to same.

12/10/2014 CRC Review and revisions to second request for Q.30 hrs $82.50

production; Research regarding scope of

examinatiai~ of documents,

12/16/2014 AKA. Review pleadings from fender to Project O.SO hrs $250.00

Orlando; Xnstructions to Ms. Lindsay and Mz~.

Conley.

12/16/201 ML Review RFT Trust discovezy requests 0.40 hxs $60.00

propounded upon Project Orla:tzdo; Instructions

to Ms. Gonzalez..

12/17I201A AKA Telephone conference with contractor; Review 1.20 h~•s $600.00

contractor's docunci.ents; Telephone call to

appraiser; Instructions to ~VIr. King Re:

pleadings and election of xemedies and mutual

claims; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re;

business damage claim.

12/17/2014 ML Telephone Conference with appraiser re: real 0.2~ hrs $30.00

estate damages and valuation and related issues;

Me~n.a to Mr. Ardannan.

12/17/2014 CKC Review inter~•ogatories, requests for admission, 0,30 hrs $82.50

and request to produce propounded by RFT

Trust upon Project Ozlando, LLC.

l.2/18/201~ AKA Legal research Re: election of remedies, 0.90 hrs $4SO.U0

applicability and potential amendment of

pleadings. ,....~ (~ '.~`...

~~~~:~``~
`~,.. - -

~.

12/23/2014 LDI~. Review statute, case law, and IRS opinions as 2.10 ltirs $472.50

to tax status a~various categories of awards in

errzix~ent domain and advise Mr. Ardannan.

Ol /05/2015 A1~A Revie~vv Response to Request for Produce and 0.~0 ~a~•s $200.00

Notice of Sexvice of Interrogatories;

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay and Mr. Conley,

01/05/2015 CRC Review Project Orlando's response to 0.40 hrs $110.00

Petitioner's inte~xogatories and request for

production.

01/06/201 S ML Eznails to/from attorney for Project Orlando ra: ~.301us $45.00

Answers to CFA Interrogatories; Review

Answex•s; Memo re: sanne.

01/07/2015 CRC Review petitioner's response to Project 0.30 hrs ;682.5

Orlando's request for production.

al/Q8/2015 ML ReviewPraject Orlando's Answers to CFX Q.A~O lu•s $G0,00

Intei~ogatories; Review CFX Response to

Project Orlando's Request for Production;

Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez.

O1/U9/2015 AILA Interrogatories Answers from pa~~ties; O.SO hrs $250.00



Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re: same.

01/09/201 S ML Review CFX Answers to Project Orlando's
Intei~ogatories; Review Stipulated Finai
Judgement for Kager Farm; Emails re: same.

O 1/09/201. S CRC Review Expressway .A,uthoxity's Answers to
Inte~~rogatories of Project Ozlando, LLC;
Review stipulated final judgment as to
respondents A. Ka~er and A. Kag~r, Jr.;
Review admissions, interxagatoxies, and request
£or producrian propounded by R.F'T Trust upon
The Patriot Crroup; Review discovery
pxopound~d by R.FT Trust.

01/15/2015 CRC Review stipulated final judgment; Review
discovezy requests,

01/20/2015 AIWA Review memo from Ms. Lindsay xe:
depositions and communications with Kurt
Bauerle.

01/20/2015 ML Review Notice of Service of Project Orlando's

0.6Q lus

0.70 hrs

0.40 lu•s

0.40 ~x~s

1.00 lus

Answers to RFT's Interrogatories; Review
Response to Request fog• Adnnissions; Review
email fiom Mr. Conley xe:.Answers; Emails
to/from Kurt Bauarle; Review Notice of Taking
Deposition of CFX engineer, Glen Fressixnone;
Review email fro~x~. Mr, Conley re: attendance
at same; Telephone Conferezzce with Kurt
Bauerle; Email and memo to Mr. Arc~aman and
Mr. Corley.

O 1 /20/20 ~ 5 ML Revzew Stipulated Final Judgz~aent as to A1~red 0.60 lus

Kager; Review multiple discovery requests
propounded by RFT Trust to The Patriot Group
and PSP/N.[RC Debt Portfolio; Memo re: sanne.

01/20/2015 CRC Review notice of service of answers to 0.401~z•s

inteixogatories from Project Orlando to ~tFT .
Trust, review response of Project Orlando to
RFT Trust's f xst request for admissions;
Review answers to interrogatozies; Review
notices of tatting deposition.

01/21/2015 ML Review Project Orlando's Response to RFT"s O.SO kus

Request for Admissions and Answers to
Interrogatories; Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez;
Emails to/from Kurt Bauerle; Revise Pleading
Index.

O1/2l /2015 CRC Review notice of taking deposition of C. Lee; 0.401us

Review docuzxa.ents ~espansive to discovery
requests.

01/27/2015 CRC Review discovery responses. 0.20 hrs

01/28/2015 CRC Review order directing payment of taxes and 0.40 ~~rs
filing of certificate of service regarding same;
Review joint motion far entry oi'stzpulated
order of taking and orders of talci~g as to

$90.00

$192.5

$l 10.00

~Zoa.00

$150.00

$90.OU

$:1.10.00

~~s.ao

9~l 1.0.00

$SS.00

$110.00



parcels 2S7 and 267. .

01/29/215 CRC Review notices of taking deposition. 0.20 l~xs $55.00

02/02/201 S ML Telephone Conferences with attorney's office 1.Oa hrs $150.00

for The Patrzot Group re; discovery responses

fiom Project. Orlando, PSP/MRC and RFT

Trust; Review file anal pleadings; Emails

to/from Loxx Spangler.

02/43/201 S ML Review multiple Requests for Copies from The 0, 80 hrs ~ 120.00

Patriot Group; Review file and pleadings;

Emails to/froma ~4Ir. Conley,

02/03/2x15 CRC Review raaultiple requests for copies from the 0.20 hrs $55.00

Patriot Gz•oup; Ins#~uctions to 1V~. Lindsey

zegarding responses to same.

02/Ofi/20l S 1VIL Review discovery responses; Instructions to Q.301us $45.00

Ms. Gonzalez.

02/06/20 ~ 5 CRC Review response to request to produce; Review 0.50 bus $137.50

notice of compliance; Preparation of

correspondence to D. Armeni regarding

discovery responses.

02/09/201 S CRC Review file materials and motion for extension 0.60 hrs ~fi 10.5.00

of time; rteview documents responsive to

Davis' fist request for production; Instructions

to M. Lindsey regarding responses to requests

for copies; Review rnohon for rek~earing an

order of taking.

02/10/201 S ML Review memo from Mr. Conley re: Requests 0,50 hrs $75.00

for Copies and documents to other parties;

Review discovery documents.

02/10/2015 ML Revier~v memo from Mr. Conley xe: discovery 1.50 h~•s $225.00

requests, responses and requests for copies;

Review pleadings; Draft emails to counsel far

The Patriot Group, PSP/MRC Debt Portfolio,

and RFT Trust; Review pxzox emails to counsel

for The Patriot Group re: documents produced

by Project Orlando; Draft Notice of

Compliance; Upload and electronically file anal

serve same; Revise Pleading Index; Review

notice r~gardzx~g e-service; Revise Service List

to remove counsel for Alfred Kagex.

02/10/201 S CRC Revie~uv and execute notice of compliance with 0.101~rs $27.50

request i'oz copies; Review election by Z.

Broome to be removed from service list.

02/l. l /20 ] 5 AKA Review pleadings and notice from CFX; 0.~~0 hz•s $200.00

Ynstructions to N1r, Conley and ~VIs. Lindsay,

02/1 ~/2Q15 ML Review and revise emails to counsel for other 0..50 hrs 475.00

Respondents re: discovery documents; Review

file re: previously produced docuzxients; Email

and memo to Mr. Conley,

02/1 U201. S CRC Review correspondence fronn B. Lynch to 0.60 hrs $1 G5.00

Judge Thaxpe, proposed o~de~ denying



rehearing, and motion. for rehearing; Review

and revisions to cox~•espondence regarding

discovery; Reviev✓ amended notice of deposit
and notzces of deposit for the parcels; Review

correspondence from C, Keller regarding

discovery responses.

02/12/2015 ML Review multiple ezxiails re: documents in 0.401~c~s $60.00

response to multiple discaveiy requests from

other Respondents; Review email from NIr.

Conley; Mema to file,

02/12/2015 CRC Pxe~azatiQn of correspondence to R. Kelley 0.50 1~s $137.50

regarding discovery; Preparation o:~

coi~espondence to M. Sirruing regarding

discovery; Telephone conference with D.

Arxneni regarding discoverry; Review

co~~respondence from R. Kelley regarding

production o£ documents; Review

correspondence from. M. Simring regarding

discovery issues.

02/13/2015 ML Review email fronn counsel far RFT Trust re: 0.401us $60.00

discovery response; Review Notices of Deposit;

Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez.

Q2/13/2015 ML Conference with Mx. Conley re: public 0.401us $60.00

disclosure requirement under Chapter 2$6,

Florida Statutes; Revie~c~v requirement and

Vickie Davis` d/b/a entity info~~mation; View

Division of Corporations website.

02/13/2015 C1ZC Research regarding section 286.23, Florida 0.60 hrs $165.00

Statutes, regarding disclosure of beneficial

interests; Review Florida Attorney General

Opinions regarding same; Preparation of short

mezno~andurn regarding sa~xae.

02/16/20 S CRC Review response to request for admissions, 0.30 hrs $82.50

answer to interrogatories, and response to

request to ~aroduce by PSP/MRC to RFT Trost.

02/20/2 15 ML Review discove~~y responses from PSP/MRC O.SO lu~s $75.00

Debt Portfolio propounded by TtFT Trust;

Review email from Mr. Conley xe; request for

copies; Draft Request for Copies.

02/23/2015 CRC Review ~•espanse to request to produce, 0,40 bus ~l 10.00

response to zequest for admissions, and notice

of service of answers to intei~ogatories firozxx the

Patriot Group from RFT TYust; Instructions to

M. Lindsey regarding same.

02/24/20 L 5 CRC Revie~c~v interrogatory responses and response to 0.30 hrs $82.50

requests fox admissions propounded on the

~'a~iiot Group.

02/26/2015 CRC Review notice of appeal of order of talci~g and 0.20 hrs $55.00

exhibits.

02/27/2U 1.5 ML Review Project Orlando's Notice of Appeal of 0.20 hrs $30.00

Order o~Takiilg for Parce12d7; Instructions to



Ms. Gonzalez.

03/Q3/20] S ML Review Patxiot Group's responses to RFT's O.SO his $75.00

discovery requests; Insfiuctions to Ms.

Gonzalez.

03/Q4/2015 ML Review DGA's Acknowledgement ofProject 0.10 hrs $15,00

`` Orlando's appeal regarding order of tal~~ng for

Paxce1267,

03/09/205 CRC Review motion for case management U.20 hrs $SS.00

conference.

03/l Q/201 S CRC Review correspondence from B. Lynch 0.20 hrs $55.00

r~gardiz~g coordination of case management

conference.

03/12/2015 CRC Review unopposed motion for exfiension of time U.201us $55.00

to file brief

03/~ 8/201 S CRC Review unopposed motion to correct case style. 0,101u~s $27.50

43/24/2015 CRC Review proposed case management order; 0.30 h~•s $82.50

~~s~iuctions to M. Lindsey regarding same;

Preparation of cai~respondence to J. Spoonho'ur

regarding same.

03/27/2015 CRC Preparation of coi~esponde~ce to J. Spoonhour 0.60 hrs $165.00

regarding proposed case nr~anagement order;

Review correspondence from J. Spoonhour

regarding same; Telephone conference with b.

Armaeni regarding pending discovery; Review

f le materials; Telephone conference with K.

Baurlie regarding case ma~aagement order

proposal. .

03/30/201.5 AKA E-mail.and,communications firoxnproperty 0.50 hrs $250.00

owners' attoxney and Expressway Authority's

attorney; Conference with Mr. Conley Re:

same; ~iistructions to Ms. Lindsay.

03/30/201 S CRC Telephone conference with K. Baurle regarding p.20 hrs $SS.00

case rnanagenaent order. .-.-.. /, C,~ t---~~

OA~/02/201 S AKA Telephone conference with appraiser Re: s $600,00

strategy and numbers; Instructions to Ms.

Lindsay Re: outline for discussion with attorney

fai property owner; Telephone conference with

Charles Cawkhra Re:
personal property; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay

Re: acquisition; Mema to file; Review portions

of file,

04/02/2015 AKA Telephone con£exence with appraiser anal 1.50 hrs $750.00

personal propex ty expert; Instructions to Mr.

Conley Re: original of claim, lease by property

owner and z elated matters; Review portions off'

pleadings and schedule.

0 /02/2015 ML Extended telephone conference with Mr. 1,50 hrs X225.00

Ardarnan and appraiser; Telephone Conference

with equipment and fixtures expert; Review

file; Eii~.ail to Ms. Vickie Davis.



OA/06/201,5 AKA Telephone conference with attorney for

Expressway Authority Jirn Spoonhour Re:

extension on business damage claim, lease

interest, acreage for parcel 197 and additional

subparcel; Instructions to Ms, Lindsay; Review

pleadings; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re:

communications with Vickie Davis as well as

Charles Cawthra; Review portions of appraiser.

04/OE/2015 ML Draft Second Request to Produce to Pzoject

Orlando re: o~igina120071ease; Prepare Exhibit

to same; Emails to/froz~a Ms. Vickie Davis;

Review file and cost estirz~ates prepared by Al

Angus; Emails to equipment and fixture

appraiser; Telephone Conference with Ms.

Davis; Revise Second Request to Produce;

Upload ar~d electronically file and sexve same,

Revise Pleadzng Yndex,

0/06/2015 CRC Review initial brief and appendix to same;

04/p7/2015 AI~.A. Conference ~c~vith Ms. Lindsay and Mr. Conley

Re: preparation fox• conference call with

property owner's attorney.

0 /07/2015 CRC Review correspondence from K. Bauerle

xegaxding planning issues, case rnanagemez~t

order, ar~d request for production.

04/09/2015 AKA. Emails and instructiorns to Ms. Lindsay re:

discovery requests.

04/09/2Q15 ML Emails to/from, Mr, Andaman re: discovery

xequest regarding lease with Project OxXando;

Review file,

04/09/201. S C1ZC Revier~v p~~evious discovery requests; Review

voicemail transcription from Crystal wish R.

Ke11ey's office xegardin~ document pxoduction;

Review documents produced by Project

Orlando; Review conespondez~ce frdrn K.

Baurle regarding telephone conference;

P~•eparation of cozx espondence to M. Baiule

regarding teiephane conference,

()4/10/2015 ML Review emails re: additional discovery request

to Pxoject Orlando re: documents relating to

lease with Project Orlando; Memo to file;

Emails to/fiom Mr, Andaman re: case law on

relocation costs and business damages; Review

Systarn Components case; Email re: same;

Review additional em.ails.

09~/X3/20I5 AKA Telephone conference with appraiser• Re: real

estatei~si~■r~irr~~claim and fees and
costs; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Rc:

diseove~y; Review draft case za~.anageinent order•

by CFX attorneys; Telephone conference with

attorney foz• Project Orlasido; Instz~uctions to

Ms. Lindsay Re: coxnrnunication r~vith Vickie

1.20 hx•s

1,2Q hrs

0.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0,20 hrs

0.201us

O.GO lus

0.70 hrs

J~ ~..

~~~̀r
s

$600.00

$180,00

$165.00

$300.00

$82.50

$100.00

$30.00

$165.00

$ l OS.00

X1,000.00



04/13/2015 CRC

04/14/2015 AKA

X4/14/2015 CRC

04/15/201 S AKA

04/15/201 S ML

04/15/201 S CRC

04/16/2Q15 LDI~

~ lease agreement with

New Rochelle Holdings; 'reparation of

correspondence to K. Baurle regarding

eonfeaence call;

Davis; Telephone conference with and e-anaii to

Vickie Davis; Instauctians to Mr. Conley and

Mr. I~.ing Re: successive automatic renewals; 'rlr.~

Review prior e-mails Re: sazzae.

Prepaication of correspondence to M. Simring 2 hrs

regarding discovery;

Telephone

conference with M. Bauerle and K. A.rdazxxan

regarding strategy and various claims;

Inst~uct~ons to L. King regarding vitability of

claim; Research regarding leasehold interests

and unilateral right of tei7nination; Review

eo~~res~ondence from J. Spooz~laaur regarding

accumulated attorneys' fees a nd expert fees.

E-mail fiom Vickie Davis; Instructions fo Mr.

Conley and Ms. Lindsay Re: documents to be

provided to Expressway Authority.

Review lease and arne~dtx~ent to lease

documents and insurance declarations page;

Discussions with M. Lindsey regardin same.

E-mails from and to Ms. Davis Re:

~; Telephone conference wi~li attorney for

Project Orlando; Conference with Mr. Conley

Re: strategy and case naanagern.ent order request

by CFX atloxney.

Review Request for Production to Vickie Davis

from CFX; Emails re: same; Revise Pleading

Index.

Review file materials; Review lease agreement

and amendxn.ent to lease agreement; Review

correspondence frozxz V. Aavis regardin

Revzew cot7espondence fxoxn D, Reddick

regarding clarification acid pofentiaX double

payment issue; Review and re~isioz~s and

p~•eparation of redline of proposed agreed case

managennent order; Telephone conference with

K. Bauexle and K. Ardanr~an regarding proposed

case management order and further handling;

Review request for production from CFX

directed to Davis; Review documents produced

by PSP/MRC.

Review law rega~•ding compensation fox

leaseholds in condemnation proceedings, and

tYze degree to which lease renewals or options to

renew are co~ripensable. Prepare legal

0.60 l~rs

0.40 I~rs

O.CO hY•s

0,50 hrs

1.G0 ln•s

1.50 hrs

$632.50

;~3 00.00

9~ 110.00

$300.00

$75.00

$440.00

$337.50



memorandum on the subject.

04/17/201.5 AKA E-mails frazxz CFX attorney; Instructions to 1V~Ts. 0.60 hrs $300.00

Lindsay and Mr. Conley; E-mail to CFX

attorney and Pjoxect Orlando attozney; Review

portions of file.

04/17/2015 AKA. k'tu-ther e-nnails to and from attoi~ey for CFX; O.SO hrs $250,00

Review and revise proposed order; Canfer~nce

with Mx. Conley.

04/17/2015 AKA Additional e-mails fiam attorney fox CFX; 0.601us $300.00

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay and Mr. Conley Re:

strategy, ti~in~ and proposed order.

04/17/201 S CRC R~sea~•cl~ zegarding bi~uzcation; Review 1.90 hz~s $522.50

correspondence from J. Spoanhour and K.

Bauerle regarding case managezxxent and

scheduling; Review notice of hear ing; Review

correspondence fron:~ J. Spaonhour anal K.

Bauerle zegarding bifurcation and hearing

dates; Research regarding compensability of

leasehold interests; Review proposed agreed

order and stipulation on. pretrial order and

bifurcation; Review memorandum regarding

compensability of leasehold interest; Review

motions to set jury t~•ial.

0/17/2015 LDK Research effects of lessor's right to terminate 1.40 hrs $315.00

lease on lessee's right to paY~ticipate in

condemnation proceedings, and draft legal

xaaemarandum. Confer with Mx. Conley on the

subject.

04/20/201 S ML Review Mamoxandum regarding lessee 0.20 ku•s $3.00

coznpensability issues; Review xx~ultiple emails

on business damage claim, bifurcation and

hearing on same.

04/20/2015 CRC Research regarding coxnpensability of leasehold 2.70 hxs $742.50

interests; preparation of memorandum to

opposing counsel regarding connpensability of

leasehold renewals; Revier~v previous

memorandum regarding same; Review .

correspondence from K.. Bauerle and J.

Spoonhaur regarding hearing time for case

management conference; Review
correspondence fronn J. Spaonhour regarding

hearuig tixx~e updates; Review amended notice

of hearing; ~teview diseoveiy responses;

Instructions i:o M. Lindsey regarding discovery

issues aid lease teri~aination.

04/21/2015 AKA Review Request to Produce from CFX; O.SO lus $250,Q0

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay.

04/21/2015 AKA Conference with Mr. Conley Re: legal research 1.00 l~rs $500.00

regarding right to lessee compensation for

automatic renewals; Review research Re: same.

04/21/2015 AIWA Review Motions fox hearings on setting tz•ial; O,GO lus $300.00



instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re:

co~amunications with, Vickie Davis.

04/21/2015 ML Review email re: discovery response; 0,50 l~rs $75.00

Conference with Ivor. Conley re: lease

ternunatxon letter to New Rock~elle; Review

prior emails and lease termination sent to Ms.

Davis; Telephone Conference with Ms. Davis;

E~aaail and memo to Mr, Andaman and Mr.

Conley.

04/21/201 S ML Review documents froxx~ PSP/MRC Debt 1.60 hrs $240.00

Portfolio in response to Request for Production;

Emails to/fiozxa counsel for The Patriot Group

re: Request for Copies; Draft Notice of

Compliance; Upload and electronically file and

serve same; Conference with Mr. Conley;

Revise Pleading Index; Review 1Vlotions to Set

Txzal and Amended Notice of Hearing on same;

Email to Ms, Gonzalez; Revise Pleading Index.

04/21/2015 CRC Review and revisions to rnemorandu~ to K. 2.~lO leas ~6Ei0.00

Bauerle; Discussions with K, Andaman anal M,

Lindsey xegarding strategy and fiu~ther claim

handling; Instructions to M. Lindse regarding

fallow-up with client regarding

• Review correspondence to C.

Keller aegarding request #'or copies; Review and

finalize cextiftcate of compliance far PSP's

request fog copies; Review doctuxi.ents produced

by PSP; Review answer brief of CFX.

04/22/2015 ML Review Request for Production from CFX; 1.00 hrs $1.50.00

Review f le; Draft Response; Email and memo

to Mr. Conley.

04/25/2015 CRC Review interrogatories and second O.A~O hxs $110.00

interrogatories propounded on V. llavis;

Review notices of service; Instructions to M.

Lindsey regarding same.

04/27/2015 ML Revie~vv Notices of Service and Znte~~rogatories Q.70 ~~rs $145.Ofl

propounded upon Project Orlando and Viekia

Davis by CFX; Review fle; Memo to same;

Creafie new Pleadings folder and index; Emails

to/from CFX's Brendan Lynch.

04/27/2015 CRC Prepa~~ation of responses and objections to x.20 hrs $330.00

request for production; Review correspondence

from B. Ly~ach regarding intexxogatories;

Research regarding business dannages and

iequixernents for establishment of a business;

Review correspondence to K. Bauerie regarding

authority fox position on zeal estate entitlement;

04/28/2015 ML Review Interrogatories from CFX; Emails J..S4 hrs $225.00

to/fronn Brendan Lynch; Review file; Draft

Answe~•s; Emails to/froxrx Mr. Andaman re:

documents needed from Vickie Davis; Email to



Ms. Davis; Email to Mr, Conley.

04/28/2015 CRC Review coi~espondence fiozn B. Lynch 1.20 hrs $330.00

regarding cancellation of heax•ing and new

hearing availability; Preparation ofresponse

and objections to xesponse to CFX's first

request for production; Research regarding

work product doctrine pxotection;lZeview

correspondence fiam K, Bauerle regarding

scheduling issues; Review portions of proposed

response to first interrogatories propounded

upon. Davis.

Q~/29/20 ~ S AID Review emails from Ms. Lizzdsay anal 0.30 hrs $150.00

in.st~uctians to same re: hea~•ing aaad tz•ial. , C.~. ~.

04/29/2015 ML Review multiple emails ze: hearing on setting s $75.O0

zeal estate claims for trial;

Canfexe~ace with Mr, Conley; Review Notice of

Cancellation o~ S/18 Hearing and Notices of

~-~earing for 5/4 and 5/5 hearings; Ernails

fio/from Mr. Andaman; Revzew Mx. Conley's

email to B~~endan Lynch re: availability.

04/23/2015 CRC Review documents produced by CFX and 1.50 kus $412.50

pxoperry owner; Review interrogatox•ies;

Review 1;elepho~e message from B. Lynch;

Preparation of cox7espandence to B. Lynch

regarding availability; Review correspondence

fiom B. Lynch regardz~►g availability for
hearing to set trial date; Review correspondence

from K. Baue~•Ie regarding availability for

hearing; Review notices of hearing and notice

of cancellation of hearing; Review and

revisions to joint stipulation on bifurcation;

Insfructioz~s to S. Gonzalez regarding heaxxngs

and cancellations of sanne;

04/30/2015 AKA Review memo from Ms. Lindsay xe: discovery 0.30 hrs .$150.00

and ~res~onses,

05/01/2015 ML Review ale and prior eznails to equipment and 0.20~~ $30.00

fixttue expert; Conference with Mx. Andaman;
~Email to Charles Cawthra. _~. ~

OS/04/2015 AKA In.st~•uctions to Ms. Lindsay Re: additional rs $1,100,00

documentation and discovery related to request
;(
~~.,.~~

from Expressway Authority; Review calendar,

pleadings and status with respect to work effoxt

and trial and Motions for setting t~ialrl■~ for .--,!fir

valuation Attend ~;`

hearings oza xpressway Aut ority's Motion. to

Set Trial for Valuation r~~~

~iw ' Irnstructions to Ms.

Lindsay.

05/06/2015 AKA Conference with and instauctians to Ms. 0.20 lus $100.00

Lindsay ra: docu~ez~ts from Vickie Davis.

OS/OG/2015 ML Review Project Orlando's Response to Second 0..50 l~rs X75.00



Request for Production; Review production

request; Ernail and memo to Mr, Andaman a nd

Mr. Conley.

05/06/2015 ML Conference with Mx'. Andaman re; documents 0.201us $30.00

and response from Vickie Davis; Review file

and prior emails; Email to Ms. Davis.

05/0'x/2015 ML Email to Ms. Vickie Davis; Conference with 0.10 hrs $15.00

Mr. ,Ardarnan.

05!07/2015 M~., Conference with Mx. Axdaman re; dpcuments 0,20 hrs $3Q.00

and response from Ms. Davis; Email to Ms.

Davis.

05/08/2015 AKA Telephone conference with Vxclae Davis Re: 0.80 hrs $400.00

~~; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re:

'Vielrie Davis eomnnunications with Expressway

Authority.

05/08/2015 ML Telephone Co~n£erence with Mr. Ardatx~a~; and 0.30 hrs $45.00

Ms, Vickie Davis; Mema to file.

OS/l.1./2015 CRC Review coxx~espandence to V. Davis regarding 0.40 hrs $110.00

•Review response to request for

production regarding inspection of original

lease; Review amended ordez ova bifurcation,

05/12/2015 AK.A. Telephone conference with Vickie Davis Re: 0,80 hrs $440.00

Authority representative concerning itemization

and outstanding discovery; Instructions to Ms.

Lindsay; Instructions to N~~•. Conley,

05/12/2015 A~~A Review Response to Request to Produce; 0.30 lus $150.00

Iristruetions to Ms. Gonzalez.
~

05/12/201 S G~tC
l~z~ ~ ~ $40.00

Review motion for attorneys' fees, request for

oral argument, and reply brief of Project

Orlando; Pre~aratian of correspondence to V.

Davis regardin
Te ephone conference

with V. Davis an K, Andaman regaxding~

• Pr~paral:ion o~ letter for V. Davis

05/13/2015 MT Review emails re: Project Orlando's Response 0.50 l~rs $75.00

to Second Request fox Production and

coordination with counsel fox sax~ae to review

documents; Review email fironn Ms. Aavis~

Review documents.

OS/1.4/2Q15 AKA. Telephone confexences with Vickie Davis; 0.80 hrs ~;~oo.ao



E-mail to and fiom Vicl~ie Davis; Instructions

to Ms. Lindsay and Mr. Carley Re: response to

discovery,

OS/14/2U15 ML Review emazl i~e: discovery response to CFX;

Review and revise same; Email and memo to

Mr. Conley; Review ernails and m~ultaple

docuzxxents from Ms. Davis; Memo to file.

05/4/201 S ML

- -_"`~

OS/14/2015 CRC Revie~ev a~ad zevisions to request for production

response; Telephone conference with K.

Ardanaan and V. D vis re ardin
Review

corresponde~zce from V. Davis regarding

Review documents produced by V.

avxs ar response to request for production. .

OS/1,5/2015 AKA Review proposed discovery responses and

documents from. VxcXcie Davis; Instructions to

Ms. Lindsay; Review offex of judgment;

Instructions to Mr. Conley Re; same; Review

Request for Production of Documents and other

matters in response thereto.

OS/l. S/2015 AKA Review Request to Produce; Review and revise

Response to Request to Produce; Instructions to

~VIs. Lindsay; Review additional discovery

xequest and Offex of Judgment; Inst~uetions to

Mr. Caniey Re: sarr~e,

05/] S/201 S ML Review multiple emails re: documents

responsive to request for production; Revise

Response to CFX Request for Production;

Memo to NTr, Andaman; Instructions to Ms.

Gonzalez re: anspectidn of Project Orlando

document in response to request for production

and coorcdination with forensic document

expert; Revise Response to RFP; Upload and

electronically £ile and serve same; Revise

Pleading Tndex.

05/16/2015 CRC Review corres ondence to V. Davis regarding

~~

05/18/2015 CRC

Review pie ~ or ex and tri order fog•

valuation;
~; Review order on motions

in linnine; Prepa~atian of proposed

correspondence to V. Davis regarding

1.20 hrs

.50 hz•s

Q.7'0 hrs

2.00 hrs

1,40 hrs

1.00 hrs

O. I O lu s

1.~. ~s
Y~

$180.00

~``~s.00

$192.50

$ l ,000.00

$700.00

$150,00

$27.50

$495.00



Review offer of judgment statute and

casts statute; Review offer of judgment;

.r------,-.

Review coxrespondenoe from T. Spoanhour 1

regarding proposed case management orders.

05/19/2015 ML 0.2~}~us $34.00

Review email froxn~ ~

attorney for CFX re: review of documents in

response to production request.

0.5/2Q/20l S AKA Review portions of Charles Cawthra report; 0.40 hz•s X200.00

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay. ~ ~ ..

(~S 20/2015 CRC ~i'U''~ .~~'~ .00

`~-..

~, ~~►
05/21/2015 ML Review email and lease documenfis fiom 0.601us $90.00

attorney for Project Orlando; Review file;

Emails to/from Mr. Ardan~an.

05/21/2()15 CRC Review correspondence from K. Bauerle 0.401us $ l l p.00

regarding document pxoduction response;

Review attached original copzes of various

leases; Review portions of xelocation assistance

packet; Review offer of judgment.

05/22/20 ~ S AKA Review dxscoveiy responses; Instructions to Mr. 0.40 hrs $200.00

Conley and Ms. Lindsay.

OS/22/2015 ML Review multiple emails re: production of 2.00 hrs $300.00

documents and Answexs fio Interrogatories;

Ernails to/fiom~ Ms. Vickie Davis; Review file

and alI documents to be produced; Revise

Answers to Interrogatories; Reviavv emails from

Spoonhour re: docurx~.ez~t production review and

deposition of Vickie Davis; NZemo to Mr.

Andaman.

05/26/201 S AKA Review discovery request wit1~. respect to 1.40 hrs $700.00

Request to Produce and Interirogatories; Review

~-u1es; Review va~•ious definitions; Conference

with Mr. Conley and Ms, Lindsay Re:

responses and objections; Comrnunioations

from Vickie Davis; Telephone ca11 with

appraiser; Telephone call to equipment expert

Charles Cawthra; Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez

Re: communications with experts; Review

various reports and statutoay provisions.

05/26/2015 ~Kr1 Telephone conference with Charles Cawthra. 0.20 ku~s $] OQ.00

QS/26/2015 1-~KA Review Answers to Interrogatories; rns~iuetions 0.80 lus $400,00

to Ms. Lindsay; Review documents to be

produced to and discovery responses.

05/26/2015 ML Confcrcx~cc with Mr. Andaman and Mr. Conley 2.00 hz•s $3 00.00



re: discovery responses and production of

documents; Telephone Conference with

appraiser xe: Cawthra's report on moving

personal pxoperty and CFX's Offer of

Judgment; Tele~hane call and message to

Ck~arles Cavc~thra; Emails to/frornr~. Rick

Dreggo~•s; Prepare documents for production to

CFX; Emails xe: Answers to Interrogatories;

Revise same; Emails to/from and conference

with Ms. Vickie Davis.

05/26/201 S ML Conference with Ms. Davis re: documents in

response to CFX production and request and

Answers to Inter~agatoxies; Cvmplie

documents; P~•epare CD; Emails to/from CFX;

Upload and electronically file and serve

discovery response; Revise Pleading Tndex.

OS/26/20~5 CRC Preparation of inte~ogatory responses and

objections; Revier~v public reoords privilege for

eminent daz~aain business records; Review

documents responsive to request for production;

Instzuctians to M. Lindsey regarding discovery

responses; Research regarding business damage

issues; Review interrogatory responses of

Pzoject Orlando in response to Petitioner's

request; Review correspondence from B. Lynch

regarding document production; Review notice

of service; Review co~xespondence from K,

Bauerle regarding document inspection;

Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding same.

05/27/2015 AIWA Instructions to Ms. Lindsay and Ms. Gonzalez

Re: discovery and inspection of records.

05/27/2015 AKA. Connnnunications with attorney fox• Project

Orlando.

05/2'7/2015 AIWA Conference with Charles Cawthra, Allyn

Angus, Ms. Lindsay and Richard Dreggors Re:

1~l1~! offer of judgment;

Instrucfiions to Ms. Lindsay; Instructions to

~Rachard Dreggors Re: valuation issues and

strategy; Conference with Mx. Conley Re:

same.

05/27/201 S ML Conference with M~. Andaman an,d Mr. Conley

re: strategy and action items; Review file;

Prepare fox• and attend nr~eeting and telephone

conference with experts; Memo to ale re; action

items.

05/27/2015 CRC Review corzespondenee fiozn K, Bauexle

regarding coordination of document review and

inspection;

~~Discussion with K. Andaman and

1.50 kus

2.20 hrs

0.30 }us

0.3 0 h~•s

~~
1

~.

1.50 hrs

0.9

r ~J

$225.00

$605.00

$150.00

1,50.00

$500.00

$225.00

$247.50



M. Lindsey regaarding strategy and further

handling.

OS/28/201 S ML Review notes fxox~n meetings and conference Q. l~~.s-. $105.04

calis~ Ema'1 to Ms. Vickie Davis re:

~~~~~

~'~rr
OS/28/2015 CRC -- -- - $440.00

~I~-Review docurn:~ents produced in ~-'~

response to discovery xequests,~-- r O

05/29/2015 ML Review exaaails re: improvements made by Ms. 0.20 k~rs $30.00

Davis at subject property; Review file; Email to

appraiser.

05/29/2015 CRC Research regarding administrative res judicata, 0.801us $220.00

identities of cause of action, and collateral

estoppel.

06/01/2015 AI~~1. 2.0 ass's $1,000.00

Telephone
Yconference with appraiser Re: multiple issues; ~ G G

Instructions to Ms. Lindsay; Legal research Re:

subjective v. objective valuation of lease hold

interest; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re;

multiple cases; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay Re;

needed additional discovery xelated to

agricultural exemption and otk~er matters. (~ ~

06/01/2015 ML Extended telephone Conference with Mx. 1. •s $225.00

Andaman,. and appraiser

re; damages and valuation; Conference with

Mr, t~lydaman and Mr, Conley ae: strategy and

action items; Review Leases and others

documents.

O6/01/24J 5 CRC Review proposed case management orders and 0.40 l~rs $110.00

uniform orders entezed by court; Review

correspondence from B. Lynch regarding same.

OG/02/201 S ML Review Property Appxaise~ and Tax Collector 1.201vs $180,00

websites re; agricultural classificatiorn, taking

and remainder; Emails to/from Ms. Vickie

. ~ Davis re ;Review Pleadings re; estimate

of value goad fait. deposit and amounts;

Review Petition and Stipulated ~z•der of

Taking; Merno re: same.

06/03/2015 MI, Review prior production requests to Pzoject 1,OU lus $150.00

Orlando re; agricultural classification records

and docuzx~ents; Review same; Memo to Mr.

Andaman.

06/03/201, S ' LDK Legal research regarding valuation. of leasehold 1.90 lus $427.50

infierest.



x6/04/2015 AKA. Telephone conference with handwtx~iz~g expert;

Cox~~eze~ce wiil~. Ms. Lindsay Re: prior findings

and outsta:~c~ing zssaes and questions; Meeti~ag

with handwriting exert; Confexenc~ ~vuith

attorney for Project O~~Ia~xdo, I~tu~ Aauexle;

Memo to file; lt~~rie~v Alen .Aaagus' teport and

Vickie Davis' sunarna~.y o£ im~ro~vexnents;

Tnshuations to Ms. Lindsay.

06/04/2015 Mr, ~ Ro~vi~rn+ emazls xe; x~eeting with for~~xy expert

to i~tspect Vickie Davis ari~inal signature;

Review ~tIe and documents previa~as~y xev~ewed

by forgery expert; Travel to/frozaa atxd attend

meeting regarrding same; Re~vie~vv notes;

11~Iemaranduxn. to ~t~.

O6/0~/2.Q15 ML R.evxew Replacement CostN'e~uv estimates ~xorm

Al Angus; Revaevv ernails xe; improvements

constt~ueted and/or re~aia~ed by 1Vrs. Davis;

Telephone Canferenae ~vaith sata~.e; Memo to file

re; needed a~foxmation,

06/04/2015 LDZ~.. Legal xeseaxah regarding valuatio:~ n~' Ieasehald

zr~texest. s

Q6/0.5/?.0~ 5 AT~t~. Review legal res~axch R~: Expxessway`s Offer

of J'udgx~ent inclusive of more tlaa~ just

. business damages; ~te'view covimuniaa~.ons

with Vzc ' ith Ms. Lindsa

Q6/OS/2015 MC. Review memo ova ~easeholc~ interest and

valuation of same.

OG105/2015 r,DK Legal reseaack~ xegar~ing valua~.ox~ of leasehold

interest.

p6110/2015 CRC R~vi~w cozrespnndena~ from B. Lynch

xegatcii.ng ,proposed case management xeports.

06/1 U? 01 S ]1~ Cox~'exe~ce with Ms, 'V~icicie Dais re:

• Review xna~s at~d drar~vings;

Revtew sprea sheets and xeceipts; Lmaai and

memo to 1VIx..A~tdan~~.n and Mx. Cox~.ley;

Multiple emaiXs i~e; O££ex of Judgment,

additional reimbu~setx~ernt check frons CFX and

xelated matters.

06/12/Z01S ASIA Revzew aid xevise~roposed email to

F,xpresswa _ Auth.ari from Ms, Vic~ae Aavis

OG/12/2015 ML

Review file; Re~vier~v spx~adsk~eets f~oin Ms,

p~~is re; casts of inapro~vermex~ts and iep~.i~s;

Calculate stone; Mega to Mr. Acdatx~azz; Enaails

2,2U huts

2, 00 his

$1,100.00

~3 00.00

1.201us ~~80.00

./ ~

~r.3~ $S17.50

O.CO kris $30Q,0~

0,20 Urs

(x.60 hrs

0.?0 kaxs

2.00 I~:S

O.~O lus

r

bus

$30.00

X135,00

;55,00

$300.00

$.?.,Q0.00

~x~o.aa



to/from same; Review proposed email to Ms.

Davis. r

Ob/1 /2015 CRC --- - $Z~p

r~ 
~J.i~` 

~.`~.,

~~ 
~~

Review damages it izations;

Review revised correspondence to V. Davis

regardiz~

OG/1S/201 S ML Review dra email ~xom Davis to 0.20 hrs ~ $30.00

Debra Reddick re:

Email to

Ms. Davis.

O6/1G/2015 r~I~A E~mails firo~ Expressway Authority attorneys 0,40 lets $200.00

and Project Orlando attorney; Instructions to

Ms. Lindsay and IVI~. Conley.

06/1GI2015 CRC Review correspondezace from K, Bauerle and B. 1 $49.5.00

Lynch regarding case zx~anagement orders; ,-

Reviewjudge's uniform case managezx~ent , ~,

ordexsKan~ proposed revised case management

orders; Research regarding adrninis~rative res

judicata,~l~i~w~~; claim and issue

preclusians; Review correspondence from B.

Lynch regarding potential settlement and status

meeting.

06/17/2015 AZ~A Review legal research Re: lease continuation I.SO k~rs $750.OQ

fox• valuation purposes and lease termination,

renewal issue; Review various cases;

Conference with Mr. Conley.

06/17/2015 ML Review Leases and case law on lease teirns, 0.60 hrs $90.00

priority, month to month and relafied issues;

Conference with Mr. Conley.

06/17/201 S ML Review Notice of Healing on CFX's proposed 0.20 hx~s $30.00

Case Management Orders; Review file; Email

and instructions to Ms. Gonzalez. ~ AU

06/17/2015 CRC Resea~•chxegzudin 3~0°~irs $1,045.00

valuation issues; Preparation for settlement

meeting; Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding

same; TZeview notice of hearing; Research

regaxding perpetual leases, compeansabzlity of

sax~e, and lease option renewals; Pxepare

materials and packet for settlement meeting.

06/18/2015 ML Conference with Mr. Conley re: lease renewal, 0.50 hrs $75.00

month to month tenancy and claixrxs/dan~.ages

regarding same; ~Z.eview case law.

Q6/18/2015 CRC Reseaxch regarding compeilsability o~'lease~ald 2,80 lus $770.00

iaaterests, lease terms and termination,

month-to-month tenancies; Review previous

lease arrangements; Review Commercial Lease



06/I9/201 S nr~

06/22/2015 AIWA

06/22/2015 AKA.

X6/22/201 S ML

06/22/2015 CRC

06/22/205 CRC

06/23/20 i S AKA

06/23/2p 1 S CRC

OG/2~/201. S ML

06/25/2015 AKA.

Txeatise; Research Florzda statutory provisions
regarding commercial leases.

Confer with Mr. Conley regarding lease 0,~0 hrs

termination provisions.
Conference with Mrc, Conley Re: valuation and 0.8 0 lu s

success of lease renewal; Further telephone
conference with appraise; Inshuctians to Ms.
Lindsay.
Telephone conference with appraiser Re: land, 0,70 hrs

valuation, approach and zssues and risks and
strategy; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay.

Conference with Mr. Conley re: business 0,30 hrs

damages versus valuation claim; Telephone
Conference with appraiser, Rick Dr~ggors.

Research regarding leasehold interests; Review 4.90 hrs

leases; Review documents fox potential
settlement meeting; Instructions to M. Lindsey
regarding same.
~s~~l~e~aa~di~g~e:~c~dz~-• 2.10 hrs

•c~.~; Review summaries of claims and
potential damages; Revzew expert reports
regarding fees accrued thus far; Telephone

conference with R. Dreggors regarding
valuation issues and case strategy; Research

'regarding perpetual royalties,

Review ale in preparation far meeting with 3.00 k~rs

Expressway Authority attorneys; Review

business damage offez; Review oas~ law, lease

extension, leases and related matters;

Instrcuctions to Ms. Lindsay Re: additional

information from contractor expert Allen /

Angus; Review expert fees and cosis. ~

Researck~ regarding leasehold valuation, 3. ;s

perpetuity issues,

~ ~..
Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding same.

z~~~

'Telephone conference with Vickie Davis R~: 1.¢ hrs

- - / ,~ ~

$170.0O

$400.00

$350.0

$45.00

$247.50

$577.50

$1,500.00

$1,017.50

$375.00

$SQ0.00



nstructions to Ms. Lindsay

06/30/2015 AIWA Telephone conference wifib. Vickie Davis Re: 0.401u•s $200.00

E-mail to Expressway
Authority attorney; Conference with Mr.

Conley Re: same.

07/06/201. S 1~K1~ Review information. fiam contractor; 0.~0 l~z•s $200.00

I~.struc~ions to Ms. Lindsay.

07/06/2015 ML Review email and revised/new cost estimates 0.80 ku•s $120.00

and sketch from Al Angus; Emails to/from Mr.

Ardaxnan; Conference with M~. Conley re;

proposed settlement to CFX; Review old cost

estimate and sketch and compare differences;

Memo to file.

07/07/201 S AKA Revier~v and xevise proposed case management 1.20 lays $600.00

order; Telephone call from CFX attorney Re:

same; Insh uerions to M~•. Conley Re; same,

07/09/201 S AKA Review and revise CFX's proposed Case 1.00 tars X500.(?U

Managernent Order.

U7/U9/2Ul S ML Review emails and Mr. Arclaman's xevisxons to 0.20 hz•s $30.00

CFX's proposed Case Management O~~der.

07/09/2Q 15 CRC Review amended notice of hearing, 0.10 hrs $27.50

07/14/201 S CRC Research regarding owner and leasehold 1.30 tars $357.50

interest holder's xzghfis to .testify during real

pxopez~ty valuation phase; Review order of

Motion for Reconsideration of Sua Spante

Order Dispensing with Oral Argument;

Revisions to pzopased case managezx~ent orders.

07/1 S/2d 15 ML Review and revise proposed Case Management a.701u•s $ l OS.00

Orders; Review emails.

Q7/16/2015 CKC Revisions and finalize proposed case 0,401us $1 lO,OQ

management report redlines; Review

coY~espondence from J. Spoonhour zegacding

same; Review coixespondence from D. Fody

regarding scheduling.

07/17/2015 CRC Review notice of oral argument. 0.10 his $27.50

07/20/2015 CRC Review order denying motion to reschedule oral 0.20 hrs ~SS.00

argu~n.e~.t.

47/2/2015 ML _ .. evise 1,,~hrs $150.00

Expert Fees/CostsChart; Emails to/from Mr. e~

Andaman; Review Agreed Order on ~

Subs~itutxon of Counsel for RrT Trust; Revise

Service List; Review multiple ernails re: case

management orders, revisions to same,~--

~ai~i~ and valuation trial; Meino to file.

07/30/2015 AKA Review letter from CFX attorney to Judge 0.801ars $400.00

Thorpe; Telepk~o~ne conference with Ms.



Lindsay aad Mx. Conley Re: multiple issues for -

upcaming nnatters.

07/30/2015 ML Review multiple emails re; revisions to Case 0.~0 lu~s $60.00

Management Oxdexs; Review file; Review

email re: research on leasehold interest.

p'7/30/2015 CRC Review coxres~andence from J. Spooz~our 3.~0 hx•s ;935,00

regarding revised case management ordexs;

Review revised case zz~anagement orders;

Preparation of carresponde~ace to J. Spoonhour,

K. Bauerle and B. Lynch regarding proposed

revisions to same; Review correspondence fiozn

K. Bauerle regarding case management orders;

Resea~•ch regarding undivided fee zule,

leasehold izaterests, month-to-month leases;

Review correspondence to Judge Thorpe

regarding case management orders and related

matters.

07/31/2015 AKA Communications v✓ith Mr. Conley Re: real 0.40 hrs X200.00

estate case management orde~~ and related

matters; Instructxans to Ms. Lindsay.

07/31/2015 CRC Review case management orders; Reseaxch 1.10 lays $3Q2.50

regarding separate hials and unity ox unit rule;

Preparation of mer~oxandum regarding same.

Q8/03/2015 LDK Prepare bench memoranda regarding leasehold 1.60 hrs $360.00

valuation evidence and separation of t~•ials,

08/0/2015 AKA Telephone conference with business damage 0.80 hrs $40p.00

expert; Conference wit~i Ms. ~,indsay; Review

information from AI Angus; Review e-nr~ails

from CFX attozney.

08/04/2015 AKA. Telephone confernc~ ~evith Mr. Conley and 0.40 h~•s $200.00

appraiser re: strategy and valuation.

08/04/2015 CRC Instructions to L. King regarding bench 1,~01us $440.00

naex~aoranda; Research ~~egaxding separate trials

and right to put on a valuation trial; Te~ephane

conference with K. Andaman and R. Dxeggox s

regarding strategy and fiirther handling of

valuation case; Review azx~en.ded nokiice of

hearing.

08/05/2015 LDK Draft bench memos re. trial severance and right O.SO lus $] 12.50

to put on leasehold valuation evidence.

x8/06/2015 CRC Review memoranda on sepa~•ate finials and fl.90 hrs $247.50

entitlement to prasellt valuat~an opinions and

evidence; Research regarding zx~atibn in limine

standards in. eminent domain proceedings; - - ,

Research regarding lease renewals and

valuation of'sazne.

08/1Q/2015 ML Revietx~ multiple emails re:~b ~~i ~ ~l~n•s- $60.00

fight to apporlioninent in ,--~ r,

~•ea1 estate valuatio~a; Review file; Memo to ~ J cam.

same.

Q8/l 0/2015 CIZC . ~ ~,. - ~z:s $632.50



,~ `~ij Review coi~respandence

from J. S~oonhour regarding tizx~eline for

approvals; Research regarding leasek~ald issues;

Review bench memoranda on separate trials

and ability to present leasehold case in

~raluation proceeding.

08/11/2015 ML Telepl~ane Conference with appraiser, Riclt 0,] 0 hrs $15.00

Dreggozs rs; valuation and apporkionment;

Memo to Mr. Axdaman.

08/1 ~ /20 ~ S CRC Telepho~ae conference with K. Ardaman and K. 0.701u s $192, 5 Q

Bauerle regarding appraisal and apportionment ~~

issues; Research regarding apportionment fee

issues. (~ d

08/12/2015 AK.A Reviev~r cases and case management oxders in •s $900.00

preparation for case rnanagem~nt order k~earing

on real ~~ (,~

property valuatioxi. U

OK/12/20~5 AKA Prepare foz and attend hearing on case 2~ ~irs $x,104.00

management order
~rr~l~,far valuation trial; Conference ~craith Kuxt

Bauerle Re; potential settlement and issues.

08/12/2015 AKA Instructions to Ms. Lindsay re: real estate 0.20 hrs $100.OQ

apportionment.

08/12/201. S ML Email and memo to Mr. Andaman re: business 1.20 hrs $180.00

damage claim settlement, apportionment of real

estate valuation, and hearing on proposed Case

Management Orders; Review Hearing

Notebook; .A,ssist Mr. Andaman ia~ ~repa~ation

for hearing; Revise Hearing Notebook; Review

Petition and Amended Answer.

08/12/2015 ML Revievsr electronic filing notifications and Case 1.001~rs $150.00

Management Orders entered by Judge Thorpe

anal compare with pxio~• orders entered by

Judge; Calendar all deadlines; Revise Pleading

Index.

08/6/2015 CRC Review settlement counter-offer and follow-u~ 0.40 hz•s $110.00

with appraisal expert zegarding apportionment

issues and valuation trial; Review new case

management orders,

08/18/2Q15 CRC Research xegatding apportionment; Review 1,30 hrs $357.50

leases; Research regarding leasehold interests.

08/19/2015 CRC Research regarding leasehold interests, 1.90 k~rs $522.50

apportionment priority.

08/21/2015 CRC Review Order sua sponte dispensing with o~•al 2.10 l~s $577.50

argument; Research r egarding leasehold

interests, priority, ~onst~uctive notice; Review

case management orders; Review ,

correspondence from R. Dreggo~•s regarding

apportioru~nent issues and strategy.



08/24/20] 5 CRC Review lease agreannents, promissaiy notes,
discovery produced by various mortgagors;

Research regarding priority.

08/26/201 S ML Review file; Email to Ms. Vickie Davis re:

08/28/201 S ML R~ev~~ emails re: xesezvation of apportionment
claim versus right to same; Keview ~larida

Statutes.

08/28/20].5 CRC Review correspondence from J. Spaanhozar
regarding proposed order; Research regarding

apportionment interests and rights relating

thereto; Review eminent domain statutory

provisions; Preparation of short memorandum

regarding same; Review cozxespondence to r.

Spoonhour regarding language of proposed
stipulation.

08/31/2015 AKA E-mail to attorney fax CFX.

09/04/2015 CRC Review motion for issuance of written opinion;

Research regarding rule allowing motions for

issuance of wzitten opinion,

09/08/201 S AKA E-mails to attorney for Project Orlando;

Telephone conference with Brendan Lynch.

09/14/2015 ML Review email froxa~ Brendan Lynch and litter

and Joint Motion fio Judge Thoi~e; Memo to

file.

09/I5/2015 AKA Review mails and insi~uctions to Ms. Lindsay

re: Appellee's Response.

09/15/2015 ML Review A.ppellee's Response to Appellant's

Motion fox Issuance of Written Opinion;

Review Motion; ~m~ails to/from Mr. Andaman.

09/15/2015 CRC Review response to motion for issuance of

written opinion; Research appellate rules

regarding same.

09/24/2015 CRC Review xn.otion for leave to file cross-claitx~. azad

proposed cross-cliarn; Review expert invoices

and correspondence xega~ding same.

09/28/2015 ML Review RFT T~~ust's Motion for Leave to File

Cross Claim and ezxaail fiam counsel for same.

09/28/2015 CRC Review correspondence from D. Levine

regarding RFT's motion to file cross-claim and

objections to same; Research regarding

apportioiunent; Review lease agreements and

supportive documents attached to cross-claim.

09/29/201 S ML Review emails re: RFT's Cross Claim and

apportionment issues; Review Grass Claim,

09/29/2Q 15 CRC Review RFT's p~•oposed cross-claim and

attachments thereto; Research regarding

eminent domain apport~ontxxent; Review file

materials; Review correspondence from B.

Lynch regarding settlement proceeds status;

1.2Q hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

4.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

Q.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hzs

0.601~rs

0,20 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.20 Yus

1.40 hrs

$330.0(?

$30.00

$3o.ao

$247.50

$X,50.00

~~ la.00

$150.Q0

`~30.Q0

$100.00

$3p.00

$137,50

$16.5.00

$30.00

$247.50

$30.0{)

$385.00



Preparation of short mennorandum regarding

potential objection to cross-claim.

10/01/2015 ML Review electronic notifications and The Patriot 0.40 h~•s $60.00

Group's Disclairn~r of Interest; Review CFX's

Notice of Dropping Party; Revise Se~•vice List

and Pleading Index; Ernails to Ms. Gonzalez.

]0/01/2415 CK.0 Review correspondence from K.13auerle 1.20 hrs $330.00

regarding RFT's motion for leave fio ann.end to

asseY~t crossclaim; Research regarding

supplemental proceedings; Review the Patriot

Group's disclaimer of interest; Review notice of

dropping parties.

10/02/2015 CRC Review carrespond~nce frox~. K. Bauerle x.60 lus $16S,0U

regarding treatment of crossclaia:an; Review

crossclaim; Review correspondence from B.

Lynch regarding settlement proceeds.

10/06/2015 CRC Telephone conferences with A. Angus a d V. 1.90 hrs $522.50

Davis regarding~~
Revie~vv fee bxeak owns from experts;

Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding

correspondence to V. Davis; Review and

revisions to cozies ondence to V. Davis

x•ega~•ding~ ~~; .

Reseaxch regarding apportiozaxne~t and

attorneys' fees for same; Research regarding

leasehold interests.

10/09/2015 CRC Resea~•ch regarding priority and leasehold 1.10 hrs $302.SQ

interests, renewal, and compensation far

leasehold intex~esfis terminated because of the

taking.

10/15/2015 CRC Research regarding priority, leasehold interests 0.70 hrs $192.50

and valuation. of same.

10/19/2Q15 CRC Research regarding priority and valuation of 0,60 hrs $~G5.00

leasehold interests.

1 0/2 1120 1 5 CRC Review case management orders; Research 1,10 hrs $302.50

regarding priority, lease valuation; Review

memoranda on seine.

10/23/2015 CRC Review Expressway Authozity's witness list for 4.90 l~rs $247.50

valuatzoza trial; Research regaxdix~g lien priority;

Review lease documents,

10/26/2015 CRC Research regarding compensation for unexpired 0.80 hrs $220.00

term of leasehold interest; Review

correspondence from B, Lynch regarding

correspondence to Judge as to extension of

deadlines; Review stipulated order regarding

e~Yension of deadline to pzoduce rebuttal expert

reports.

10/27/201 S CRC Review notice of unavailability; Review lease 0.40 hrs $110.00

extension.

10/28/2015 CRC Research regarding supplemental proceedings; 0.90 k~rs $24'~.SO

Review file memoranda regarding leasehold



valuation.

11./05/2015 CRC Instzuctions to L, King regarding apportionment 0..50 hrs $137.50

motion and arguments and strategy regarding

same; Review file materials,

11/OS/2015 LDK Receive znst~ruction from Mr. Conley, and begin 1.3(1 hrs X292.50

drafting Motion for Apportiorunent.

11/06/2415 CRC Review Project Orlando's rebuttal witness list; 0.20 1us $SS.OU

Review Expressway Authority's supplemental

witness list.

11/06/2015 LDK Draft Motion for Apportionz~aent. Research law 1.30 hrs $292.50

regarding valuation ofmonth-to-month lease

and valuation of options to renew.

I ]./12/2015 CRC Review notice of supplemental case 0.20 hc•s $55.00

rnanagenr~ent conference and scheduling

hearing.

11/13/2015 CRC Review disc~aizner of interest; Review 0.30 kus $82,SU

stipulated final judgment.

11/~G/2015 CRC Review ~.otzce of supplemental case 0.80 h~•s $220.00

management conference; Review previous case

management orders; Research regarding

valuation of leasehold interests.

11/I7/2015 CRC Research regazdang leasehold interests and Q.60 lus $].65.00

valuation of satzae.

11/23/2015 AI~~1 Conference with Mr. Conley concerning Case 0.70 hz•s $3.50.00

Management Hearing and results; Review Case

Management O~dex; E-mails to attorneys for

CFX and for Project Orlando; Conference with

Mrs. Lindsay.

11/23/2015 1VIL Conference with Mz. Conley re: Case 0.20 Ius $30.OQ

Management Con~e~ence; Review Mr.

Arda~xzan's email to attorneys fox• CFX

regarding mediation and appo~tiox~ment claim;

Review Ordex St~•ilcing Order Setting Trial on

business damage claim; Email and instructions

to Ms. Reisinger.

11/23/2015 CRC Preparation for case management conference; 2.10 hrs $.577.50

Travel to and attend same; Review file

materials; Conferences with J. S~oonhour, K.

Bauerle, and B, Lynch regarding status and

further handling; Review correspondence

regarding mediation; Office conference with K.

Axdanlan regarding same.

11/23/20J.5 LDK Draft Motion for Apportionment. Q.20 hrs ;45.00

l 1/2S/2415 LDK Legal xesearch related to motion faz . O.SQ hrs $112.50

apportionment,

12/01/2015 CRC .Review correspondence from B. Lynch 0.60 hrs $165.00

regarding ex pane hearing; Review notice of

heaaing; Review case managenaezat orders;

Reseaz•ch regarding priority.

12/03/2015 LDZ~ Draft motion for apportionment and associated 2.00 lu~s $450.40



legal xesearch.

12/04/2015 LDK Dxaft motion far apportionment and associated 1.70 hrs `6382.SQ

legal research.

12/14/2015 LDK Draft motion for apportionment, and associated 1.40 lvs $315.00

legal research.

12/15/2015 LDK Draft xniotion for apportioiament, and associated 0.40 lus $90.00

legal research.

12/16/201 S CRC Review correspondence fxoxn C. Cawthra 0.80 hrs $220.00

regarding status of valuation case; Research
regarding supplemental proceedings; Review
memorandum regarding potential
apportionment claim; Review mediation order;

Review notice of taking deposition.

12/17/2Q1S CRC Review coxxespandenc~ to C. Cawthra 0.80 l~a•s $220.00

regarding case status and update; Resea~oh

regarding lease extensions and leases of
indefinite duration/pezpetual leases.

12/22/2015 CRC Review notices of taking depositions of P. 0.30 hrs $82.50

Sherma and J. HaII; Review correspondence to

R. Dxeggoxs regarding same.

12/23/2015 CRC Review correspondence to R. Dreggors 0.30 hrs $82.50

regarrding deposition attendance; Revie~c~v

deposition notices,

12/2&/2015 ML Review multiple eznails and Notices of Taking 0.201us $30.00

Deposition in valuation case; Review ezx~.ails re;

attendance at mediation; Conference with Mx.

Conley re: same.

12/28/2p15 CRC Review deposition notices; Telephone 1.30 kus $357.50

conference with K. Bauerle regarding

depositions; Telephone conference with R.

Dreggoz~s regarding necessity of attending

depositions; Office conference with L. King

regarding leasehold estate issue; Research

regazding leasehold interests and perpetual

leases; Preparation of correspondence to K.

Bauerle regarding reservation of right to depose

experts,

Ol./04/2016 ML Review Certifications of Mediation Authoa~ity; 0.20 hrs $3Q.00

Review Project Ozlando's First Request to

Produce to CFX.

01/04/2x16 CRC Review certifications of mediation authority; 0.40 hrs $110.00

Review mediation notices; Review request for

production to Expressway Authority,

01/06/2016 AKA. Instructions to Ms, Lindsay xe: mediation order. 0.2Q hrs $100.(}0

01/06/2016 ML Review PST's Certification of Mediation 0.20 hrs $30,.00

Authority; Conference with Mx. Conley re:

same; Review Agreed Mediation Order;

Conference with Mr. Andaman.

Ol./06/2016 CSC Review file materials; Review certificate of 0.301~rs $82.50

mediation authority,



0 X /07/20 X 6 AKA Inshuctions to Mr. Conley Re: mediation. 0.401us $2{)0.00

OI/07/2016 ML Conference with Mr. Conley re: mediation 0.20 hrs $30.00

attendance; Email to Ms. Vickie Davis,

fll/0$/2016 ML Conference with Mr. Conley re: mediation; 0.&0 hrs X90.00

Review ern~ail from same; ErCx~ail xe; same;

Review RFT Trust's Motion for Leave to File

Cross Claim and proposed Cross Claim;

Review Cez~tifications of Mediation Authority;

Revise Pleading Tndex.

01/08/2016 ML Tele hone Conferences with Ms. Vickie Davis 1.20 hrs $180.00

re. ; Emails to/from Mr. Andaman;

Conference with Mr. Conley; Review Rules on

zx~ediation attendance; Draft Certification of

Mediation Authority; Revise Service List;

Upload a~ad electronically file and serve

CeY~tification; Email to Ms. Davis.

01/08/2016 CRC Revievt► proposed crossclairn anal znotian for 1.20 hrs $330.00

leave to amend to assent crossclaizn; Research

regaxding non-condxnenation claim assertion in

eminent domain proceedings; Preparation of

certificate a~ mediation authority; Instructions

to M. Lindsey regarding same; Research

regarding powers of attorney and conflicts of

interest.

01/11/2016 ML Review electronic z~otifi.cations re: Certification 0,2Q hrs $30.00

of Mediation Authority; Revise Pleading Index,

01/11/2016 CRC Review notice of cancellation of depositions. 0.20 hrs $55.00

01/12/2016 CRC Review file materials; Preparation for 1.00 kus $275.40

mediation; Ynstruetions to L. King and M.

Lindsey regarding materials and preparation for

same.

01/13/201 G ML Review emails re: pxepaxatzon for mediation 2.00 hrs $300.00

and notebook; Review file and expert invoices

for valuation; Emails to/from Ric~C Dreggors;

Email to Charles Cawthra; Prepare "'able of

Contents and notebook cover; Review and

revise Lease, Ownership and Mortgage

Chronology; Revzew Clerk ~e~vebsite xe: status of

mortgage foreclosure; l.Zeview Stipulated Final

Judgment as to Business Damage Claim re:

right to seek apportionment in valuation case;

Draft Fees arad Costs Summary; Email to Mr.

Conley; Conference with same; Review fle re:

area of taking and leased pzemises; Prepare

calculations summary; ~naail to Mr, Conley;

Revise mediation notebook.

01/13/2016 CRC Review z~.aediation packet and materials; 0.40 hrs $110.OQ

Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding same.

O ll13/2016 LDI~ Assemble case law and memoranda fox Mr. 1. l O l~rs $247.50

Conley in preparation for mediation.



O1/~~}/2016 AK1~ Legal research Re: lase extensions, automatic 1.501us X750.00

renewals and valuations; Review nateboak;

Conference with Ms. Lindsay and instructions

concerning presentation for mediation.;

Con~exence with Mr. Conley Re; same; Review

eminent domain manual.

O1/1~4/2~I6 ML Emails to/from NIr. Conley re: preparation for 1,50 hrs $225.00

mediation; Review file and r~oteboak; Emails

to/fiom Charles Cawthra re; personal pxoperty

appraiser fee; Revise Expert Fee Surnm.ary;

Review file re: lease termination letter,

leasehold interest and 'valuation and related

issues; Review notes regarding leasehold

valuation; Conference with Mr. Andaman and

Mr. Conley; Telephone Conference with

appraiser re: leasehold valuation; Ennail #o

same; Revise Table of Contents and 1V~ediation

Notebook.

O1/J.4/2016 ML Review CFX's Inte~rogataries and Request for 0.20 brs $3~.Op

Production to Project Ozlando.

01/14/2016 ML Conference with Mr, Conley r~: mediation and 0.20 hrs $30,00

attendance; Review Agreed Mediation Oxder;

Email to Ms. Vickie Davis.

41/14/2016 CRC Review mediation binder; Research regarrding 1,60 hrs $440.00

bonus value for leases; Instructions to M.

Lindsey regarding mediation preparations;

Office conferences with K. Andaman and M.

Lindsey regarding same; Review ~.atice of

service of third interrogatories and third

intexrogatori~s.

01/15/2016 ML Assist Mr. Conley in preparation fox mediation; 1.20 hrs $180.00

Review Mernorran.dum on coinpensabxlify issues

and download case law; E~cnails re; same;

Review Fee Agreement ~e: compensation and

settlement; Email to Mr. Conley.

Ol/1.5/20l 6 T_.DK Comer with Mr. Conley regarding mediation 0.70 h~•s $157..50

strategy and arguments in favor of Davis"s might

to compensation for lease renewals.

01/17/2016 CRC Preparation for mediation. 1.10 hrs $302.50

O1/l.8/2016 AKA. Review file, calculations; Telephone conference 1.20 hrs $600.OQ

with appraise; Instructions to Mx. Conley ~Ze:

mediation; Instructions to Ms, Lindsay Re:

infoxrnation for ̀Mx. Conley and Vickie Davis

for mediation.

01/18/2016 ML Continue preparation for mediation; Ravise 1.00 hx•s $150.00

Table of Contents and mediation notebook;

Emails to/frozx~ Mr. Conley.

O I/L 8/2016 MI, Telephone Conference with appraiser re: 0.5(1 hi;s 9 75.00

valuation and apportiolv~aez~t; Conference with

Mr. Andaman and Mr. Conley; Calculate



valuation and apportioxu~nent claim.

UI/18/2016 CRC', Tele hone conference with V. Davis regarding

~; Freparation for mediation;

Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding same;

Telephone conference with R. Dreggors and M.

Lindsey regarding mediation, strategy, and

further handling; Review file materials,

O1/l 8/2016 LDK Confer with Mr. Conley regarding issues

relevant fio upcoming mediation.

Ol. /19/2016 ~lI~ Conference with Mr. Conley Re: si~ategy fbr

mediation, calculation of numbers and

evaluation; Review information from contractor

Re: build out of new facilities and value thereof

and calculation of value of consCrruction at new

location to provide to same improvements on

new location on property taken; Calculate

percentage of overall take area.

01/19/2016 AKA Conference with Mr, Conley Re: preparation

for mediation; Telephone conference and

communicarions with Mr. Conley Re: status of

mediation and impasse.

01/1.9/2016 CRC Fre~arationfor, txavel to/from, and attend

mediation; Research regarding compensability

of leasehold znterests; Review ale ~tnaterials;

Research x egmrding purchase money mortgages.

01/20/2Q16 AI~.A Conference with Mr, Conley Re: results of

mediation azzd impasse.

0 U20/2016 IVIL Conference with Mr. Conley xe: mediation and

results; Review Mediation Re~aort; Revise

Pleading Index.

O1 /20/2016 CRC Review mediation report; Research regarding

priority and purchase zn.oney mortgages;

Review notice of filing terms of easement fbr

parce1897.

01/21/2016 CRC Research regarding leasehold valuation.

01/22/201f ML Conference with M~•. Conley re; appraisals;

Review file; Email to Rick Dreggors.

Q1/22/2016 CRC Telephone cox~fexence with R. Dreggo~s

regarding fut~hez handling and appoi-tiontnent

claim; Telephony conference with K, Bauerle

regarding copy of final appraisal for Project

Orlando; Research regarding leasehold

valuation; Preparation of correspondence to and

~~eview correspondence fiom R, Dreggoxs

regardi~ag appraisal of Project Ozlando; Review

e~thibit and witness lists.

3.70 hrs

0,301us

2,00 lus

0.80 hrs

12.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.101~~•s

0.90 hrs

0.10 ~s

1,201us

$1,017.50

$67.50

$1,000.00

$400.00

$3,465.00

~Zoa.00

$x.5.00

$302.50

$247.50

~~s.ao

$330.0

01/2S/2016 CItC Review coi~ected motion for leave to file 0.70 hrs $192.50

c~~oss-cliam; Revier~v supplemental witness and

exhibit list; Review trial docket; Review file

materials; Pzeparation for status nneeting.



O1/26/201G ML Review file xe: history and cu~re~.t status; Draft 0.501~rs $75.00

Summary of case including fees and costs.

0~/27/20~6 CRC Revi~vv and revisions to case sumzxxary 0.30 h~•s x;82.50

analyses; Review file materials; Instructions to

M. Lindsey regarding further handling and

status conference.

01/28/2016 CRC Review affidavits in support of motion in 0.60 hrs $1(iS.UO

limine and motion in limine regarding appraisal

drafts.

01/29/2016 N1Ia Review Petitioner's and Project Orlando's 0.401us $60A0

E~ibit Lists for trial; Revier~v Motion in

Limine to exclude Integza appraisal,

02/01/2016 ML Revises Motion in Limine regarding conceptual 0.301us $45.00

plazzs; Emails re: same.

02/01/2016 CRC Review second zx~.otion in litnine and notice of 1.10 1-us $302.50

intant to take cozparate representative

depositions; Review additional notices of taking

depositions; Review authorities cited in motion

in liming.

02/02/2016 MI. Review Notices of Taking Deposition; Review O.ZQ hrs $3 0.00

Order Striking Trial Period for business

damages; Conference with Mr. Conley xe:

same.

02/02/2016 CRC Review order striking pre-trial and txia1 period; 0.801~rs $220.00

Review notices of taking deposition daces

tecum; Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding

apportionment issues; Review amended notice

of talcing deposition; Reseazch. regarding

purchase r~x~oney mortgages.

02/03/201 6 CRC Review notice of taking deposition duces~ 0.70 ht•s $192.50

tecum; Review motion for appo~•tionment.

02/04/2016 AKA Confexex~ce with Mr. Conley and Ms. Lindsay 0.60 hrs $300.00

re: potential settlement.

02/04/216 MI, Review multiple Notices of Taking Deposition 0.201~rs $30.00

in valuation case; Co~nfexence with Mr. Conley.

02/04/2016 CRC Review discoverry responses; Review fle X.101us $3Q2.S0

materials; Research regarding purchase xtaoney

mortgages; Review amended affidavits; Attend

strategy session with K. Arrdazx~.an and M,

Lindsey regarding further handling and

potential proceeding resolution.

02/08/2016 ML Review nn.ultiple motions in limine and CFX 0.20 hrs $30.00

letter to Judge Thorpe; Conference with Mr.

Conley.

42/08/2016 CRC Review nu~aerous motions in limine and 0.90 hrs $247.50

memoranda of law in support; Review

corzespondence to Judge Thorpe regarding

motions in limine and materials in support;

Review response to Project Orlando's First

Request far Production.



02/09/2Q16 taKA Review multiple filings; E-mails from multiple 1.00 l~z~s $500.00

parties related to Motions in Lzzx~ine, Discovery

~xdexs and letters to Judge,

42/x9/2016 MI~ Review multzple emails and documents 0.40 1~•s $60.00

regarding CFX and Project Orlando preparation

for trial; Memo to file.

02/09/201.6 CRC Preparation of cozx~espondence to K. Bauerle 0,20 hrs $SS.UU

regazding appraisal for Project Orlando.

02/10/2p16 CRC Review amended notice of intent to talce 0.301us $82.50

corporate deposition and demand fox

designation of representative deponent;

Telephony conference with B. Lynch regarding

Pxaject Orlando's appraisal.

02/12/2016 ML Review exx~ail fiorn Mr. Coney xe: Appraisal 0.3Q lus $45.00

prepared fox Project Orlando; Bxiefreviev,r of

sar~ae; Email to R.icic Dreggors.

02/12/2016 CRC Review co~xespondence fzoxin B. Lynch witk~ 0.60 lu~s $1GS.00

copy of Project Orlando's appraisal; Review

coz7respondence to R. Dreggors regaxding same;

Review Project Orlando's appraisal;

Inshuctions to M, Lindsey; Review notice o~

service of subpoena for txial.

02/15/201G CRC Review amended noCice oftalcing depositions. 0.20 hrs $SS.00

02/1C/2016 ML Review email fxozn Mr. Conley xe: package for 0.60 lus ~90.U0

Motion for Apportionment; Conference with

Mr. Conley re: impxovernents and repairs made

by Ms. Davis to subject property; Review fle;

Review 1V~otion for Sununary Judgment anti

Memorandunn of Law filed by Pxoject Orlando;

Meaxaa to file.

02/lb/2016 CRC Review nunaexaus pretrial motions, including 2.50 hz~s $687.50

partial sumn~axy judgment, special benefi#,

assemblage, motion to strike, and men:xorandum

in response to motion i~ limine as to conceptual

site plan; Review memorandum on expert

examination during trial; Research regarding

leasehold valuation and bonus value;

Ynstructions to M, Lindsey zegarding exhibits to

motion fox apportionment; Preparation of

motion for apportionment.

02/16/2016 I.DK Review Project Orlando's motion to strike 0,50 lus X112.50

expert witnesses. Research law xe~arding

admissibility of expert testimony mat critizes

another. expert's opzz~ion.

Q2/17/2016 ML Review email from Mr. Conley xe: Motion fox• 0.60 laz•s $90.Q0

Apportionment and exhibits needed far same;

Review file including Lease and Mortgage

Chronoiagy; Prepare documents needed for

exhibits; Memo to Mr. Cornley,

02/18/2016 CRC Review Project Orlando's appraisal; Telephone 2.301~•s $632.50



conference with R Dxeggox~'s regarding
potential valuation; Resear ch r egarding

leasehold valuation; Preparation of emotion for

apportionment.

02/~9/24l 6 CRC Preparation of apportionment motion. 1,30 hrs :~357,5~

02/22/2016 CRC Review memoranduzx~ zn. opposition to motion O.~Q hrs $220,00

to stx ike and in limine rregarding notice of filing

terms of easexz~.ent; Review rnernorandum in

opposition to axaotian in limine to preclude

reference to special beef t; Review
memorandum in opposition to motion in limine

to preclude rre~erence to assemblage to avoid

mitigating severance damages,

02/2/20 ~ 6 CiZC Review ~nn.emorandum in opposition to motion 0, 60 hrs $165.00

to strike iznpxoper expert witnesses and limit

testimony; Review response in opposition to

~n.otian for leave to azxze~ad to assent

counterclaim..

02/25/206 CRC Review car~espondence firozza J. McKnight 1.80 hrs $495.00

regarding transcript; Preparation of

correspondence to J. McKnight regarding same;

Review Project Orlando's response to motion

foz summary judgment; Preparation of motion

fox apportionment.

02/28/2016 CRC Research regarding purchase xnaney mortgages, 2.30 hxs $632.50

priority, valuation of leasehold interests;

Review and revisions to motion fox

apportionment.

03/O1/201C AKA Confexen.ce with Mr. Conley Re: priority claim 0.60 lus $300.00

by Vicl~ie Davis and her ink~exxted take over

business and claim.

03/Ol./2016 AKA. Review zx~ultiple motions in linnine and multiple 1.20 hrs $600.00

memorandums.

03/01/2016 CRC Preparation of motion fog• apportionment; 1.30 firs $357.50

Research regarding leasehold valuation.

43/02/2Q16 AKA Instructions to Mr. Conley Re; updated research 0.30 hrs $150.00

with respect to pre-existing matters as to use of

property.

03/02/2016 MFA Conference with Attorney Conley regarding 0.40 k~~s $150.00

strategy far making apportionment claim.

03/02/2016 CR.0 Telephone conference with V. Davis z~egarding 2.70 hrs $742.50

• Preparation. of

coz~espondence to R. Dreggors regarding

leasehold valuation; Research regarding priority

and constauctive or inquiry notice; Preparation

of motion for apportionment; Review appraisal

handbook.

Q3/03/2016 AKA Conference with Mr. Conley Re: strategy 2.00 hrs $1,000.00

relating to pziority, term of lease, vaivatian

period; Review Orange, Dade or other case;



Review eminent domain provisions xelating to

lease hold valuation; Extended telephone

confez ence with Rick Dreggors; Review
valuation of lease hold interest.

03/03/24~~ AIWA Review EATON real estate valuation litigation I.SQ hxs $750.Q0

relating to lease hold valuation; Instructions to

Ms. Lindsay Re: same.

03/03/2016 CRC Telephone conferences with R Dreggars and K. 4.20 hrs $1,155.00

Andaman regarding stxategy, apportionment,

and leasehold valuation; Research regarding

leasehold 'valuation; Review portions of Project

Orlando and Expressway Authority Appraisals;

Preparation of motion for apportionment;

Research regarding compensable interests,

motions for apportionment, and supplennental

proceedings; Preparation of correspondence to

R. Dr~ggo~•s regarding motions filed in

valuation case; Review coires~ondence from R.

Dreggors regarding same; Review

correspondence from and between D, Levine

and J, Spoo:nhour regarding crossciaim; Review

notice of hearing and motion to add cxossclaim.

03/09/2016 CRC Review leasehold evaluation chapter from 1.20 his $330.00

~Eatan Appraisal Manual provided by R,

Dreggors; Revisions to motion for

apportionment; Research regarding leasehold

valuation.

03/07/2016 CRC Research regarding leasehold valuation and 1.7Q hrs $467.50

methodology; Review and revisions to motion

for apportionment; Review correspondence

from L. Mejia regarding cozxespondence and

attachments to Judge Thorpe regarding

telephonic attendance.

03/08/2x16 CRC Review unopposed motion fog telephonic 0.50 hrs $137.50

attendance anal proposed order regarding same;

Research regarding leasehold valuation.

03/09/20 6 CRC Review notice o~hearing and amended notice O.CO hz•s $165.00

of hearing. Review notice of hearing and

amended notice of hearing; Review motion to

add cross-claim.

03/10/201G AKA Conference with Mr. Conley Re: multiple 1,00 hrs $500.00

memos, motions and strategies v~rith respect to

responding to lenders' crossclaim.

03/10/2016 ML Review Notice of Hewing, Amended Notice of 0.301u•s $45.00

Hearing and Notice o~ Cancellation of Hearing

for all pending motions; Emails to Mr, Conley;

Review Order Resetting Case for Trial; Memo

to i"xle.

03/10/2016 CRC Review nofice of cancellation of hearing; 2.20 hrs $605.00

Review correspondence from. J. Spoonhour

regarding case status and further dandling;



Review file materials; Telepho
with V. Davis re ardin

Review Order

Resetting Pre-Trial and Trial for time certain;

Research regarding apportionment motions;

Revisions to motion for apportionment;

Research regarding crossclaims and zipeness;

Instructions to S. Gonzalez regarding

preparation. of hearing binder and materials;

Review corrected order regarding zescheduling

of pretrial and trial date; Review '

correspondence from R. Ho~fpauir regarding

saz~e; Review correspondence frozx~ L, Cos#ello

regarding telephonic motion, proposed order on

same, and correspondence to Judge Thorpe

regarding same; Review correspondence

regarding call-in. numbers.

03/14/201~i ML Review memo from Mr. Coaaley ~e: Healing oza O.S01us $75.00

RFT's Motion for Leave to File CxossClaim;

Prepaz~e Nateboolc fox same; Draft Table of

Contents,

03/17/2016 CRC Telephone conference with B. Lynch regarding 0.30 hrs $82.50

status and upcoming motion for lave to fide

crassclaim.

03/18/2016 CRC Review order granting unopposed motion for 0.40 ~~•s $1 X 0.00

telephonic attendance at hearing; Prreparation

far hearing on crossclaim.

Q3/21/2016 CRC Research regarding apportionment and 2.90 hz~s $797.50

supplex~riental proceedings in ~minenfi domain

actions; Preparation for, travel to and from, and

attend motion for lave to fide crossclaim

hearing; Discussions with B. Ly~ach and K.

Bauexle regarding same and pofientaal

settlement.

03/22/2016 CRC Review correspondence from D. Levine 0.40 ~~•s ~z ~ o.00
regarding proposed order; Preparation of

correspondence to D. Levine regarding

non-objection to same; Review correspondence

from K. Bauerle and B. Lynch regarding

rion-objection to order and dropping of Patriot

Group froze service list; Review

cozxespandence to judge Thorpe and enclosed

order denying crosselaim.

1)3/31/2016 ML Review PSP's Motion for Disbursement of 0.30 hrs X45.00

Funds; Review Notice of Filing and Affidavit;

Exnails to/from Ms. Gonzalez; Conference with

Mx. Conley re: p~•ioxity issue.

03/31/2016 CRC Review motzon for disbursennent of deposit, 1.401vs $38.5.00

affidavit regarding same, and voluminous

exhibits in suppoi~ of same; Instrructions to S.

Gonzalez regarding print copies; Research



regarding apportionment of good faith deposit

and protections regarding same.

04/01/2416 AIWA Review Motion for Disbursezzaent; Insfiructians 0.701u~5 $350. 0

to Ms. Lindsay and Mx. Conley.

04/01/201 G CRC Research regarding priority; Review motion for 2.20 hxs $605.00

disb~xrsernent and attachments to same; Begin

pxeparation of response in oppositia~. to motion

for disbtu~sement.

04/06I201G ML Draft Response in Opposition to PSP Motion to 0.34 hrs $45.Q0

Disburse and Request fox Apportioxxment;

Email and axaez~no to Mr. Conley.

0~/O6/2016 CRC Preparation of response to motion for 0.60 hrs $165.00

disbuxseznent; Instructions to M. Lzndsey

regarding same.

04/07/2016 AI~1. ~nstzuctians to Mr. Conley Re: research Re: 0.~0 kus $200.00

appellate fees for supplementary proceedings

including apportiozaznent and status of case and

claims by lenders.

04/07/201b CRC Preparation of response in opposition to motion 3.901~rs $1,072.50

fbr disbursement and request for

apportionment; Review ale xn~atexials;

P~•eparation of file memoranduzaa regarding

settlement stzategy; Research regarding inquiry

notice; Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding

preparation of exhibits; Research regarding

recovery of appellate attorneys' fees on

apportionment issues; Preparation of ale

memorandun~a regarding same; Review portions

of ~rninent dox~ain manual regarding

apportionment and apportionment process;

Review PSP's motion for learn to file

crossclaim and exhibits relating to same;

Preparation of Affidavit of V. Davis in support

of request for appoz~tianment; Research

xegazding priority; Review motion fox•

disbursement and affidavit in suppo~~t of same.

04/08/2016 ML Review and revised Response in Opposition to 1.00 hxs $150.00

PSP's Motion to Disburse; Revier~v and revise

Affidavit of Vickie Davis; Prepare Exhibits to

all; Revievcr CFX Appraisal re: areas of taking;

Conference with Mr, Conley.

0 /08/2016 CRC Preparation of affidavit of V. Davis in support 1.70 lus $467.50

of apportionment; Research regarding priority;

Prepazat~on of exhibit to affidavit; Instructions

to M. Lindsey regarding same; Review f le

materials; Revisions to response to

disbursement motiaza and request for

apportionment.

0/13/2016 CRC Review and revisions to response to rno~ion far 1.00 l~•s $275,00

withdrawal and request for appoi~tionrnent;

Research regarding supplementai ~roceed:in~s.



04/1 /2016 ML (A.p~ortionment) Conference with Mr. Cowley 0.201~us $30.00

re: pxoposed Motion for Apportionment and

Affidavit regarding same; Review PSP's Motion

for Disbursement.

04/1 /2016 C',RC Review and revisions to response to motion for 0.80 hrs $220.00

disbursement and request fox apportio~tnent.

04/16/2016 CRC Revisions to affidavit of V. Davis in support of 0.70 hrs $192.50

request far apportionment; Revisions to

response in opposition to motion fox

disbursement.

0~/19/2Q 16 CRC Review docl~et; Revisions to affidavit of V. 1.20 his $330.00

Davis; Revisions to response in opposition to

motion for disbursement and request for

apportioxunent.

0/20/201.6 ML Review emails re: hearing on PSP's Motion to 0.201us $30.00

Disbuzse; Conference with Mr. Andaman and

Mr. Conley re: same; Instructions to Ms.

Gonzalez.

04/20/201.6 CRC Review correspondence from J. Kuty regarding 0.401us $110.00

coordination of hearing; Review

corxespoz~dence amongst counsel regard~t~g

same; Instxucfiions fo 5. Gonzalez regarding

same.

04/22/20 6 AIWA Instructions to IVls. Gonzalez and to Mrr. Conley a.60 lus $300,00

Re: hearing preparation; Review e-mails from

and to attorneys.

04/22/2016 CRC Review correspondence fiom K. Bauerle 0,30 hrs $82.50

regarding hearing coordination; Review

correspondence from J. Kuty regarding notice

of hearing and coordination of same.

04/2G/2016 ML Review Motion to Withci~aw from counsel for 0.2Q l~rs $30,00

RFT Txust; Review emails re: same.

04/26/2016 Cl2C Review motion fio withdraysv as counsel and Q.201us $55.00

proposed order regarding same;

OA~/27/2016 CRC Review correspondence from S. Narup 1.70 Ius $4G7.50

regarding copies of transcript for motion for

leave to fiXe cross-claim hearing; Preparation of

correspondence to S. Narup regarding same;

Review motion for disbursement and

documents filed in support of saxtxe; Review

and zevisions to response to motion for

disbursemernt and request #'or apportionment.

04/28/20X6 AKA Confezence with Ms. Lindsay and Mx. Conley 0,20 hrs $100,00

Re: response in May to various Motions.

04/28/2016 ML Conference with Mx. Andaman and Mx. Ganlay 0,201u•s $30.00

re: Motion responses.

04/28/2016 CRC Discussions with K. Andaman and M. Lindsey 1.40 hz•s X385.00

xegarding apportionment sfrategy; Review

r~aotian for leave to file crossclaim; Research

xegaxding leasehold valuation and pxioxity.



OS/Q3/2016 AKA Instructions to Mx. Conley Re: needed affidavit 0.50 hrs $250.00

and respond to n:~otion,

05/04/2016 CRC Review docket regazding status o£disbursement 4.20 hrs $SS.OU

hearing; Review correspondence regarding

same.

QS/1 ]./2016 CRC Research regaz~ding apportionment hearing 0.701~rs $192.50

procedures; Review Florida Enninent Domain

Manual regat.•ding same.

05/12/2016 AKA E-mails frarn and to attorneys for the 0.~0 l~cs ` 200.00

Expressway Authority Re: potential settlement;

Instructions fio Mr. Conley Re; same.

05/12/2016 AKA Telephone conference with Brendan Lynch Re: 0.601us X300,00

potential settlement; Memo to Mr. Conley Re:

sanne.

05/12/2016 CRC Instructions to S. Gonzalez regarding 0.20 hx•s $55.00

conference call coordination; Review

correspondence to and from B. Lynch regaxd~ng

same.

05/13/2Q16 ~1KA E-mails to and frarn Chris Conley Re: same; fl.50 I~rs $250.00

Instructions to Ms, Lindsay and Ms. Gonzalez.

05/13/2016 CRC Preparation of correspondence regarding 1, lO l~xs $302..50

nnediation nurn~bers and valuation estimates;

Discussions with M, Lindsey regarding same;

Review ~Ie materials regarding estimates of

leasehold value and possible positions

regarding saxz~e; Review correspondence frarn

B. Lynch with attachment regarding notice of

hearing.

45/16/2016 CRC Review phone message frorza Cathy with B. 0.201u•s $55.00

Lynch's office regarding conference call;

Instructions to S. Gonzalez regarding same.

05/18/2016 CRC Review file materials and recent file 0.44 hrs $110.Q0

rr~emarandurr~; Discussions with M, Lindsey

regardxx~g shategy.

05/19/2016 AIWA Review petition and valuations; Instructions to Q.501u~s $250.OU

Ms. Lindsay.

05/19/2016 CRC Revisions to affidavit of V. Davis in suppo~~t of 0.80 hz•s $22d.Q0

motion and response in opposition to motion far

disbursement; Review docket regarding notice

of hearing; Instructions to M. Lindsey regarding

same,

05/20/2016 AKA Review matters pez~aining to upcoming 0.20 hrs $100.00

mediation.

05/20/2016 ML Review emai~s re: fees and costs; Review file Q.50 hrs $75.00

re: expert invoices; Emails to/fiom appraiser's.

office; Emails to Mx..Ardaman and Mr. Conley;

Calculate fees and cos#s.

OS/2Q/2016 CRC Review file regarding attorneys' and experts' 0.30 hrs $82.50

fees and costs; Instauctions to M. Lindsey

regarding same; Review correspondence to and



from R. Dreggors rega~•ding updated expext

fees. .

05/24/2016 ~I~1~ Conference with Mr. Co~:~ey and Ms. Lindsay 0,60 hrs $300.00

Re: heaxing and potential settlement.

OS/24/2016 ML Ezxxails to/fiom Mr. Andaman and Mr. Conley 0.20 h~~s $30.00

re: fees and costs and potential settlerment of

apportiox~xr~.ent claim; Review file; Review

additional emails re: numbers to settle.

05/24/2016 ML Review Notice of Hearing on PSP's Motion to 0.70 hrs $ l OS.00

Disburse and File Crossclain~.; Revise Pleading

Index; Email to Mr. Conley; Begin preparation

of hearing notebook.

05/24/2016 DL Confer with Mx. Conley regarding potential 0.20 hz•s $85.00

setklement offer.

05/24/2016 CRC Review coxxespondence regazding potential 1.20 h~~s $330.00

settlement; Review and revisions to response in.

opposition to motio~a for disbursement and

affidavit of V. Davis in support thereof; Review

notice of hearing; Review file materials and

preparation of settlement notes; Review motion

fox• dxsbursernent; Discussions v~rith K..Ardaman

and M. Lindsey regarding potential settlement.

05/25/2016 AID Conference with Mr. Conley Re: potential 0.401us $200.00

settlexx~.ent; Instructions to Ms. Lindsay.

05/25/2016 CRC Preparation of settlement offer to B. Lynch and 0.80 hxs $220.00

J. Spoonhour; Review notice of voluntary

dismissal; Revisions to settlement offer to B,

Lynch and 7. Spoanhou~r; Discussions with K.

Andaman and M. Lindsey regarding same;

Review updated expert invoice totals provided

by IZ, Dreggors; Review motion fox

disbursement.

05/26/2016 CRC Preparation of response to motion far 0.50 bas ~ 137.,50

disbursement azad affidavit of V. Davis;

Discussions with M. Lindsey regarding same;

Review xnvtion for disbursement and motion. for

leave to ~ile crossclaim.

0.5/27/2016 AKA. Conference with Mr. Conley re: strategy and 0.50 ht•s $250,00

revisions to affidavit.

05/27/2()16 ML Review Affidavit of Vic~ze Davis and exrzail to 0.20 hrs X30.00

same.

05/27/2016 CRC Tele hone conference with V. Davis regarding 1.00 hrs $275.00

~~~ Office conference with K.

Andaman regarding revisions to affidavit and

strategy; Revisions to affidavit of V. Davis;

P~•eparation of coxxespondence to V. Davis

regarding same; Review file materrials;

Preparation of exhibit to affidavit.

05/30/2()16 CRC Research regarding apportionment proceedings 0.601u•s $165.00

and supplemental proceedings process.



05/30/201.6 CRC Review cai~espondence to B, Lynch and J, 0.40 hrs $11Q.00

Spoornhaur regarding settlement offer• fox

apportionment; Review menaoxandum regarding

potential settlement.

05/31 /2016 AKA Conference with NIr. Conley Re: revisions to 0.401us $200.0(}

response to Motion for Disbursement and

strategy;. Ynstructions to Ms. Gonzalez Re:

preparation for hearing.

05/31/20]6 ML Review revised Response in Opposition to PSP 1.00 lus $150.00

Motion to Disburse and Motion for

Apportiontx~ent; Review fle xe: exhibits;

Prepare Composite Exhibits A and B to

Response; Review .Affidavit of Vickie Davis.

05/31/2016 CRC Review and revisions to response in opposition 1.80 hz~s $495.00

to motion fbr apportionment; Instructions to M.

Lindsey regarding exhibits to same; Preparation

of exhibits to response.

OC/Q1/2016 ML Conference with Mx. Conley re: Affidavit of 0.3Q hrs $45.00

Vicicze Davis' Telepho;~e Conference with Ms.

Davis re~ Ernail and m~ezxio to Mr.

Conley; Review maps; Revise~E~ibit A to

Response in Opposition to Motion to Disburse

and Request for Apportionment.

06/41 /2016 CRC Review status update regarding affidavit 0.601u;s ~ I05.00

execution and filing; Instructions to M, Lindsey

regazding same; Review file materials;

Preparation of exhibits for response in

opposition to motion for disbursement;

Instruetio~.s to M, Lindsey regarding same.

O(i/02/2016 ML Review Notice of Filing Aff davit of Vickie 1.50 hrs $225.00

Davis; Con~exence with Mr. Coanley; Review

memo from same regarding items fox needed

for hearing; Telephone Conference with Ms.

Davis; Revise emails and signed Affidavit;

Review Response in Opposition and Request

fox Apportionment; Revise Service List; Upload

and electronically ale anal serve Response and

Notice of Filing; Revise Pleading Index;

Parepare hearing notebook; Draft Table of

Contents.

06/02/2016 CRC Preparation of hearing notebook; Research 1.30 kus $357.50

Florida apportionment and deposit statutory

provisions; Review and revisions to response to

motion for disbursement; Instructions to M.

Lindsey regarding same; Pzeparation of x~otice

of filing affidavit of V. Davis; Review

correspondence from V. Davis regarding

Preparation. o~corresponde~ce to V.

Davis xegarding same.

06/06/2016 AKA Review file response to Motion for 0.60 bas $300.00

Disbursement and Request for .A.pportianment;



Instructions to Ms. Gonzalez-and NIr. Conley

Re: preparation for hearing.

06/06/2016 CRC Review notice of special appearance. 0.20 hrs $55.00

Total k'ees fox this matter $194,935.00

DISBURSEMENTS

01/08/2016 LXN~RM, LexisNexis; Invoice # 01/0$/2016haj; Lexis-Nexis
$26.55

Research

02/05/2016 LXN.F'RM, LexisNexis; Invoice # 02/09/2016haj; Lexis-Nexis
$9.83

Research

03/16/201.6 LXNFRM, LexisNexis; Invoice # 03/16/2016haj; Leers-Nexis
$4.55

Research

x3/22/2016 CRCI'RM, Chxxs R. Conley; Invoice # 03/22/2016haj; Travel
$9.72

Expense -Mileage to attend heaxing - 3/21/216

04/l.1/2016 LXNFRM, LexisNexis; Invoice # 1603QQ9484; Lexis-Nexis
$19.69

Research ~ Mazch 2016

OS/1Q/2016 L~NFRM, Le~isNexis; Invaic~ # 16040Q9$84; Lexis-Nexis
$8.85

Research - Aprii 2016

06/06/2016 Reproduction Costs
$483.25

Total Disbursements for this matter $562.44

BYLLING SUMMARY
Ardarr~an, A. Kurt

Conley, Christopher Ray

Langley, Daniel W,

Bennett, John F.

King, Lance D

Ayers, Mari F.

Lindsay, Michelle

TOTAL FEES

TOTAL DISSURSEMEN~'S

TOTAL CURIt~NT CHARGES

~ ~b ~ ~o~~~:J

~Zl.~ i~ ~ ~~~:'1.'CI"'A'tlr•.~7 ~ lAUl W'1~~~ .D~

~ ~~ .~~~'11T'S ~'~~J~i~f f ~~ ~~}~~~

~ O.SO hrs✓
~ ..~~Q"~1TS

~~Y

~, ~ $200.00

~ E ̀ i~ ! r~ 
`~~ ~~~w;z~z~v

0.90 hrs✓ $337.50

Y ~~..1.b~:~ hrs
"~~ 4

$~5;8/~
G-C L.iL~,

l~ 'J ̀ $62.44

TOTAL NET CHARGES

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

$194,997.44

$194,997.4

$194,99'1.44

Please remit payment within ten (10} days.

We appreciate youx confidence.



CAWTHRA CONSULTING &APPRAISALS, INC.
Professional Consultants for Commerce and Industry

June 22, 2015

A. Kurt Ardaman, Esq.
Fishback Dominic
1947 Lee Rd.
Winter Park, FL 32789

TIME SHEET
Page 1 of 2

Subject: Invoice Request for Payment of Work Tasks to Date Technical Appraisal Report

Re: Bay Hills Equestrian (Vicki Davis) 3434 W. Kelly Park Rd., Apopka, FL

32712, Parcel No. 197 A, C.

Activities including but not limited to: physical inspection of the facility, coordination with legal

counsel, real estate appraiser and business concern's principal. Field listings of various assets,

descriptions, measurements, and conditions, layout drawings, and photographs plus exhibits.

Development of relocation D&R estimated costs, mathematical calculations. Report writing and

assembly of findings.

Total Request for Payment Work Tasks to Date ......................................... $2,400 (rounded)

(per attached Time Sheet, 16 man-hours X $150 per hour = $2,400)

CERTIFICATION

certify that the preceding charges have been performed and that none of these charges have

been previously reimbursed and that all activities, work tasks, and expenditures comply with the

authorized contract and~~within the contractual scope of services and/or have been

performed by direction fro e client and/or legal counsel.

~~~
Charles E. Cawthra III, ASA
President, Senior Appraiser
EIN# 65-0538821

i 1 i A ~~~t—~5 r e v ~ r 
I' 

Yj' t o ~~

d.~ ,.~.~.~,; i ~~~ ,.~r.w h~.~, ~.a~~.~:~~~~ ~•~ui,~~L.clturf-~~ara~~~;~Elttu~l~i~'_t.4i~ ,..~~,. r. ~>+ri~,a~w~



CAWTHRA CONSULTING &APPRAISALS, INC.
Professional Consultants for Commerce and Industry

TIME SHEET
Page2of2

Property: Technical Valuation Trade Fixtures Report for Bay Hills

Equestrian (Vicki Davis) 3434 W. Kelly Park Rd., Apopka, FL

32712, Parcel No. 197 A, C.

Client: A. Kurt Ardaman, Esq., Fishback Dominic

Day Date Activity Hours

Fri 04/17/15 Inventory review of facility, Reports, Documents, Statements, coordination 6.0
with attorney, business owners/on-site manager. Descriptions and review of

fixtures, equipment, and layout drawing plus photographs.
C.E. Cawthra III, 8:00 AM — 2:00 PM

Tue 05/05/15 Development Technical Relocation Report, asset relocation and installation 4.0
C.E. Cawthra III, 8:00 AM —12:00 PM

Wed 05/06/15 Development Technical Relocation Report, asset relocation and installation 4.0
C.E. Cawthra III, 8:00 AM — 12:00 PM

Wed 06/10/15 Final Report Development of Technical Relocation Report: D&R, relocation 1.0
cost of facility.
C.E. Cawthra III, 9:00 AM — 10:00 PM

04/17/15 Telephone Coordination with owners attorney, real estate appraisers, 1.0

To present business valuation consultants, construction/cost estimator and traffic

engineer. Assembly of all reports, work product papers, data and information

of status of case.

Total Hours Work Tasks to Date 16

(Invoice 16 hours X $150 per hour = $2,400)
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ALLEN H. ANGiIS LLC
General Contractor
LICENSE # CGC 018542

P.O. Box 11104
ORLANDO, FLORIDA 32803

407-894-0917

DATE: August 3, 2015

TO: Kurt Ardaman
Fishback, Dominick, Bennett, Stepter, Ardaman, Ahlers &Bonus
1947 Lee Road
Winter Park, FL 32789

FROM: Allen H. Angus

SUBJECT: Current Take Invoice -Parcel #197 SR 429 - Wekiva Parkway Extension

06/23 .50 Phone consultation with Michelle. Received and reviewed e-mail with
attachment from Michelle.

06/30 .25 Phone consultation with Kurt.
07/03 2.50 Prepared Davis Take RCN update and e-mailed to Michelle, Kurt and

Christopher Conley.
Received and reviewed reply from Michelle.

07/06 .25 Received and reviewed reply from Michelle.
07/27 .50 Received and reviewed e-mail from Michelle. Prepared current invoice & e-

mailed to Michelle &Kurt.
7/31 .25 Received and reviewed e-mail from Michelle.
8/03 .50 Prepared new invoices: Business Damages &Davis Take, & e-mailed to

Michelle &Kurt.
1.00 Settlement assistance after billing.

Total time: 5.75 Hrs. @ $150.00 per Hr. _ $862.50



Calhoun, Dreggors &Associates, Inc.
• Real Estate Appraisers &Consultants •

May 25, 2016

A. Kurt Ardaman, Esq.
Fishback Dominick
1947 Lee Road
Winter Park, FL 32789

RE: Owner: Davis (Kelly Park Crossing)
Project: Wekiva Parkway
Parcel No.: 197
County: Orange

INVOICE

Inspect subject, analysis of contractor's costs, conference with tenant's representative,
analysis of leasehold interest.

Abrams: 12.00 Hrs. x $175/Hr. _ $2,100

Dreggors: 27.50 Hrs. x $275/Hr. = 7,562

Total $9,662

Thank you,

Richard C. Dreggors, GAA
President

RCD/ddp

728 West Smith Street •Orlando, Florida 32804
Tel (407) 835-3395 •Fax (407) 835-3393



OWNER DAVIS (KELLY PARK CROSSING) COURTNEY ABRAMS
PROJECT WEKIVA PARKWAY
PARCELS) 197
COUNTY ORANGE

DATE TYPE OF SERVICE HOURS

12/17/14 REVIEW OF FILE; MEETING WITH RICK TO DISCUSS 1.75
SCOPE OF WORK.

12/18/14 REVIEW OF CONTRACTOR'S COST ANALYSIS FOR 4.50
EQUESTRIAN CENTER IMPROVEMENTS; ANALYSIS
OF DEPRECIATION FOR IMPROVEMENTS.

12/19/14 REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF SUBJECT LEASE AND 2.00
ADDITIONAL MATERIAL.

04/02/15 PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL; CONFERENCE 2.75
CALL WITH TENANTS REPRESENTATIVE AND
FIXTURES APPRAISER; DISCUSS/REVIEW
VALUATION OF CLIENT'S INTEREST.

08/04/15 PREPARE FOR AND CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY 1.00
TO REVIEW VALUATION MATTERS.

TOTAL HOURS 12.00



OWNER DAVIS (KELLY PARK CROSSING) RICHARD C. DREGGORS, GAA
PROJECT WEKIVA PARKWAY
PARCELS) 197
COUNTY ORANGE

DATE TYPE OF SERVICE HOURS

08/29/14 CONFERENCE WITH OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE; 1.25
REVIEW FILE; REVIEW VALUATION ISSUES.

09/27/14 PREPARE FOR SITE INSPECTION; CONFERENCE 1.50
WITH OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE; CONFERENCE
WITH ACCOUNTANT; REVIEW DOCUMENTS.

09/30/14 INSPECT SUBJECT PROPERTY; MEET WITH OWNER; 3.25
REVIEW OPERATIONS OF THE EQUESTRIAN
CENTER.

10/30/14 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH 2.75
TENANT'S REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING CURE
COSTS AND DAMAGES.

12/17/14 MEETING WITH ASSOCIATE TO REVIEW SCOPE OF 0.75
WORK ON THIS ASSIGNMENT.

12/18/14 PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE WITH TENANT'S 3.00
REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING CURE COSTS AND
RELOCATION COSTS.

04/02/15 PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL; REVIEW 2.50
MATERIAL; CONFERENCE CALL WITH OWNER'S
REPRESENTATIVE; CONFERENCE WITH EQUIPMENT
APPRAISER.

04/13/15 CONFERENCE WITH TENANT'S REPRESENTATIVE TO 0.25
REVIEW DEADLINE.

05/26/15 PREPARE FOR AND CONFERENCE WITH OWNER'S 0.75
REPRESENTATIVE REGARDING VALUATION ISSUES
AND OFFER OF JUDGEMENT.

05/27/15 MEETING WITH OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE; 1.50
CONFERENCE WITH OTHER EXPERTS TO REVIEW
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION NEEDED AND
SCOPE/TIMING OF ASSIGNMENT.

06/19/15 ANALYSIS OF LEASEHOLD INTEREST; ASSIST WITH 2.50
RESEARCH; CONFERENCE WITH OWNER'S
REPRESENTATIVE.

06/22/15 ANALYSIS/ASSIST WITH HORSE FARM RESEARCH; 4.75
ANALYSIS OF LEASEHOLD INTEREST; REVIEW WITH
KURT ARDAMAN.



OWNER DAV/S (KELLY PARK CROSSING) RICHARD C. DREGGORS, GAA
PROJECT WEKIVA PARKWAY
PARCELS) 197
COUNTY ORANGE

DATE TYPE OF SERVICE HOURS

08/04/15 CONFERENCE WITH TENANT'S REPRESENTATIVE 0.50
REGARDING VALUE OF THE LEASEHOLD.

03/03/16 REVIEW COURT DOCUMENTS; REVIEW CASES AND 2.25
TEXTS ON VALUATION OF LEASEHOLD INTERESTS;
CONFERENCE WITH KURT ARDAMAN TO REVIEW

TOTAL HOURS 27.50
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Calhoun, Dreggors & Associates, Inc. 
Real Estate Appraisers & Consultants   

 

 

 728 West Smith Street • Orlando, Florida 32804   

 Tel (407) 835-3395  •  Fax (407) 835-3393 

 

 
 
  
 
 
 
 January 13, 2017 
 
 
 
 
Kurt T. Bauerle, Esq.  
c/o Harris Harris Bauerle Ziegler Lopez 
1201 East Robinson Street 
Orlando, FL 32801 
 
RE: Owner: New 
 Project: Wekiva Parkway 
 Parcel No.: 314 
 County: Lake 

 
INVOICE 

 
Review subject property information, exterior inspection of property, land sales 
research/analysis, review nearby land sales, conference with owner’s representative, 
prepare for and meet with owner’s representative to review our analysis. 
 

Abrams Schmidt:  22.50 Hrs. x $175/Hr. = $3,937 

Dreggors:  4.75 Hrs. x $275/Hr. =  1,306   

Total  $5,243 
 

 Thank you, 
 
 

  
Richard C. Dreggors, GAA 
President 
 

 
RCD/ddp



OWNER NEW  COURTNEY ABRAMS SCHMIDT 
PROJECT WEKIVA PARKWAY  
PARCEL(S) 314 
COUNTY LAKE   

 

DATE TYPE OF SERVICE HOURS 

 

 

  

04/07/16 REVIEW FILE; PULL SUBJECT DATA. 1.75 

04/08/16 PRELIMINARY SALES RESEARCH. 2.75 

08/15/16 RESEARCH/ANALYSIS OF SALES. 4.50 

08/18/16 RESEARCH/ANALYSIS OF SALES. 4.00 

08/22/16 SUMMARY ANALYSIS OF COMPARABLES; MEETING 
WITH RICK TO REVIEW SALES AND ANALYSIS. 

2.75 

08/26/16 UPDATED SUMMARY ANALYSIS OF SURROUNDING 
PROPERTY VALUES. 

2.25 

08/29/16 CALL WITH ATTORNEY REGARDING SALES 
INFORMATION. 

0.75 

09/12/16 REVIEW OF CONDEMNOR APPRAISAL; 
RESEARCH/ANALYSIS OF SALES. 

 3.75 

 TOTAL HOURS 22.50 
 



OWNER NEW  RICHARD C. DREGGORS, GAA 
PROJECT WEKIVA PARKWAY  
PARCEL(S) 314 
COUNTY LAKE   

 

DATE TYPE OF SERVICE HOURS 

 

 

  

04/05/16 REVIEW INFORMATION ON THE SUBJECT PARCEL; 
REVIEW NEARBY LAND SALES; CONFERENCE WITH 
OWNER’S REPRESENTATIVE; EXTERIOR 
INSPECTION OF SUBJECT PARCEL. 

2.25 

08/22/16 MEETING WITH ASSOCIATE TO REVIEW OUR 
ANALYSIS. 

1.00 

08/23/16 PREPARE FOR AND MEET WITH OWNER’S 
REPRESENTATIVE TO REVIEW OUR ANALYSIS. 

1.50 

 TOTAL HOURS 4.75 
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RECOMMENDATION

For the above-cited reasons, Right-of-\May counsel respectfully request that the CFX
Right of Way Committee recommend to the CFX Bqard a total settlement, inclusive of
attorney's fees and expert costs, in the amount of $112,7t0, in full settlement of all claims for
compensation for the acquisition of Pa¡cel 330 ODA which is in CFX best interest.

Settlement of the underlying claim, and all fees and costs will eliminate funher risk and
unnecessary expenses that the CFX will ultimately incur with further litigation of the
condemnation action relative to Parcel 330 ODA.

ATTACHMENTS

Exhibit *A" - Franklin Street Invoice
Exhibit'oB" - Settlement Agreement

0RLDOCS 15t012932

üfl
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CENTRAL FLORIDA
EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY

RIGHT OF WAY COMMITTEE MEETING
January 25, 2017

Parcel 330 ODA
Proposed Settlement Agreement 



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Aerial of Property



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Aerial of Property



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Sketch of Property



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Sketch of Property 



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photograph of Ondich Road



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of Property

View of a dirt trail located on the property



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Comparison of Appraisal Reports 

Parcel 330 ODA CFX’s Appraisal
(Carpenter)

Owner’s Appraisal
(Engelmann)

Cost Approach $10,170 --

Income Approach
Monthly Rent
NOI

$18,900
$850

$3,517
10 years

$128,000
$1,448
$8,975

Cap Rate: 7.0%

Sales Comparison Approach -- $140,000

Total for Parcel 330 ODA $13,000 $135,000  



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Owner’s Expert Fees and Costs

Owner’s Experts Amount 
Invoiced

Settlement
Amount

Franklin Street (Martin Englemann) $12,532.85 $10,650.00



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Proposed Settlement

Parcel 330 ODA CFX
(Carpenter)

Owner 
(Engelmann)

Proposed 
Settlement

Compensation to 
the Owner

$13,000 $135,000  $80,000

Statutory 
Attorney’s Fees

-- $22,110 $22,110

Experts -- $12,532 $10,650

Total -- $169,642 $112,760



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Recommendation

Please recommend to the CFX Board approval a
settlement in the amount of $112,760, including
severance damages, business damages, tort damages,
attorney’s fees and costs, and expert fees and costs in full
settlement of all claims for compensation for the
acquisition of Parcel 330 ODA.





CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY

MEMORANDUM

TO: Centra] Florida Expressway Authority Right of Way Committee

FROM: Linda S. Brchmer Lanosa, Deputy General

Suzanne Driscoll, Esq., Shutts& Bowen

DATE: December 27, 2016

RE: Central Florida Expressway Authority v, Da/yl and Laura Alderman, el al.

Case No. 2015-CA-004105-O, Parcel 241

Location: 3252 Ondich Road, unincorporated Orange County, Florida

Total Taking of 20.112 acres

INTRODUCTION

The case was successfully mediated on December 22, 2016, after the disclosure of updated

expert reports, but before a significant amount of pre-trial discovery and other work had been

performed. The parlies have reached a proposed all-inclusive settlement in the amount of

$1,496,175. including interest, statutory attorney's fees, expert fees, and costs as described below.

DESCRIPTION OF PROPERTY AND TAKING

Parcel 241 is a fee simple whole taking consisting of 20.112 acres. Parcel 241 is located

on the south side of Ondich Road just west of Plymouth Sorrento in unincorporated Orange

County, Florida.

Mr. and Mrs, Alderman bought the property in 1998. Mr. Alderman built the 2,572

square foot house on the property in 2004. It had 3 bedrooms and 2 bathrooms. Additional

improvements included 4 storage sheds, a horse feeding stall and burn, a pond and lush landscaping.

They had [bur horses, which were given away because of the taking.

To date, Mr. and Mrs. Alderman received Ihe good faith estimate of value in the amount

of $846,200 plus ti replacement housing purchase additive ("Purchase Additive") in the amount

of $94,000, The Purchase Additive will be recaptured as part of the proposed settlement. The

Alderrrums received some additional relocation benefits for incidental expenses,

CFX'S APPRAISAL REPORT

David Hall, ASA, State-Certified General Appraiser, of Billiard, Hall and Adams, appraised

the property for CFX. lie opined the highest and best use of Parcel 241 is for continued single family
residential use.

4i)74 ORL TOWER RD. ORLANDO, FL32807 | PHOM8: (407) WO-SOW | FAX: (407) 690-5011

WWW.CrXWAV.COM

CFX v. Alderman,

Parcel 241. p. I of 41
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Recently, Mr. Hall updated his appraisal report and increased his estimated land value from

$28,000 per acre to $37,500 per acre or $754,200. Mr. Hall used four (4) improved sales to

determine the value of the improvements, with prices ranging from $105.62 to $111.52 per square

foot. Mr. Hall valued the improvements at $110 per square foot for a total of $283,000. A summary

of Mr. Hall's estimate of value is below.

Land Taken ($37,500 per acre)

Improvements

Total for Owner

$ 754,200

$ 283,000

$1,037,200

MR. AND MRS. ALDERMAN'S APPRAISAL REPORT

Tom Callan, counsel for Mr. and Mrs. Alderman, retained Martin Englemann, MAI, MRICS,

to appraise the property. Mr. Engelmann concluded that the highest and best use of the property

is for future residential development.

Rather than looking for comparable sales in the general area of Parcel 241, Mr.

Engelmann relied upon comparable sales in Winter Garden, Clermont and southeast Orlando.

All of his comparable sales are in superior locations, with superior zoning (PD, PUD, etc.), and

have utilities either onsite or available nearby, unlike Parcel 241. These sales range in sale price

from $74,277 to $111,343 per acre. Mr. Engelmann estimates the land value of Parcel 241 at

$80,000 per acre or $1,610.000. He did not increase his estimate of value of Parcel 241 with the

value of the improvements because the improvements had no long term contributory value.

STATUTORY ATTORNEY'S FEES AND EXPERT FEES

Statutory attorney's fees are based upon the benefit achieved. With an all-inclusive

settlement number, the exact monetary benefit achieved excluding attorney's fees and expert fees

is not known. Nevertheless, assumptions can be made to measure the reasonableness of an all-

inclusive settlement.

Assuming the amount of full compensation to the property owner is $1,306,000, the

monetary benefit achieved is $1,306,000 less the first written offer of $833,300, for a total

monetary benefit of $472,700. Statutory attorney's fees are the sum of 33% of the benefit up to

$250,000 ($250,000 x 33% = $82,500) plus 25% of the benefit over $250,000 but less than $1

million ($222,700 x 25% = $55,675), for a total statutory attorney fee of $138,175. By way of

comparison, the statutory attorney's fee based upon the owners' demand of $1,610,000 would be

based upon a benefit of $776,700, yielding an attorney's fee of $214,175.

Regarding expert fees, Tom Callan on behalf of Mr. and Mrs. Alderman retained 4 experts

and presented invoices totaling $65,124.06. Attached hereto are copies of the invoices, which are

summarized below.



CFXv. Daryl and Laura Alderman, Parcel 241
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Expert

Franklin Street (Martin Englemann)

VHB, Inc.

PSG Construction

Juris Corporation

Orange Legal

Total

Invoice

$31,519.58

21,456.98

7,700.00

4,347.50

100.00

$65,024.06

After reviewing the invoices, the hourly rates, and the services performed, counsel for CFX

determined that a payment of $48,000 for the landowners' expert fees and costs would be a

reasonable amount for settlement purposes.

PROPOSED ALL-INCLUSIVE SETTLEMENT

After considering compensation to the owners, to the owners' lawyers, and to the owners'

experts, the parties reached a proposed all-inclusive settlement in the amount of $1,496,175. A

table comparing the parties' positions with a hypothetical breakdown of the proposed settlement

is below.

Land Value

Statutory Attorney's Fees

Expert Fees and Costs

Additional Sum

Total for Owner

CFX

$1,037,000

Owners'

Demand

$1,610,000

214,175

65,024

$1,889,199

Proposed

Settlement

$1,306,000

138,175

48,000

4,000

$1,496,175

This breakdown of the all-inclusive settlement amount is for the purpose of analyzing the

settlement amount and may not represent the actual allocation.

REQUESTED ACTION

We respectfully request that the Right of Way Committee recommend to the CFX Board

approval of a Mediated Settlement Agreement in the amount of $1,496,175 to settle all pending

claims for the taking of Parcel 241, including full compensation for the property, severance

damages, business damages, tort damages, interest, attorney's fees, attorney's costs, expert fees,

expert costs, and any other claim, subject to apportionment.

cc: Suzanne Driscoll, Esq., Shutts & Bowen
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AERIAL PHOTO

PARCEL 241
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PHOTOGRAPHS OF SUBJECT

PARCEL 241

3. LOOKING SOUTHHAST AT THK RKSIDHNCK

4. LOOKING NORTHKAST AT Till- KKSIDKNCE
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PHOTOGRAPHS OF SUBJECT

PARCEL 241
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PHOTOGRAPHS OF SUBJECT

PARCEL 241
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TN THE CIRCUTT COURT OF THE NINTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
IN AND FOR ORANGE COUNTY, FLORIDA

CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY, CASE NO: ø?/ W. CA . OO+\CIÇ. O
body politic and corporate, and an agency ofthe state
undeithe laws of thå State of Floridá, Subdivision 3q

Petitioner, parcel ¿+l
vs.

Ðtß't L A. Ar-oæwR^J
l-Ã.ttÐN rlrl Lt'/ et. al.

Respondent(s).

MEDIATEp SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (Xt-t- r u cuttsivø)

At the Mediation Conference held on
Respondent(s and
representatives of the
Agreement:

Florida Expressway Authority reached the following Settlement

1. Petitioner will pay to Respondent(s),

(referred to as "Respondent') the sum of
Dollars

exactly ($ in full settlement of all claims for compensation from Petitioner
taking of Parcel including statutory interest and all

claims related to real estate and business damages, severance damages, tort damages, afforney's
fees and litigation costs, expert witness fees, and costs. The settlement sum may be subject to
claims of apportionment by any party in this case having a property interest in or a lien on the
subject property. Petitioner previously deposited in the Registry of the Court Petitioner's good
faith estimate in the amount of

'TuIo

Dol Within thirly days (30) days from the date of receipt by
Petitioner's of a conformed copy of the Stipulated Final w¿!f,oav to
Respondent, by deposit in the Registry of the Court the sum of ç

Dollars

. c,<,

howslnq
2f

exactly representing the difference between the total settlement sum
referenced above the Petitioner's nrevious deoosit'0.È û1fr¡ioo

in this casex ¿LyLd +hz-'rey Lûte tnerlt
p wrthns.e ediì'fî,r-e-

This Settlement Agreement will be placed on the agenda for the Right of Way
("ROW") Committee and Central Florida Expressway Authority (*CFX") Board and is
conditioned upon final approval by the ROV/ Committee and then the CFX Board.

CFX v. Alderman, 
Parcel 241, p. 10 of 41



5. Counsel for Petitioner will submit to the Court a standard Motion for Stþulated
Final Judgment containing the terms and conditions of this Settlement Agreement within fifteen
(15) days from the date of approval of this Settlement Agreement by the CFX Board.

6. This Agreement resolves all claims .whatsoever, including claims of
compensation arising from the taking of Parcel &¿+l , ,ru"ruir"" damages,
business damages, tort damages, interest, attorney's fees, attorney's costs, expert fees, expert
costs, and any other claim.

7. This Settlement Agreement, executed by the parties and their counsel on this

ââ-^' day of}¿(øtbtL ,i0l6,contains all the agreements of the parties.

3. The parties agree to continue the trial of this matter pending review by the CFX
ROW Committee and CFX Board.

4. The parties agree to waive any confidentiality provisions set forth in Chapter 44
of Florida Statutes, the Florida Rules of Civil Procedure, and the Florida Rules of Evidence, if
applicable, for the limited pulpose of consideration of this proposed Settlement Agreement by
the ROW Committee and the CFX Board.

Name: Print
Central Florida Expressway Authority

ame .Jr¡Z-ArY'yr- ¡Yl- iV t<cd I I
Counsel for CFX Owner

Name: Print Name:
Mediator Attorney for

CFX v. Alderman, 
Parcel 241, p. 11 of 41



Alderman Fees and Costs

Client:
Daryl & Laura Alderman
Case:
2015-CA-004105-O
Prepared Date:
12120t2016

Check
Date

9t2312014
9t23t2014
3t26t2015
7t1312015

5t11t2015

Check
Number

9106
9106
9196
9264

9235

CLF
Amount Paid

$ 786.25
$ 277.50
$ 370.00
$ 740.00

$ 100.00

lnvoice
Date

12t21t2016

12t19t2016

12t21t2016

9t912014
9t1912014
3t10t2015
6t30t2015

4t2412015

lnvoice
Number

106

61 838

Alderman0'l

9700
9701
9724
9742

192165

lnvoice
Amount

$ 31,519.58

$ 21,456.98

$ 7,700.00

$ 1,572.50
$ 555.00
$ 740.00
$ 1,480.00

$ 65,024.06

$ 100.00

$ 100.00

$ 65,124.06

Expert

Franklin Street

VHB, lnc.

PSG Construction

Juris Corporation

TOTAL EXPERT COSTS

CLF COSTS
Oranqe Legal

TOTAL CLF COSTS

TOTAL OVERALL COSTS

CFX v. Alderman, 
Parcel 241, p. 12 of 41



INVO¡CE

Description

i$i Franklinstreet

Bill To:

Callan Law Fkm, P.A.

filadtaffion

lnvoice #:

Date created

Client:

Project:

Project #:

Desc¡lption
For Modiation Purposes

gummary of Work Performed

Name

cRW_201 6

GWK 2015

GWK_201 6

JB

JC 2016

JP

JRF 2015

001 06

12/2112016

Callan Law F¡m, P.A.

0l 15279v4-Daryl A. Alderman (Wekiva Parkway)

00220

From:

600 North West Shore Boulevard

Suìte 600

Tampa, Florida 33609

Term:

Date due:

Status:

Total:

Upon Receipt

12/2112016

Outstand¡ng

$31,519.58

Payments $0.00

Balance:

Qty

t.c

1.125

12.208

Rate

$1 35 00

$135.00

$31,519.58

Amount

$202.50

$151.88

$1,648 08

$11.88

$'135.00

0.125 $95.00

u.5

6.25 $s5.00 $593.75

14.75 $185.00 62,728.75

JRF_201 6

MCE 2015 Standard

36.75

3.25

$185.00

$365.00

$61798 75

$1 ,186.25

MCE 2016 Slandard 21 .625 $365.00 $7,893.13

sMP_201 5

sMP_201 6

Subtotal

T,otal Amount Payable

Details of Work Performed

Person Module

Chris Work Session

Worley

10.625 $r 55.oo $1 ,646.88

55.55 $155.00

164.258

$8,610.25

$31,51S,58

$3r,5'19.58

Task

General

time

Date

01/18/2016

Work type

cRW_201 6

Descr¡ption

Work session with Engelmann,

Fabian, and Kane regarding

Qty Rate

0.25 $135.00

Amount

$s3.75
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assignment issues, research

needed, and update from

Engelmann's work session with

clients.

Mad<et Area

Research

General 01/19/2016 CRW 2016

time

Maket area research per

Engelmann cons¡sting of

updale and review of

demographics, home sales, lot

sales, and building permitting.

0.5 $135.00 $67.50

Market Area

Research

General 0112012016 CRW 201 6

time

Market area research per

Engelmann consisting of write

up of market area trends and

analysis.

0.75 $135.00 $101 .25

Peßon Subtotal 1.5 $202.50

George Work Session General 1210712015 GWK_2015

Kane tlme

Work session wíth Engelrnann

regarding new assignment and

dkection and scope of
assignment.

o.125 $135.00 $16.88

Subject Property

Research

General 1210712015 GWK 2015

time

lnÍtíal subject property researoh

and assignment setup;
conespondence with counsel's

office regarding request for
data.

0.25 $135.00 $s3.75

Conespondence General 1210912015 GWK_2015

time

Conespondence with counsels
office regarding r,equest for
data.

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

Conespondencê General 1211012015 GWK_2015

time

Conespondence with counsels

office regarding request for
data.

0.125 $135.00 s1 6,88

Work Session General 12114/2015 GWK 2015
time

Wok session wilh Engelmann
rogading dkection of summary

ot subjeot property and CFX

appraisal for sito ihspection

and cl¡ent worlt session
scheduled for December 15t

2015;wolft sêssion with

Fagliaro regard:ing same.

0.25 $135.00 $33.75

Conespondence General 12t1412015 Gl/K-2015
time

Conespondence with counsefe

office regarding reguest for
data and download appraisals
prepared for 6ËX.

0.125 s135,.00 $16.88

Wod< Session General 1212212015 GWK_20f 5

t¡rne

Woil< session with Black and
Pagliaro rêgardlng

conespondenee with Oallan's

officé consisting of new

information and data dircction

to review and file.

0.125 $135.00 $16^88

Work Session General 0111812016 GWK 2016

time

Wok session w¡th Engelmann,

Fablan, and Worley regarding

assignment issues, resêarch

needed, and update from

Engelmann's wo* session with

clients.

0.25 $135.00 $33.75

Other Expe''t General 02/04/2016 GW<_2016 Review of Paul Gidus, general 0.333 $135.00 $44.96
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Report Review time

Work Session General 0210512016 GWK 2016
iime

Corespondence General 0212612016 GWK_2016
time

contractor, report;

correspondence with Callan's

office regarding same.

Work session with Callan,

Fabian and Pagliaro regarding

case.

Correspondence with Callan's

office regarding tdal orders; file

documents from Callan's office

and calendar trial and other

court mandated dates.

0.5 $13s.00 $67.50

0.25 $135.00 $33.75

Wok Session General 03128/2016 GWK 2016

time

Work session with Engelmann

and Fabian regarding case

status and timelines.

0.1 25 $135.00 $1 6.88

Conespondence General 05/1112016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence with Callan's

office regard¡ng scheduling oî
wok session ; correspondence
with Engelmann and Fabian

regarding same.

0.1 25 $135.00 $1 6.88

Conespondencê General 0511212016 GWK_2016
time

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding scheduling of
woft session; corespondence
with Engelmann and Fabian

regarding same.

0.125 s135.00 $16.88

Conespondence General 05/r912016 GWK_2016
time

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding scheduling of
wok session; conespondence
with Engelmann and Fabian

regarding same.

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

Conespondence General 05116/2016 GW(_2016
time

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding scheduling of
wofk session.

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

Work Session General 05|1712016 GWK 2016

time

Work session with Callan,

Engelmann, and Fabian

regarding update of case,

ma¡4(et area data, timeline for
appraisal and other expeñ due

dates, and court mandated

dates; wod( session
prêparation consisting of

review ot sales to date and

data file.

0.75 tf 35.00 s1 01 .25

Conespondence General A5nA2016 GWK_2016
time

Conespondence General 0610212A16 GWK_2016
time

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding scheduling of
work session ; conespondence

with Callan's office regarding

information prepared from

other experts on adjacent and

nearby takings for the Wekiva

Parkway; review all documsnts
and file.

0.5 $r35.oo $67.50

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding scheduling

work session.

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

$185.63
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time

Conespondence General 0611012016 GWK_201 6

time

Conespondence General 06/1712016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence General 06/2812016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence General 06/30/2016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence General 0711512016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence General 07/2012016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence General 0712112016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence General 08/05/2016 GWK_2016

time

Wo¡kSession General 08/1 1/2016 GWK 2016

Conespondence General 0811512016 GWK_2016

time

Wolk Session General 0812912016 GWK 2016

time

General 0911912016 GWK 2016

time

Shannon, Hall, and Fabian

regarding land planning draft

report, highest and best use,

concuÍency, utilit¡es, etc. ;

coffespondence wíth Callan's

office regarding discovery from

petitioner information ;

download all informalion.

Correspondence with Callan's

offíce regarding our t¡meline of

the Wekiva Parkway project

history.

Conespondence wilh Callan's

office regarding timeline of
Wekiva Parkway and history of

project.

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding pelitioneas

request and inlerrogalories;

review all and file.

Correspondence with Callan's

o{fice regarding documents
received from Central Florida

Expressway authority;
download all data and file.

Conespondence w¡th Callan's

office regarding scheduling

wod< session and

interrogato ries.

Correspondence wilh Callan's

office regarding our work f¡le

and interogatories.

Corespondence with Callan's

office regarding our work f ile

and inleffogalories.

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding other expert's

reports and deadlines.

Work session with Fabian

regarding land sales research

needed and timeline.

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding timeline of

other expert reports.

Work session with Fabian and

Pagliaro regarding status of

case; directlon to Fabian and

Pagliaro on land sales needed

to be researched and verified,

and other expert report

deadlines.

Work sessions with Fabian and

Pagliaro regarding current

status of land sales.

0.125 $135.00 $1 6.88

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

0.25 $135.00 $33.75

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

0.1 25 $135.00 $1 6.88

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

0.1 25 $1 35.00 $1 6.88

o.25 $135.00 $33.75

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

0.25 $135.00 $33.75

0.5 $135.00 $67.s0

time

Work Session
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Conespondence General Ogl27l2O16 GWK_2016

time

Work Session General 10/2612016 GWK 2016

time

Conespondence General 1012812016 GWK_2016
time

Conespondence General 10/31/2016 GWK_2016

time

Correspondence wilh Callan's

office regarding case status

and new timelines.

Work session and

correspondence with

Rathbone regarding planning

report prepared by Hall and

expêrt court mandated

exchange date; begin review

of planning report; work

session wilh Fabian regarding

planning reÉort and appraisal

exchange due date.

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding schêduling of

wok session.

Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding updated tr¡al

datê and expert report

exchange date.

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

0.375 $135.00 $50.63

0.1 25 $135.00 $1 6.88

0.1 25 $135.00 $1 6.88

0.1 25 $135.00 $16.88Conespondence General 1110112016 GWK_2016

time

Conespondence wlth Callan's

office regarding rescheduling

of expert work session.

Work Session General 1 1/03/2016 GWK 201 6 Work session with Fabian,

Callan, Hall and other experts

regarding case; work session

preparalion cons¡sting of

complete review of Hall

planning report and our sales

data to date.

0.75 $135.00 $101.25

0.125 $135.00 $16.88

time

Work Session General 1111612016 GWK 2016

t¡mo

Work session with Engelmann

and Fabian regarding draft

appraisal timeline.

Work Session General 1111812016 GWK 2016

time

Woft session with Callan and
Fabian regarding additional

sales data and mail{et area
rêsearch.

0.25 $13s.00 $33.75

Work Session Generaf 1112212016 GWK 2016

time

Woft session with Fabian

regarding timel¡ne and sales

research.

0.125 $r 35.00 $16.88

Wod< Session General 1112912016 GWK 2016

time

General 1210112016 GWK 2016

time

Work session preparation

consisting of review of draft

appraisal report, review of Hall

planning reporl, and review of
all land sales research to date;

work session w¡th Callan,

Fabian and Pagliaro regarding

draft appraisal and land sales.

Wok sessions with Fabian and

Engelmann regarding land

sales research and verification;

calls to brokers and maket
partic¡pants for verificalion of
land sales.

1 .25 $13s.00 $1 68.75

1 $135.00 $135.00Wod< Session
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Work Session General 1210212016 GWK 2016

time

Work Session General 1211512016 GWK 2016

Work sessions with Callan,

Fabian and Engelmann
regarding sales and draft

appraisal review.

Work session with Cloonen
regarding edits needed to land

sale write ups and research

file.

Person Subtotal 13.333

Wok sessions with Fabian,

Engelmann, and Kane
regarding market data needed

on land sales; begin research

on established and proposed

subdivisions for end unit
pricing, lol sales, and

absoçtion.

Continued research on

established and proposed

subdivisions for end unit
pricing, lot sales, and

absorption.

Complele research on

established and proposed

subdivisions for end unit
pricing, lot sales, and

absorption; work session with

Engelmann on presentat¡on

format and findings.

Persan Subtotal 6.25

0.1 25Work session with Kane and

Pagliaro regarding

conespondence with Callan's

office consisting of new

information and data direction

to review and file.

Work session with Kane,

Worley and Engelmann status

of the case and case direction

Work session with Pagliaro

regarding land sales research

0.75 $135.00 $101.25

0.1 25 $135.00 $1 6.88
time

Jann
Poulos

Market Area

Research

Markel Area

Research

Market Area

Research

Joan Black Work Session

John
Fabian

Work Session

Sales Research

General 't 112312016 JP

time

General 11128/2016 JP

time

General 1112912016 JP

time

General 1212212015 JB

time

General 0111812016 JRF 2015

t¡me

General 0112512016 JRF 201 6

time

4 $95.00

$1,799.96

$380.00

1.5 $95.00 $142.s0

0.75 $95.00 $71.25

$95.00

$59s.75

$11.88

0.25 $185.00 $46.25

0.125 $185.00 $23.13

ExpeÉ Report

Review

Appraisal
Analysis and

Report Writing

Appraisal

Analysis and

Report Writing

Appraisal

Analysis and

General 0210112016 JRF 2015

time

General 8210212016 JRF 2015

t¡me

General 02104/2016 JRF 2015

General 0210512016 JRF 2015

time

Read other experts repons

and set up repo( files.

Begin draft appraisal set up

and wr¡ting; review sub.iect

data.

Continued draft appraisal

setup and writing; review sales

data to dale;work session with

Pagliaro regarding sales dala

research.

Cont¡nue wriling dralt

appraisal.

2.5 $185.00 $462.50

2.25 $185.00 $416.25

time
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Report Writing

Work Session General 02105/2016 JRF 2015

Work Session General 0312812016 JRF 2016

time

Work session with Callan,

Kane and Pagliaro regarding

case.

0.5 $185.00 $92.50

Work session with Kane and 0.125 $185.00 $23.13
Engelmann regarding stalus of

case

Review opposing expert
reporls and prepare maps for

inspection of subject, land

sales to dale, opposing

appraiser land sales and

market data.

0.75 $185.00 $138.75

lime

Subject Property

Research

General 03/30/2016 JRF 2016
time

lnspect¡on General 0313112016 JRF 2016

time

lnspect sub¡ect property and

surrounding market area, land

sales to date, opposing
appraisal land sales, etc.

1 .5 $f 85.00 $277.50

lnitial Filo Set
Up

General 0410112016 JRF 2016

time

Add inspection photographs

and market data Ìo data file.

0.5 $185.00 $92.s0

Conespondence General 051'11/2O16 JRF_2016 Conespondence with

Ëngelmann and Kane
regarding schedul¡ng of work

session.

0.125 $185.00 $23.13
time

Gonespondence General 05112/2016 JRF_2016
l¡me

Conespondence with

Engelmann and Kane

regarding scheduling of work

session.

0.125 $185.00 $23.13

Conespondence General 05/13/2016 JRF_2016
time

Correspondence wilh

Engelmann and Kane

regarding scheduling of wûrk

session.

0.125 $185.00 $23.13

Wok Session General 0511712016 JRF 2016

time

Work session with Callan,

Engelmann, and Fabian

regarding update of case,

market a¡ea data, t¡mel¡ne tor

appraisal and other expert due

dates, and court mandated
dates.

0.5 $185.00 $92.s0

Work Session General 06/06/2016 JRF 2016 Work session w¡th Callan,

Kane and Collins regarding

status of land planning report

0.75 $185.00 $138.75
time

Work Session General 0811112016 JRF 2016

time

Work session with Kane

regarding land sales research

needed and limeline.

0.25 $185.00 $46.25

Work Session General 08/2912A16 JRF 2016

time

Work session with Kane and

Pagliaro regarding slatus of

case; direction from Kane on

Iand sales needed to be

researched and veríf¡ed, ând

other expert report deadlines.

a.25 $185.00 $46.25

General 09/1912016 JRF 2016
time

Work sessions with Kane and
Pagliaro regarding cunent

status of land sales.

0.5 $185.00 $92.50Work Session
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Appraísal

Analysis and

Report Writing

General A512312016 JRF 2016

time

Review previous draft report.

Read Anderson deposition.
Work session with Katie

Shannon regarding land
planning. Make revisions to

draft based on new data.

Work session with Kane

regarding planning report and

appraisal exchange due date.

2.75 $185.00 $508.75

0.125 $185.00 $23.1 3Work Session General 1012612016 JRF 2016

Work Session General 1 1/03/2016 JRF 2016

lime

Wok session with Kane,

Callan, Hall and other experts

regarding case.

0.5 $185.00 $92.50

time

Appraisal

Analysis and

Report Wr¡ting

General 1111612016 JRF 2016

time

Review planning report and

opposing reports; review

market area data and update

draft appraisal; work session

with Kane and Engelmann

regarding draft and timeline.

4.75 $185.00 $878.75

Appraisal
Analysis and

Report Writing

General 1111712816 JRF 2016

time

Continue revising draft

appraisal; add¡tional land sales

search and analysis.

2.5 $185.00 $462.50

Appraisal

Analysis and
Report Writing

General 11118/2016 JRF 2016

time

Further analysis of researched

land sales. Woû session with

Callan and Kane. Additional

highest and best use analysis.

2.5 $185.00 $462.50

Work Session General 11/21/2016 JRF 20.16

time

Wotk session with Pagliaro

regarding research of

additional residential sales and

data from Callan.

0.5 $185.00 $S2.SO

Work Session General 1'l12212016 JRF 2016

time

Work session with Kane

regarding timeline for delivery

of appraisal and additional

land sales research.

0.125 $185.00 $23. t3

Work Session General 1112312016 JRF 20,l6

time

Work sessions wilh Poulos,

Engelmann, and Kane

regarding market data needed

on land sales.

0.25 $185.00 $46.25

Appraisal
Analysis and

Repo¡.t Wr¡ting

General 1112912016 JRF 2016

time

Continue sales analysis and

prepare land adiustment gdd in

report.

1.25 $185.00 $231.25

Wod< Session General 11129/2016 JRF 2016

time

Work session with Kane,

Pagliaro and Callan regarding

stalus of the case and land

sales considered; review all

land sales with Pagliaro prior

to work session wilh Callan.

1 .25 $185.00 $231.25

Appraisal

Analysis and
Repon Writing

General 11/3012016 JRF 2016

time

General 1210112016 JRF 2016

time

Continue land sales sales

analysis section. Compleie

adjustment grid and bracketing

table. Work session with

Pagliaro regarding various

sales.

3.5 $185.00 $647.50

Work sessions with Callan and

Pamela Rathbone regarding
$555.00
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Appraisal

Analysis and

Repoñ Writing

Preparation

Work Session General 12JA212016 JRF 2016

time

Work Session General 1212012016 JRF 2016

time

Mediation

General 12101/2016 JRF 2016

time

General 1212112016 JRF 2016
time

case strategy. Additional

review of Hall report. Work

sess¡on with Engelmann and

Kane regarding land sales

research and verif ication.

Final edits to and review of

draft.

Work sessions with

Engelmann, Kane and Callan

regarding final edits to report.

Add additional sale and revise

report. Make edits to report

and prepare for delivery

Pre Mediation work session

with Callan, the Alderman's,

and Engelmann; work sessions

with Engelmann priorto and

after pre mediation work

session.

Mediation preparation

consisting of conespondence
with Callan's office, direction to

Pagliaro on aerials of our

comparable land sales

requested by Callan; review

aerials of comparable land

sales prior to sending to

Callan.

Person Subtotal 51.5

Work session with Kane

regarding edits needed to land

sale write ups and research

file; edits to land sales per

Kane.

Multiple work sessions with

Callan and his legal ass¡stant

regarding lerms of

engagemenl, houdy rate

schedule, and retention letter

2 $1 85.00 $370.00

4.25 $185.00 $786.25

1 .5 $185.00 $277.50

0.375 $185.00 $69.38

$9,527.50

$47.50Justin

Cloonen

Martin

Engelmann

Work Session General 121A212016 JC_2016

timê

Conespondence General 12104/2O15 MCE_2016_Standard

time

Work Session

Conespondence General 12/Ogl2O15

time

Work Session General 121'15/2015

time

Conespondence General 12115/2015

time

Work session with Kane

regarding new assignment and

direction and scope of

ass¡gnmenl.

MCE*2015_Standard Correspondencewilh

Counsel's ass¡stant regarding

meeting time and my

availab¡l¡tY.

MCE_201 5_Standard Work session with Callan,

property owner and expens;
initial subject property

inspection along with market

alea.

MCE_201 5_Standard Correspondence with

Counsel's assistant regarding

0.5 $95.00

0.25 $s65.00 $91.25

0.125 $365.00 $45.63

0. r 25 $s65.00 $4s.63

2.5 $365.00 $912.50

General 12/0712015 MCE 20'15 Standard

time

$136.88
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data for review file receive and

review Construct¡on Plans for
intersystem system.

Conespondence General 1211612015

time

MCE_2015_Standard Correspondence with Joshua
Harris, Engineer.

0.125 $365.00 $45.63

Work Session General 0111812016

time

MCE_20 1G_Standard Work session with Kane,

Worley and Fabian.

0.2s $365.00 $e1.25

Conespondence General 0210112016

t¡me

MCE_2016_Standard Conespondence with

Counsel's legal assistant
regarding case.

0.125 $365.00 $45.63

Conespondence General O2lO5l2O16

time

MCE_201 6_Slandard Conespondence with Callan's

office regarding progress of
developmenl near subject
property; review renderin g

regarding SR 429 ramps
(progress status shot) from

Robert Scott.

0.125 $365.00 $45,63

Conespondence Gêneral 0212612016

time

MCE_201 6_Standard Correspondence with Callan's

office regarding trial orders,

schêduling work session with

Callan regarding trial orders,

and review of order.

0.5 $365.00 $182.50

lnspeclion General 03/2412016
time

MCE_201 6_Standa¡d lnspection of subject property,

maket area and preliminary

comparable sales.

1 $365.00 $365.00

Work Session General 0312812016

time

MCE_2016_Standard Work session with Kane and

Fabian regarding case status

and timelines.

0.125 $365.00 $45.63

Conespondence General 0511112016 MCE_201o_Standard Correspondence with Kane

time and Fabian regarding

scheduling of work session.

0.125 $365.00 $45.63

Conespondence General 0511212016

time

MCE_2016_Standard Conespondence with Kane

and Fabian regarding

scheduling of work session.

0.'r 2s $365.00 $4s.63

Conespondence General 05/13/2016

time

MCE_2016_Standard Correspondence with Kane

and Fabian regarding

scheduling of work session.

0.125 $365.00 $45.63

Work Session General 0511712016

time

MCE_201 6_Standard Work session with Counsel,

Kane and Fabian regarding

case status and court
mandated dates.

0.5 $365.00 $182.50

Conespondence General

time

05/1 8/201 6 MCE_201 6-Standard Conespondence with

Counsel's office regard¡ng

other expert and C¡ty of

Apopka employee's

depositions and other expert
reports on adjacent propefties

with takings.

0.375 $365.00 $136.88

Conespondence General 05120/2016
time

Correspondenco with

Counsel's office regarding

Dreggors and Hall's reports

regarding lhe Halcher case

Casual look through said

0.5 $365.00 $182.50MCE_20'1 6_Standard

Page 10 of 14

CFX v. Alderman, 
Parcel 241, p. 22 of 41



reports.

Conespondence General 06128/2A16

time

MCE_201 6_Standard Receive Petitioner's

lnterrogatories to responses
0.25 $365.00 $91.25

Conespondence General 06/30/20'16

time

MCE_201 6_Standard Receive various documents via

Dropbox from Counsel

including Drainage Plans,

Appraisal reports, and

Geotechnical Reports.

0.25 $365.00 $91.25

Conespondence General 0710612A16

time

MCE_2016_Standard Conespondencewith Counsel

legal assistant.

0.125 $365,00 $45.63

lnspection of

Comparables

General 09/18/2016
time

MCE_201ô_SÌandard Conduct inspection of land

comparables being considered
in draft appraisal.

2 $365.00 $73o.oo

Conespondence General 1012912016 MCE_2016_Standard Correspondence with Counsel

time and expens regarding

upcoming work session.

û.25 $365.00 $91.25

Work Session General 1111612016

time

MCE 2016_Standard Work session with Kane and

Fabian regarding draft
appraisal timeline.

0j25 $365.00 $4s.63

Work Session General 1112312016

time

MCE_20.1 6_Standard Work sessions with Poulos,

Engelmann, and Kane
regarding ma*et data needed

on land sales.

0.25 $365.00 $91.25

MarkeÌ Area

Research

General 11129/2016

time

MCE 2016 Standard Work session w¡th Poulos on

presentation format and

findings; review market data
and land sales.

0.5 $365.00 $182.s0

Work Session General 1113O12O16

time

MCE_2016_Standard Work sessions wilh Fabian and
Kane regarding coordinating

review and production

schedule.

0.5 $365.00 $182.50

Expert Report General 1210112016 MCE_201G_Standard Read PSG Construction

Review time repo¡ts

I $365.00 $365.00

lnternal

Appraisal
Review

General 12/0112016

time

MCE 2016 Standard Start review of draft appraisal;
multiple wotk sessions with

Fabian regarding draft and
related edits/comments.

3 $365.00 $1,095.00

Conespondence General 12/02/2016

time

MCE 2016 Standard Various conespondences w¡th

Counsel and their staff
regarding Petil¡onefs Expert

Wtness Disclosure list,

acquis¡tions map, photos

relating to the subject property

pre-take, and Oak Ridge land

assemblage.

I $365.00 $365.00

lnternal

Appraisal

Review

General 1210212A16

time

Complete review of draft

appraisal report; work session

with Callan; work sessions with

Fabian, Kane and Black

regarding sales research &
vedfication and transmittal of
report per Court exchange

date.

6 $365.00 $2,190.00MCE_20 1 6_Standard

Page11 of14
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Rebutial General 1210512016

t¡me

MCE 2016 Standard Correspondence with Counsel

regarding rebultal work

needed in concert with their
receipt of expert reports; they

are trying to coordinate

schedul¡ng a meeting

0.375 $365.00 $136.88

Deposition

Preparation
General 1210512816

time

MCE_2016_Standard Conespondence with

Counsel's legal assistant

regarding scheduling

depositions.

0.375 $365.00 $136.88

Work Session General 12120/2016

time

MCE_201 6_Standard Pre Mediation wolk session

with Tom Callan, Attomey,

Pamela, Mr. and Mrs.

Alderman, and John Fabian;

work session with John Fabian.

1.5 $365.00 $547.50

Person Subtotal 24.875 $9,079.38

Stephen
Pagliaro

Subject Property

Research

General 1211412A15 SMP 2015

t¡me

Subiect property research ;

download data from Callan;

wok sess¡on with Engelmann

and Kane regarding çase, time

frames and research needed.

4.5 $155.00 $697.50

Other Expert
Report Review

General 1211512015 SMP 2015

time

Edits to the mapping file;

review of CF)lHall report; work

session with Engelmann

regarding his meet¡ng with the

client and subiect inspection;

¡nstruct¡on on sales research

and studios needed and on a
follow up reinspection of tho

sub¡ect

2.25 $155.00 $348.75

Sales Research General 1211612015 SMP 2015

time

CoStar land sales rèsearch,

verification and rev¡ew in-

house sales datä.

3.7s $155.00 $58r.25

Wodt Session General 1212212015 SMP_2015

time

Work session with Black and
Kane regarding

co¡respondonce with Gallan's

office consisting of new
lnformalion and d,ata dhection

to review and file.

0.1 25 $155.00 $19.38

Sales Research General 01/05/2016 SMP_2016 Land sales research, mapping,

deed plotting, and write ups.

3.5 $155.00 $542,50
tims

Sales Research General 0111112016 SMP 2016

time

Land sales research, mapping,

deed plotting, and wite ups.

2.5 $155.00 $387.50

Sales Research General 01114120'16 SMP 2016

time

Land sales research, mapping,

deed plotting, and lv.dte ups.

2.5 $155.00 $387.50

Sales Research General A1h6l2}1ø SMP_2016
t¡me

Land sales research, mapping,

deed plotting, and write ups;

edits to land sale wrlte ups.

2.5 $155.00 $387.s0

Sales Research General 01125/2016 SMP 2016

time

Work session with John Fabian

regarding land sales research.

Edits to land sales database
information

2.5 $155.00 $387.50

Sales Research General 0210312816 SMP 2016 Land sales research and edits 'r .5 $155.00 $232.50

Page 12 of 14
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- Write Up time

Ganeral OZl04l2O18 SMP 2016

time

to the data base ¡nformation

Wok session with Fabian

regarding land sale research

0.25 $155.00 $38.75Work Session

Work Session General 0210512016 SMP 2016

t¡me

Work session with Callan,

Kane and Fabian regarding

case.

0.5 $155.00 $77.50

Executive

Summary

General 0211012016 SMP 2016
time

Draft Excutive Summary of

subject data and of the
CFX/Hall appraisal report of

the subject for the file

4.125 $1s5.00 $639.38

lnspêction General 07103/2016 SMP 2016 lnspection of the subject and 0.5 $155.00 $77.50
maÍket areatime

Work Session General 0812912016 SMP 2016

time

Wok sessions with Fabian and
Kane regarding status of case;

direction from Kane on land

sales needed to be
researched and verified, and
other expert report deadlines.

0.25 $155.00 $38.7s

2.5 $155.00 $387.s0Sales Research General 0S/10/2016 SMP 2016

time

Land sales research

Sales Research General 0911112016 SMP_2016
t¡me

Land sales research; map

considered land aales and

oopy to daia files

s.5 $155.00 $542.50

Wod< Session General 09/19/2016 SMP 20f 6 Work sessions with Kane and
Fabian regarding cunent

status of land sales.

0.5 $155.00 $77.50
time

Sales Research General 09120nü6 SMP 2016

time

Review additional land sales
for consideration

1.25 $155.00 $193.75

Sales Research General 0912112016 SMP 2Of 6

t¡ms

Land salos research 0.75 $155.00 $1 16.25

Sales Research General Agl?2ng16 SMP 2016
- Write Up time

Land Sales Flesearch and

ed¡ts to data base

3.625 $155.00 s561.88

Sales Research

-Wdto Up

General 09/23i2016 SMP 2016
tirne

Land Sales Research and
êdits to dâta bass

3.75 S155.00 $581.25

Safes Research

-Write Up

General 09/26/.2016 SMP_2016
tfme

Land Sales Research and

ed¡ts to data bãse

?.75 $155.00 $426.25

Salès Flesearch General 111211201ø SMP 2016
time

Sales research of the Avalon

Propedles to Lennar land

sales along the west side of
Avalon Road

2.25 S155.00 $348.75

Wod< Session General 1112112016 SMP 20T6
time

Wod< session with Fabian

regarding land sales research

to data and review of data
from Callan.

0.5 $155.00 $77.50

Sales Research General 1'112212016 SMP 2016

time

Land sales research 3.25 $15s.00 $503.75

Sales Research General 11123nA16 SMP 2016

time

Land sales research 3.25 $15s.00 $503.75

Sales Research General 1112612016 SMP 2016 Land sales research 2.25 $155.00 $348.75
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timê

Sales Research Genêral 1112712016 SMP 2016 Land sales research 2.25 $155.00 $348.75
tíme

Work Session General 11'12912016 SMP:2016
timø

Wod< sessiona wlth Oallan,

Fabian and Kane, regarding

slatus of case and land'salos

research considered.

0.675 $155.00 $1 04.63

Safes ResEarch GEneral trI129nA16 SMP-¿016 Land sales research 0.75 $1 55.00 $1 16.25

tirns

Work SessiÒn' General f 1/90/2016 $MP*201,6
tirné

Work gession with Fabian

regardln g vario us sales,

0.125 $1 55.00 $1 9.38

MarketArea
Fìosearch

Generat'l"2rcaÆú6 SMP*?O16
time

Rosearch into the estirnated

complbtion date$ for the

rernaining segmenls of the
padilelr

0.s $155,00 $77.50

$MP'Ja0'rC MedlatÍon preparutlon

conslst¡nS of wotßEos6loxr wfth

Fabìan and direoiJorÌ oa aedals
needed of ouloornparable

{an<f safoo ã,s G,qu6sfêd blf
obfaú¡g of ücoç, p roþ.er,ô

0.S S1SS.00 977.50

aqdalÈ

Fa¡son9ub:tatal 66.T75 s10,257.1 3

Please reference our File No. to ensure proper credit

Payment for services due upon receipt of invoice.

Alter 30 days a charge oÍ 1.5/" pêr month will be assessed on the unpaid balance.

Page 14 of 14

CFX v. Alderman, 
Parcel 241, p. 26 of 41



lnvoice
Please remit to:
Vânasse Hangen Brustlln, lnc.
lOl Walnut Street, PO Box 9151

617.924.1770 F 617.924.2286
Watertown, MA 02471

Mr. Thomas P. Callan
Thomas P. Callan, P.A.

921 Bradshaw Terrace
Orlando, FL 32806

lnvoice No: <Draft>
December 19,2016
VHB Project No: 61838.00

Total

Professional Planning Services for Daryl & Laura Alderman Eminent Domain
Professional Services Thru December 17. 2016
Professional Personnel

Principal 1

Technical/Professional 1 0
Technical/Professional 06
Technical/Professional 05
Technical/Support 5

Totals
Total Labor

Hours
23.00
13.00
31.50
74.00

1.00
142.50

Rate
250.00
125.00
125.00
125.00
95.00

Total
20,657.50

799.48
21,456.98

Amount
5,750.00
1,625.00
3,937.50
9,250.00

95.00
20,657.50

799.48
799.48

20,657.50

799.48

Reimbursable Expenses
Printing

Total Reimbursables

Totalthis lnvoice $21,456.98

Billings to Date

Labor
Expense
Totals

Current
20,657.50

799.48
21,456.98

Prior
0.00
0.00
0.00

CFX v. Alderman, 
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period:201507

Total

6t1012015

6t10t2015

6t1112015

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

BAIV Laser Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$2.05

$42.61

$55.39

Sroo.ôs

Page: I of I

Project:ó1 838.00

Printed on: 1211912016 11:25:16 AM
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3\ Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period: 201513

Total

12t8t2015

12t912015

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$4s.80

$30.89

$76.69

Page: 1 of 'l

Project:6 I 838.00

Printed on: 1211912016 11:26:06 AM
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period:201601

Total

'1211812015

12t15t20',t5

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

BAIV Laser Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$1.03

$68.17

$69.20

Page: I of 1

Project:61 838.00

Printed on: 1211912016 1l:26:43 AM
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Locat¡on Job Type User

Period: 201606

Total

5120t2016

5t20t2Ù',t6

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$1.54

$53.25

ss¿.2ô

B/VV Laser Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Page: I of I

Project:61 838.00

Printed on: 12/1912016'l 1:27 :55 AM
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period: 201607

Total

61912016

6t17t2016

612112016

6t17t2016

6t21t2016

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

B/\lV Laser Printing

BÂlV Laser Printing

B/VV Laser Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$7.29

$0.26

$0.26

$1s.98

$75.62
- 

éòs.ar

Page: 1 of 1

Project:61 838.00

Printed on: 1211912016 11:28:.40 AM
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period: 201608

Total

7t2012016

7t21t2016

7t2012016

7t21t2016

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

BAIV Laser Printing

B/VV Laser Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$4.0r

$0.39

$25.56

$22.37

s52.93

Page: I of 1

Project:61 838.00

Printed on: 1211912016 11:29:17 AM

CFX v. Alderman, 
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period:201610

Total

9t15t2016 Orlando FL Sm Fmt Color Printing katieshannon

Total

$54.32

sì¿.Ci

Page: I of I

Project:61 838.00

Pdntêd on: '1211912016 11:35:16 AM

CFX v. Alderman, 
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period:201611

Total

9t21t2016

1011012016

10t12t2016

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Orlando FL

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

Sm Fmt Color Printing

katieshannon

katieshannon

katieshannon

Total

$42.60

$96.93

$1.07

$140.60

Page: 'l of 1

Project:61 838.00

Printed on: 1211912016 I 1:35:54 AM

CFX v. Alderman, 
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3' Archimedia Solutions Group - VHB Billing Backup Report
125 Liberty Street #301

Danvers, MA 01923

Project Number: 61838.00

Date Location Job Type User

Period:201612

Total

11t312016 Orlando FL Sm Fmt Color Printing katieshannon

Total

$78.81

fià.ór

Page: 1 of 1

Project:6 I 838.00

Pr¡ntêd on: 121191201611:36:28 AM

CFX v. Alderman, 
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PSG
CONSTRUCTION INVOIGE

1 2t2 1 t16 Alderman AIdermanOl

NNlõr¡:farlffa E¡FT'Irt-I¡Í¡'Tùr-lE lfñIllÒlfaGñû'lilEEfi¡

Callan Law Firm
921 Bradshaw Terrace
Orlando, FL 32806

3252 Ondich Road
Apopka, FL 32712

sr.lt-ftc FiL!r{-lrar-[ff.Tñ

2t27t15
3t2t15
3tzt15
3t3t15
3t4t15
3t5t15
4t1 t15
4t6t15
4t7 t15
4tgt15
4t9t15
6t2t15
6t7 t15
7 t2t15

7 t10t15
7 t13t15
7t1515

7 t29t15
8t5t15

12t1t15
12t14t15
12t15t15
12t16t15

Call from Tom Callan
Email from Stephane/set up file
Email from Scott/ return Email
Emails to and from Scott
Site visit/Email
Estimate
Meeting with Tom
Estimate
Estimate
Estimate
Estimate
Call from Tom
Estimate
Emails to Tom
Calls/email to Tom
Meeting with Tom
Estimate
Estimate
Estimate
Emails
Emails to Stephanie
Review/ office meeting
Emails
Total

.50

.25

.25
2.75
1.25

.5
3.00
4.00
4.00

3.5
.25
2.5

.5
1

1

2.5
1.5

4.75
.5
.5
3

.25
38.5

25

$200.00

$7,700.00

EtrTf'IINtr

lf.IlAltAlrvlfrlllNll¡lllill¡lFllNN{.]tall

PLEASE MAKE PAYMENT TO:
PSG CONSTRUCTION

THANK YOU

P. O. Box 3386 . Winter Park, Florida 32790 . Telephone (407)628-9660

CFX v. Alderman, 
Parcel 241, p. 37 of 41
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Juris Corporation
255 South Orange Arænue
Suite 101
Orlando, FL 32801

407€48-0405 lnvcicç #: 9700
f n'"rojÇe llate: 9/9120'14

Thomas P, Callan, P.A.
921 BradshawTernace
Orlando, FL 32806

Case: Alderman Property
Attn: Melanie

For phob/video shoot on Sept 5, 2014 portal to portãl and stabillzatlon,
import and exportfor DVD

Plcasc m¡kc chccks payablc to: Juris Corporation.

lnvoices arç due and payable when rcndered. Invoices
not paid within 30 days ofthe invoicc dato are past duç
and will be æsessed a finance charge of l.5olo pcr month.

Federal ID Numbe¡: 59¿813 I 63

Ê,5

Total

Paymentsl0redits

Balan+e Dur*

185.00 1,572.50

$1,572.50

$0.00

$1,572.50

CFX v. Alderman, 
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'.'....1:llr...''

Juris Gorporation
255 South OrangeAvenue
Sufte l0l
Orlando, FL 32801

407€48.0405 fnvoice #: 9701
lnvoic+ $nte: 9/19/2014

Thomas P, Callan, P.A.
921 BradshawTenace
Orlando, FL 32806

Case: Alderrnan Property
Attn: Ms. Melanie Rlchmond

R. $cott - Build multimedie presentation from September Sth, 2014
phototuideo shoot.

Please make checks pay¿ble to: Juris Coryoration.

Invoices are duc utd payable when rcndered. lnvoices
not paid within 30 days of the invoice date nrc past due
and wlll be æsessed r ffnurce charge of l.5olo per month.

Fcderal ID Numben 59-2E13 163

Tstal

Payme nt*/Crçdits

Balançe flr¡e

185.00 555.00

$555.00

$0.00

s555,00

CFX v. Alderman, 
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Juris Gorporation
255 South Orange Avenue
Suite 101
Orlando, FL 32801

407€48-0405 lnvoice #: 9724
lnvoice Ðate: 3110i2015

Thomas P. Callan, P.A.
921 BradshawTenace
Orlando, FL 32806

Fmrnt!

EtlitlttmlîEF !flirr?ri! ffi

Case: Alderman
Attn: Melanie Richmond

For exterior photographs and aerial drone videos of the above property
on 03/04/15, includlng portalto portal, download and editing.

Robert Scott

Please makc checks payable to: Juris Corporation.

Invoices are due and payablo when rendered. Invoices
not paid within 30 days ofthe invoice dat€ ar€ past due

and will be assessed a finance charge of L57o per month.

Federal ID Number: 59-28131ó3

4

Total

Payments/Credits

Ealance Due

185.00 740.00

$740.00

$0.00

$740.00

CFX v. Alderman, 
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Thomæ P. Callan, P,A"
921 BradsharTen¡ce
Orl¡ndo¡ FL 32806

Juris Corporatþn
255 South Orango Atonue
Suiþ 101
Orlando, FL 32801

407€48-m05
t9fii

trtv*:lcë #: 9742
lnv*i*e *ate: 6/30/20f 5

EÍIIE

EEMIIIXEE Rlllilvrilffi

Cara: Alderman
Atûr: Torn Celhn, E¡q., Stcphenie Tate and Ùlelanþ Rftfimond

R. Scott, PKtðct Manqementand tt¡tftorþnbtion þr 3D anlmetþn
and Clþnt mcctittg wih þam

Plæse mrko chcchs payablc to: Juris Corportion.

lnvoictsæ dr¡o rnd peyrblc when rcndcr€d. Invoiccs
aot paid wilhin 30 days oftùc invoicc dato are pr* duc
a¡rd wl[ be rsscssðd a ñnurce ohrgs of t.5% per month

Fodcr¡l ID Numbe¡: 59-2813 163

Tofsi

Fayr*en**J* rs*f $t*

Balance Due

185.00 1,480.00

$1,¡f80.00

$0.00

s1,¿t80.00

CFX v. Alderman, 
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CENTRAL FLORIDA
EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY

RIGHT OF WAY COMMITTEE MEETING
January 25, 2017

Parcel 241
Proposed Mediated Settlement



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Aerial of Property



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Sketch of Property



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Sketch of Property 



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Sketch of Property 



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of Ondich Road

Looking South at the Access Road from 
Ondich Road

Looking East at the Frontage Along Ondich Road



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of the Property

Looking Northeast at the ResidenceLooking Southeast at the Residence



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of the Property

Interior ViewInterior View



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of the Property

Looking West at the PoolInterior View



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of the Property

Looking Northwest at a ShedLooking Northwest at the large Shed



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of the Property

Looking South at the Zip LineLooking Northeast at some of the Sheds



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Photographs of the Property

Looking West at the Sheds and Horse 
Feeding Stable

Looking South at the Corral



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Comparison of Appraisal Reports 

Parcel 241 CFX’s Appraisal
(Hall)

Owners’ Appraisal
(Englemann)

Land Taken $754,200
($37,500/acre)

$1,610,000
($80,000/acre)

Improvements $283,000 $0

Total for Parcel 241 $1,037,200 $1,610,000



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Owners’ Expert Fees and Costs

Owners’ Experts Amount 
Invoiced

Franklin Street (Martin Englemann) $31,519.58

VHB, Inc. 21,456.98

PSG Construction 7,700.00

Juris Corporation 4,347.50

Orange Legal 100.00

TOTAL $65,024.06



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Proposed Settlement

Parcel 241 CFX Owners’ 
Demand

Proposed 
Settlement

Land Value $1,037,000 $1,610,000 $1,306,000

Statutory 
Attorney’s Fees

-- $   214,175 $   138,175

Experts -- $   65,024 $    48,000

Additional Sum -- --- $      4,000

Total for Owner -- $1,889,199 $1,496,175*

*The $94,000 RHP will 
be recaptured.



CENTRAL FLORIDA EXPRESSWAY AUTHORITY 

Recommendation

Please recommend to the CFX Board approval of the
Mediated Settlement Agreement for Parcel 241 in the
amount of $1,496,175, including full compensation for
severance damages, business damages, tort damages,
interest, attorney’s fees, attorney’s costs, expert fees,
expert costs, and any other claim, subject to
apportionment.
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